

Bidders		Anderson Fire & Safety				Dana Safety Supply				FireLine, Inc.				Kenco Fire Equipment				Newton Fire & Safety				Safe Industries				Wally's Fire & Safety Equipment						
Address		Anderson, SC				Columbia, SC				Winder, GA				Springfield, MO				Sweptonville, NC				Easley, SC				Mullins, SC						
35	4	1 1/2" FEMALE NH TO 1" MALE NPSH	KOCHEK	37R1NH1NP SH			\$15.00	\$60.00	C & S SUPPLY	AD15NP1N P	\$20.00	\$80.00			\$16.00	\$64.00	ACTION		\$14.22	\$56.88			\$15.00	\$60.00	REDHEAD		\$27.90	\$111.60				
36	4	1" MALE NH TO 1" MALE NPSH	KOCHEK	36R1NH1NP SH			\$15.00	\$60.00	C & S SUPPLY	AD1NH1NP	\$13.00	\$52.00			\$13.00	\$52.00	ACTION		\$15.70	\$62.80			\$12.80	\$48.00	REDHEAD		\$43.26	\$173.04				
37	4	1" MALE NH TO 1" FEMALE NPSH	KOCHEK	37R1NPSH1 NH			\$15.00	\$60.00	C & S SUPPLY	AD1NH1	\$13.00	\$52.00			\$13.00	\$52.00	ACTION		\$13.40	\$53.60			\$12.20	\$48.80	REDHEAD		\$25.98	\$103.92				
38	4	1" MALE NPSH TO 1" FEMALE NH	KOCHEK	37R1NH1NP SH			\$15.00	\$60.00	C & S SUPPLY	AD1NH1	\$13.00	\$52.00			\$13.00	\$52.00	ACTION		\$13.75	\$55.00			\$12.80	\$51.20	REDHEAD		\$25.98	\$103.92				
39	4	1" DOUBLE MALE NPSH	KOCHEK	36R1NPSH1 NPSH			\$15.00	\$60.00	C & S SUPPLY	ADMM1NP1 NP	\$15.00	\$60.00			\$13.00	\$52.00	ACTION		\$15.70	\$62.80			\$12.80	\$48.00	REDHEAD		\$43.26	\$173.04				
40	4	1" DOUBLE FEMALE NPSH	KOCHEK	37R1NPSH1 NPSH			\$15.00	\$60.00	NO BID					35R1NPSH 1 NPSH	\$16.00	\$64.00	ACTION		\$21.95	\$87.80			\$12.20	\$48.80	REDHEAD		\$35.04	\$140.16				
41	1	2 1/2" GATED WYE TO 1 1/2" NH	AKRON	2581			\$315.00	\$315.00	C & S SUPPLY	WV2515	\$211.00	\$211.00	ELKHART	B-100-A	\$247.00	\$247.00	C & S SUPPLY	WV2515	\$211.00	\$211.00			\$306.54	\$306.54	TFT	AYNJ-NF	\$273.13	\$273.13				
42	1	CLAMPERED SIAMESE 2 FEMALE 2.5" X 1 MALE 2.5"	AKRON/KOCHEK		1262 AKRON	\$800.00	\$800.00	NO BID					HARRINGTON	H220-25-25	\$218.00	\$218.00	HARRINGTON	H220-25NHFS	\$227.00	\$227.00	AKRON	1262	\$775.71	\$775.71	AKRON	1262	\$695.00	\$695.00	HARRINGTON	HN-220-25NHM	\$227.00	\$227.00
43	2	CLAMPERED SIAMESE 2 FEMALE 2.5" X 1 MALE STORZ 5"	ARRON/KOCHEK		20K0525 KOCHEK	\$245.00	\$490.00	NO BID					HARRINGTON	H200-50-25	\$454.00	\$908.00	HARRINGTON	H220-50-25NH	\$319.00	\$638.00	KOCHEK	20K0525	\$217.18	\$434.36	KOCHEK	20K0525	\$265.00	\$530.00	TFT	AS9NJ-ST	\$339.25	\$678.50
44	1	5" STORZ TO 2 1/2" NH	KOCHEK	S36S525			\$125.00	\$125.00	NO BID						\$107.00	\$107.00	ACTION	AAS136	\$115.00	\$115.00			\$97.03	\$97.03	KOCHEK	S36S525	\$95.00	\$95.00	TFT	AA2ST-NJ	\$106.38	\$106.38
45	1	5" STORZ PISTON INTAKE VLV WITH 6" PUMP PIPE	AKRON	REVOLUTION (SWIVEL ELBOW) WITH CHAIN AND CAP			\$1,495.00	\$1,495.00	NO BID						\$55.00 PLUS \$1408.00	\$1,463.00	NO BID				AKRON	79812	\$1,377.09	\$1,377.09			\$1,350.00	\$1,350.00	TFT	AB1ST-NX & A01ST	\$1,288.00	\$1,288.00
46	1	DECK GUN	NOT AWARDED		NO BID				NO BID					3423	\$3,257.00	\$3,257.00	NO BID				AKRON-OR-TFT	3423	\$3,184.74	\$3,184.74	AKRON	APOLLO	\$2,875.00	\$2,875.00	TFT	XFC-42	\$2,527.13	\$2,527.13
47	1	BURST HOSE JACKET			BOSTON LEATHER	\$75.00	\$75.00	NO BID					BL	9200-1	\$61.00	\$61.00	BOSTON LEATHER	9200	\$69.00	\$69.00	BOSTON	9200	\$50.49	\$50.49	AKRON	772	\$590.00	\$590.00	BOSTON LEATHER	9200	\$53.34	\$53.34
48	1	HOSE CLAMP 1.5"+	AKRON	588		\$495.00	\$495.00	NO BID							\$491.00	\$491.00	NO BID						\$479.70	\$479.70			\$430.00	\$430.00	HERBERT HOSE CLAMP	HC25	\$249.00	\$249.00
49	2	15' 3" SUPPLY HOSE	NORTH AMER. FIRE HOSE	PT3X15_EN	NO BID				ARMORED TEXTILE	JAFLLITEHD 3 X 15	\$113.00	\$226.00			\$112.00	\$224.00	COUPLE D 2 1/2" NST	WHITE	\$93.00	\$186.00	NO BID						\$100.00	\$200.00	FIREQUIP	DJ3OR-15	\$130.20	\$260.40
50	1	25' 3" SUPPLY HOSE	NORTH AMER. FIRE HOSE	PT3X25_EN	NO BID				ARMORED TEXTILE	JAFLLITEHD 3 X 25	\$143.00	\$143.00			\$145.00	\$145.00	COUPLE D 2 1/2" NST	WHITE	\$151.00	\$151.00	NO BID						\$130.00	\$130.00	FIREQUIP	DJ30YA	\$158.70	\$158.70
51	5	3/4" NPSH REEL TEX FORESTRY HOSE-50' JOINT	REEL TEX		NO BID				ARMORED TEXTILE	ARMORED REEL 1" X 50'	\$199.00	\$995.00	NO BID				NO BID				NO BID						\$225.00	\$1,125.00	NO BID			
52	4	3/4" FIELD REPAIR KIT FOR REEL TEX MALE & FEMALE	REEL TEX		NO BID				ARMORED TEXTILE	1" NPSH	\$89.00	\$356.00	NO BID				NO BID				NO BID						\$55.00	\$220.00	NO BID			
53	8	1.75" X 50' NH ATTACK LINE (RED IN COLOR)	NORTH AMER. FIRE HOSE		NO BID				ARMORED TEXTILE	JAFLLITEHD 1 3/4" X 50'	\$113.00	\$904.00			\$116.00	\$928.00	N. AMERICAN FIRE HOSE	PT475X 50REN	\$128.00	\$1,024.00	FIREQUIP	DJ800	\$99.00	\$792.00			\$165.00	\$1,320.00	FIREQUIP	DJ17RB	\$105.80	\$846.40
54	1	6" NST RED HEAD 140-60001 BARREL TYPE STRAINER. A COMP BRACKET TO BE PROVIDED TO STORE STRAINER WHEN NOT IN USE	KOCHEK	BS60 W/ MOUNTING PLATE			\$295.00	\$295.00	NO BID						\$114.00 PLUS \$37.00	\$151.00	REDHEAD 140		\$208.00	\$208.00	KOCHEK	MM60 MOUNT	\$92.89	\$92.89			\$165.00	\$165.00	TFT	A02HNX & RH M-60	\$198.71	\$198.71
55	1	HYDRANT ADAPTER—DOUBLE FEMALE 6" TO 4 1/2" NST FOR HARD SUCTION HOSE TO DRY HYDRANT.	KOCHEK	ADAPTOR WITH MOUNTING PLATE			\$245.00	\$245.00	NO BID						\$168.00 PLUS \$37.00	\$205.00	ACTION		\$211.00	\$211.00	KOCHEK	MM601 MOUNT	\$159.19	\$159.19			\$315.00	\$315.00	RH 3545NH60N H & RH M-60		\$262.20	\$262.20
56	1	SP 555 SPREADER	HURST		NO BID				NO BID								NO BID						\$5,984.55	\$5,984.55			\$6,890.00	\$6,890.00	NO BID			
57	1	S 700 CUTTER HSS	HURST		NO BID				NO BID								NO BID						\$4,563.00	\$4,563.00			\$5,250.00	\$5,250.00	NO BID			
58	1	R 430 RAM	HURST		NO BID				NO BID								NO BID						\$3,913.65	\$3,913.65			\$4,500.00	\$4,500.00	NO BID			
59	1	RAM ATTACHMENT SET	HURST		NO BID				NO BID								NO BID						\$961.74	\$961.74			\$1,175.00	\$1,175.00	NO BID			
60	1	DRIVER SIDE AIRBAG SAFE	HURST		NO BID				NO BID								NO BID						\$659.88	\$659.88			\$800.00	\$800.00	NO BID			
61	1	PASSENGER SIDE AIRBAG SAFE	HURST		NO BID				NO BID								NO BID						\$624.78	\$624.78			\$765.00	\$765.00	NO BID			
62	1	QUICK KICK RAM SUPPORT	NOT AWARDED		NO BID				NO BID								NO BID						\$505.44	\$505.44			\$620.00	\$620.00	NO BID			
63	1	QUICKSTRUT	NOT AWARDED		NO BID				NO BID								NO BID						\$1,396.98	\$1,396.98			\$1,700.00	\$1,700.00	NO BID			
64	1	CHAIN SET FOR SP 555 SPREADER	HURST		NO BID				NO BID								NO BID						\$631.80	\$631.80			\$770.00	\$770.00	NO BID			

Bidders Address		Anderson Fire & Safety Anderson, SC				Dana Safety Supply Columbia, SC				FireLine, Inc. Winder, GA				Kenco Fire Equipment Springfield, MO				Newton Fire & Safety Swepsonville, NC				Safe Industries Easley, SC				Wally's Fire & Safety Equipment Mullins, SC			
65	1	MAXIFORCE G2 AIR LIFTING BAG KITS- Model 48 3 Lift Bag Set – Control kit would be a basic control kit (regulator) 22-890351G2-150. Should also include an inline relief valve for every air bag – 22-890490-150	PARATECH	NO BID				NO BID				NO BID																	
66	1	VEHICLE STABILIZATION KIT – Standard 22-796850	PARATECH	NO BID				NO BID				NO BID																	
67	1	TWISTLOCK VEHICLE STABILIZER (TVS) – 22-797000	PARATECH	NO BID				NO BID				NO BID																	
68	1	AIR LIFTING BAG KIT To include the following: 145 flat form bags: ART.HPF.18.7 (2ea); ART.HPF.29.7 (2 ea); ART.HPF35.7 (2 ea) 145 High Pressure Control Kit: ART5100R	NOT AWARDED	NO-BID				NO-BID				NO-BID																	
69	1	STAB-FAST STRUT SYSTEM-DELUXE KIT – ART.510.200.0	NOT AWARDED	NO-BID				NO-BID				NO-BID																	
		TOTAL AMOUNT					\$0.00			\$625.00				\$928.00			\$0.00			\$19,693.71			\$28,252.00					\$718.50	
		Add 6% Sales Tax								\$37.50				\$55.68						\$1,181.62			\$1,695.12					\$43.11	
		TOTAL AMOUNT AWARDED								\$662.50				\$983.68						\$20,875.23			\$29,947.12					\$761.61	
																											TOTAL AWARD: \$53,230.24		