OCONEE COUNTY COUNCIL MEETING - TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 16,1993

i0.

3:00 PM
Call to Order
Invocation
Approval of Minutes

Discussion Regarding Appealed and/or Corrected Job
Descriptions ~ Ms., Donna Kazia, SC COG

Consideration of Arts Contracts - Mr. Ernst
Hesterberyg, Arts Commission Chairman

Second Reading of Ordinance 93-8, "An Ordinance
Approving the Financing of the Improvements,
Renovations and Additions to Certain Sewer
Treatment Facilities in Oconee County, South
Carolina Through the Borrowing by Oconee County,
South Carolina of not Exceeding Eight Million, One
Hundred, Ninety Thousand Dollars ($8,190,000) From
the State Water Pollution Control Revolving Fund,
by Agreement with the South Carolina Water Quality
Revolving Fund Authority, Pursuant to Title 48,
Chapter 5, Code of Laws of South Carolina, 1976,
as Amended Providing for the Agreement to Make and
to Accept a Loan, the Execution and Delivery of a
Loan Agreement Between Oconee County and the South
Carolina Water Quality Revolving Fund Authority,
The Execution and Delivery of a Promissory Note
From Oconee County to the South Carclina Water
Quality Revolving Fund Authority; and Other
Matters Relating Thereto" - Mr. Howard Adams,
Sewer Commission Chairman, Mr. Lamar Bailes,
Finance Chairman & Mr. Robert Winchester, Director

Statement Regarding Trespass Notice - Mr. Robert
Whitney

Consideration of Bids for Equipment for Rural Fire
- Mr. Dewitt Mize, Rural Fire Marshal & Ms.
Marianne Dillard, Purchasing Director

Consideration of Bids for Carpet for Law
Enforcement Center - Mr. Bob Busch, LEC Director &
Ms. Marianne Dillard, Purchasing Director

Discussion Regarding Disposal of Used Tires at
Motor Pool - Mr. Lee Davis, Motor Pocl Director &
Ms. Marianne Dillard, Purchasing Director



Page 2 - AGENDA -~ November 16, 1993
11. 014 Business
12. New Business

13. Adjourn

*k%2:00 PM*** Road Committee Meeting
*¥*k%2:45 PM*** Administrative Briefing

(All Meetings Open to Public)



MEMBERS, OCONEE COUNTY COUNCIL
Mrs. M. Fran Burrell, District I Mr. Harrison E. Orr, Dist
Mr. Michael E. Harper, District ITI Mr. Roy B. Strickland, [
Mr. Alton K. Williams, District V

MINUTES, OCONEE COUNTY COUNCIL MEETING

The regular meeting of the Oconee County
Council was held Tuesday, November 16, 1993 at 3:00 pm in
Council Chambers with all Council Members except Mr. Williams
present. Mr. Timothy M. Cain, County Attorney was also
present.

Members of the press notified (by mail}):
Journal/Tribune, Kecowee Courier, Westminster News, Anderson
Independent, Greenville News, WGOG Radio, WBFM Radio, WCCP
Radio, WZLI/WLET Radio, WYFF TV, & WLOS TV.

Members of the press present: Ashton
Hester -~ Keowee Courier, Eric Gorsky - Anderson Independent,
Lee Hendren - Journal/Tribune and Jennifer Berry - Greenville
News.

The meeting was called to order by Super-
visor Chairman Crain who welcomed the guests and media.

The invocation was given by Mr. Orr.

Mr. Orr made a motion, seconded by Mr.
Strickland, approved 4 - 0 (Mr. Williams absent) that the
minutes of the October 2, 1993 meeting be adopted as printed.

Ms., Donna Kazia of SC Appalachian Council
of Governments addressed Council regarding the attached job
that were appealed and/or corrected. Ms. Kazia explained to
Council that none of the corrections made changed the
classification or grade for these job descriptions. After
discussion, Mr. Harper made a motion, seconded by Mr. Orr
approved 4 - 0 (Mr. Williams absent) that these job descrip-
tions be adopted as presented.

- At the request of Mr. Ernst Hesterberg, Arts
Commission Chairman, Mr. Strickland made a motion, seconded by
Mrs. Burrell, approved 4 - 0 (Mr. Williams absent) that a
contract for Mr. Doug Rochester to present a video workshop
at Seneca Middle Schoel and Oakway Middle School at a cost of
$1,500 be adopted.

Mr. Hesterberg also informed Council that
the first of three ATAX Conferences was very successful with
the focus being on what attracts visitors to our county.
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Mr. Strickland made a motion, seconded by
Mrs. Burrell, approved 4 -~ 0 (Mr. Williams absent that Ordinance
93-8, "An Ordinance Approving the Financing of the Improvements,
Renovations and Additions to Certain Sewer Treatment Facilities
in Oconee County, South Carolina Through the Borrowing by
Oconee County, South Carclina of not Exceeding Eight Million,
One Hundred, Ninety Thousand Dollars (%$8,190,000) From the
State Water Pollution Control Revolving Fund, by Agreement
with the South Carolina Water Quality Revolving Fund Authority,
Pursuant to Title 48, Chapter 5, Code of Laws of South Carolina,
1976, as Amended Providing for the Agreement to Make and to
Accept a Loan, the Execution and Delivery of a Loan Agreement
Between Oconee County and the South Carolina Water Quality
Revolving Fund Authority, the Execution and Delivery of a
Promissory Note from Oconee County to the South Carolina Water
Quality Revolving Fund Authority; and Other Matters Relating
Thereto" be adopted on second reading.

Mr. Robert Whitney addressed Council regard-
ing a notice that was issued on November 5, 1993 by the county:
directed to Thomas H. Glenn, who is Mr. Whitney‘s client,
concerning entry upon Oconee County Airport property.

Mr. Whitney was informed that Council would
be briefed regarding this action and if any action was taken he
would be apprised.

Mr. Strickland made a motion, seconded by
Mrs. Burrell, approved 4 - 0 (Mr. Williams absent) that the
bid for rural fire equipment be awarded per item that met
specifications as delineated on the attached bid sheet.

Mr. Orr made a motion, seconded by Mrs.
Burrell that the bid for the carpet for the Law Enforcement
Center be awarded to Rollins Tile & Carpet who were low bid
at $9,099.94. (See attached bid sheet)

Mr. Lee Davis, Motor Pool Foreman and Ms.
Marianne Dillard, Purchasing Director, informed Council that
no bids had been received for the sale and removal of surplus
used recapable tires. However, they did recommend that the
attached quote from Watson Tires of Simpsonville be adopted.
Mr. strickland made this into the form of a motion, seconded
by Mr. Harper, approved 4 - 0 (Mr. Williams absent). This
was done with the consent of the County Attorney.

Mr. Orr, Chairman of the Roads &
Transportation Committee, announced a committee meeting
Tuesday, December 7, 1993 at 6:00 pm in Council Chambers.

Mr. Orr made a motion, seconded by Mr.
Harper, approved 4 - 0 (Mr., Williams absent) that Council go
into executive session for a legal briefing.
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When open session resumed there was no
action taken.

The Council Clerk informed Council that
the meeting with the Hospital Board had been scheduled for
Monday, November 29, 1993 at 6:00 pm in Council Chambers.

Adjourn: 4:50 pm

Open
Session

Hospital
Meet

Norman D. Crain
Supervisor-Chairman
Oconee County Council




ROBERT K. WHITNEY

ATTORNEY-AT-LAW
: P.O. BOX 14
SENECA, SOUTH CAROLINA 29679-0014
(803) BG2-1414 FAX (803} 885-0675

November 9, 1993

Mr. Norman D. Crain, County Supervisor
¥ia FAX 638-4241
Dear Mr. Crain,

Please consider this a written request to be placed on the
agenda for the next county council meeting. The subject I would
cate to address is the November 5, 1993, Trespass Notice issued
by Oconee County.

Please let me know when the meeting will be and when I may
appear before the County Council.

Sincerely,
Robert K, Whitney

RKW:sll



OCONEE COUNTY BID TABULATION

QOctober 21, 1993

BID FOR: Fire Fighting Equipment DATE:
BID NO: 93-16 _LOCATION: _ Walhalla, sC TME. 2100 p.m-
BIDDERS Zimmérman Evans, Carolina Anderson Fire & Charlotte Equip.
Inc. . Firemaster, Inc. Safety Eq. Co. Sales, Inc. Firemart
8 pr bunker pants 113600 o 1,227.84 1,200.00 1,184.00
2 pr bib pants w/supe 434.00 388.744 422.00
M Pr bib pants w/s Ta .....568.00 793.48
10 coats no w/t pocket 2,350.00 2,620.00 2,150.00 1,990.00 ~
3 _coats Black Nomax { 735.00 769.98 816.00
4 coats Globe Astra Th 980.00 021.04
8 pr Red suspenders 96.00 75.68 85.00
I} pr reflec suspender ] . 56.00 1 01.08
13 pr driver boots  {  _ ____ 747.50 | — 741.00 787.80
36 hoods Nomax 702.00 612.00 684.00 N 504.00 582.48
[ 23 Bullard helmets | 2,714.00 2,070,00 2,149.35 2,024.00 v
104 pr gloves heavy dty 2,128.00 1,520.00 1,444.00 1,341.60 1 1,748.00
100 ft sect 5" hose w/ £18.00 500.00 o 620.00
7 swivel zip nuts 455.00 2.857.68 448.00
—-1.hyd. wrench set com 50.858 52.00 90.24 49.00 ~
2 G Hydra 378.00+ 404,00 385.02 392.00
36 Super Pass alarm 3,564.00 3,420.00 i 4,320.00 3,564.00 3,744.00
3 turbo jet nozzle 1,170.00 1,071.00C 1,103.64 1,125.00
. 4 walk-away brackets 236.00 160.00 260.00 128.00
1 tele floodlight 380.00 270.00 258.75 289.00

ATTENDI%OPE‘NING: Marianne Dillard, Jenny Peay - Purchiiing Department; Dewitt Mize - Rural F

re; Alan HOYn, CPR




OCONEE COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID FOR: Fire Fighting Equipment DATE: October 21, 1993

BID NO: 93-16 LOCATION: Walhalla, SC: TIME:  2:00 p.m.
BIDDERS Zimmerman Evans, Carolina Anderson Fire & Charlotte Equip.
Inc. - Firemaster Safety Eq. Co. Sales, Inc. Firemart
Y} salvage cover Red ' 458.00 292.00 740.00 _ 536.00
56 bunker gear bag 1,568.00 2,072.00 2,688.00 1,428.00 1,646.40
Subtotal
S. €. Sales Tax
TOTAL 396.90 v 4,481.40 v . 1,186.23 v . 1,408.68 4,266.15

ATTENDING OPENING:




OCONEE COUNTY BID TABULATION

October 21, 1993

BID FOR: Fire Fighting Equipment ‘ DATE:
BID NO: 93-16 L LOCATION:  Walhalla, 5C Time: 20 P
wooers  [Lsen iR | e s
8 pr bunker pants 1,168.24 1,087.2_9 -
2 pr bib pants w/supe 592.22 391.80
__4 Pr bib pants w/s Ta 1,184.44 759.60
10 coats no w/t pocket 2,555.00 2,429.00
~_3.coats Black Nomax _ 1,054.98_ - 758.40 N
4 coats Globe Astra T 1.406.64 912.00
8§ »r Red suspender-s‘ 8. 16 90,00
Y pr reflec suspender 96 .00 62,00
|13 pr driver boots . N | 764,40
36 hoods Nomax 507.60 496 .80 v
23 Bullard helmets 2,528.16 H____2,088.40
76 pr gloves heavy dty 1,091.36 1,383.20
r}_@_ig__,s}gg_t}_ 5" hose w/ 557.00 620.00
7 swivel zip nuts 472,43 441,00 v~
1 hyd. wrench _set comb 50.18 58.00
2 Gate & Hydrapt valve 429.48 424.00
| 36 Super Pass alarm 3,472.92 3,888.00 _ _
3 turbo jet nozzle 1,170.36 1,047,00 v
. 4 walk-away brackets 119.52 v~ 190.80
1 tele floodlight 236.25 290.00

ATTENDING OPENING:




OCONEE COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID FOR: Fire Fighting Equipment DATE: October 21, 1993
BID NO: _93-16 LOCATION: Walhalla, sC. TIME: 2100 p.m.
BIODERS Slagle's Fire Eq &| Harold's Sales &
Supply Co., INc. Service
4 salvage cover Red 458,64 472.00
56 bunker gear bag 1,875.44 ' 1,411.20 .
Subtotal 365.77 7,003.20
S. €. Sales Tax 17.79 350.16
TOTAL 373.56 7,353.36

ATTENDING OPENING:




A
®

The

BID NO. 93-16
{(Use this number on
ernvelopes & all re-

. lated corrgspondevce)

BID FORM
OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
201 WEST MAIN STREET
WALHALLA, §.C. 29691

submits

herewith cur Bid in response to bid request riumber shown above, and in

compliance with the description{s) and/or specification(s) attached hereto for
fire fighting equipment for Rural Fire Department

DESCRIPTION UNIT ‘PRICE 1 TOTRL

QUANTITY :

5 | Pairs Giobe Dutor banis.eeeeeeeeeeennn.. (142,00 |#4136.00

2 Pa'*i‘ﬁa ‘M@Z&%ﬁ w/suspenders....--. 217.60 434.00

1I P?:;{:t"fs WE&{%{w/suspendem Tan... a7 00 3‘_3' 00

10 Coals a+ebe ~ No Walkle Talkie pocket.... 235 00 11350' 00
Coats Short -~ Black N%{n*:a:x.lﬂff-!‘?'z/!f.f‘??.".% 246.00 738. 00

Coats Grobe~tmbra’ Tan. dearsvile PRETOZ | 24600 9§0. 00

8 Pairs heavy duty ALB Red suspenders...... ANe 810 .

.' 4 | Pairs reflective heavy duty suspenders... | /.95 59.90
13 | Pairs Rs-aggﬁ Driver Boots #-‘S—fEII’:. Yo7 .. | 52.60 747.60
36 | Fire Dex flash hoods Nomax... M %&L ... ... 19,50 70%2.00
23 | Bullers-helmefs.” Lion. 3700, .. ........ | DI 2,714.00
76 | Pairs gloves heavy duty..Fuefnp 1900 .. | 28 00 12,/29.00

100'} Section of 5" hose w/storz coupling...... .19’ £18.00

| ey g sty e -2 e | o

| Vet e s s T T soss 50.85

e 21" Gate & Hydrant valve screw type...... | /59,00 37800

36 | Super Pass Alarm Model 8P1l...iveencenaa-s | @700 3,564.00
Akron Turbo Jet nozzle w/pilstol grip..... | 390.00 131‘70.00

uy Walk-away brackets for Scott Air Paks.... 59.00 234 .00

| 1 | Telescoping halogen fléodlight complete.. | 3§0.00 380.00
Y | Salvage cover - F T I 114,60 45%, 00
56 | Bunker Gear BAgS eecurna ensensmanene e ag.00 1 56%. 60




The
herewith cur Bid in response to bid request riumber shown above, and in

RID FORM

21 WEST MAIN STREET
WALHALLA, 5.0, 296491

Carolina :Lre_ﬂ/loﬂus , TG,

BID NOD.

93-16

(Use this number on
envelaopes & all re-

lated correspondence)

OCOMEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEFARTMENT

submits

compliance with the description{(s) and/or specificationiz) attachad hereto for
fire fighting equipment for Rural Fire Department
UANTITY DESCRIPTION UNITlPRICE 1 TOTAL
8 | Pairs Globe bunker pants......eeeeveueonnn hﬂf5 e
2 | Pairs Globe blb pants w/suspendersd...... . Nlewa———m-
4 | Pairs Globe bid pants w/suspenders Tan... fﬂhg,dﬁnx
10 | Coats Globe - No Walkie Talkie pocket.... N|{B—T
3 | Coats Short - Black Nomax...... feeennens . NiRA— T
4 | Coats Globe Astra Tan........ . N BT
8 | Pairs heavy duty ALB Red éuspenders. e 1. 00 36, 00
. It} Pairs reflective heavy duty suspenders... 4. 00} HGe.00
13 | Pairs Ranger Driver Boots #5124.......... Ni& N| &
36 | Fire Dex flash hoods Nomax................ 177, 00| (a1, 00
23 | Bullard belmets ....... fertasanmannnes QD.OO;\p—;o- faY8)
76 Pairs glovez heavy duty...... reraresennn 2_0_00‘,53_0.00
100"| Section of 5" hose w/storz coupling..... . 5.00| 5 00.00
7T 1 24" x2i" Swivel zip nuls - 23" female,
P L - S rraeratenaann (e,g“.oo 55 . 00
i Hydrant wrench set complete Lripe holder
€ ntraarnnaeeennnn 52.00] 562.00
2 23" Gate & Hydrant valve screw type...... 203 o0 L-In‘_')"l-- 00
36 | Super Pass Alarm Model SP1.DorHonN .001—-.‘-1 95, 00| dHAD: eo
3 | Akron Turbo Jet nozzle w/pistol grip..... 3577, o0{|b1 )i
4 | Walk~away brackets for Scott Air Paks.... .00 | 1O 00
1 | Telescoping halogen floodlight complete.. J1p. 60 &0 oo
4 | Salvage cover --Red.......... ......... 73.00 292..60
56 | Bunker Gear Bags.......... Crrenaraeanaaas A77.00 2072. 00
|




The

RID FORM

BID NO

§93-16

(Use this number on
envelopes & all re-
lated correspondence)

OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEFARTMENT

201 WEST MAIN STREET
WALHALLA, S.C. 29691

Anderson Fire & Safety

submits

herewith cur Bid in response to bid request number shown above, and in

complianpte with the description(s) and/or specification(s) attached hereto for
rire fighting equipment for Rural Fire Department

QUANTLTY DESCRIPTION UNIT PRIéE T TOTAL

a Pairs Globe bunker pants...Globe#20776+1 153.48 1227.84

2 | Pairs Globe bib pants w/suspenders..Glabe 194,37 388.74

y Paira Globe bid pants w/suspenders TanGlobe 198.37 793.48
10 | Coals Globe - No Walkie Talkie pocketGlLoble 262.00 2626.00

3 | Coats Short -~ Black NomaX,......... c1obs 256.66 769.98

4 | Coats Globe Astra Tan....gGLobe:«:sse-«-- ' 230.26 $21.04

8 Pairs heavy duty ALB Red suspenders.globe 9.46 75.68

n Palrs reflective heavy duty suspenders..g1obe 15.47 61.88
13 | Pairs Ranger Driver Boots #5124, .. 3Qrvus 57.00 741.00
36 | Fire Dex flash hoods Nomax....g4pre-Dex - 19.00 684.00
23 | Bullard Helmets ........................... 93.45 2149.35
76 | Pairs gloves heavy duty.Firefighter ... 19.00 | 1444.00°
100"| Section of 5" hose w/storz coupling...... No Bid

7 | 23" x23" Swivel zip nuts - 21" female, 408.24 2857.68

23" male..sinieriiniennccnaanaaaaaianan
1 Hydrant wrench set complete tripe holder 90.24 - 90. 24
1= 2

2 | 21" Gate & Hydrant valve acrew type...... 192.51 385.02
36 Super Pass Alarm Model SP1.<New. Model... 120.00 4320.00

3 | Akron Turbo Jebt nozzle w/pistol grip..... 367.88 1,103.64

4 | Walk-away brackets for Scott Air Paks.... 65.00 260, 0f

1 Telescoping halogen fléodlight complete. . 258.75 258.75

4 | Salvage cover —.Red ........... J-2txl8. .. 185.00 740.00
56 | Bunker Gear Bags.....ceveeenesrenncenanns 48.00 2688.00

Total 24.580.32
S.C. Tax

1.229.02

490776-1
$40776-1
£10776-1
$80776-1
230776-1
Heavy Duty

Reflective
Drivers Boots

Akron #1828
Akron#2442

Bkron#285
Not Available
Akron@1720

Firl



P ' . BID nNO. 93-16
' ' {Use this number on
L= envelopes & all re—

lated correspondence)'
. ' RID FORM

OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
201 WEST MAIN STREET
WOLHALLA, 5.C. 29631

The Charlotte EQuipment Sales, Inc. submits
herewith our Bid in response to bid request number shown above, and in

compliance with the descriptionts) and/or specification(s) attached hereto for
fire fighting equipment for Rural Fire Department

QUANTETY DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE | TOTAL

8 | Pairs—€lebe bunker pant‘sc‘l'q”'“-. .QEAV‘QL“"‘FA' | S R T

PR E R RN N N

2 Pairs Globe blib pants w/suspenders.......

b Pairs Globe bid pants w/suspenders Tan... S
[CE NYCNER =\ oo Gl s~ @ S
10 Coats-6lebe — No Walkie Talkie pocket.... Zg RS0

3 Coats Short - Black Nomax.......... PR
4 Coats Globe Astra Tan.....ceeecresncennan
an ggg;c;b
8 | Pairs heavy duty -A&B Red suspenders...... e -
. | Pairs reflective heavy duty suspenders...
13 | Pairs Ranger Driver Boots #5124..........
36 | F4pe—Bex flash hoods Nomax. NFpp 2z Vo Sot.o

23 Bullard helmels @ coneerecivasanorannannann o
o el 9 , p

76 | Pairs gloves heavy duty.!YF9R . ... r27— 1 78043

100"} Section of 5" hose w/storz coupling......

7 21" x24" Swilvel zip nuts ~ 23" female,
2 MAlE s eeiraesnonssrnesessnsansonns

1 Hydrant wrench set complete tripe holder

2 23" Gate & Hydrant valve screw type......
36 | Super Pass Alarm Model SP1. ﬂ)@!_ﬁa PR+ 15 T Eadie 35-6 a
Akron Turbo Jet nozzle w/pistol grip.....
Walk-away brackets for Scott Air Paks....
1 Telescoping halggen floodlight complete..

4 Salvage cover -~ Red...uviecenennnans creen
56 | Bunker Gear Bags... .26.\’(/.?7[/‘3. ........ 25 80 fHLEet




ire Dapartment Equipment - Services - Two Way Padios

e

TERAY DAVIS

o
{803)

The

[R— -

FIREMART

Division of WTD SERVICES

PO Box 145

BID NO. 93-16

(Ugse this number on
envelopes & all re-
lated correspoandence)

Woodruff SC 20388-0145
476-2145 FAX: (803) 476-2145

1-800-874.6598 MD FORM

PURCHASING DEFARTHMENT

iIT MAIN STREET
A, B5.C. 23631

FIREMART

submits

herewith cur Bid in response to bid request nuwber shewn above, and in

compliance with the descriptioni{s) and/or specificationis)

fire fighting equipment for Rural Fire Department

attached hereto for

QUANTITY DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL,
8 Pairs Globe bunker pants. ... ............. 148,00 $1184,00
2 Paira Globe bib pants w/suspenders....... 211,00 $422.00
It | Pairs Globe bid pants w/suspenders Tan.. NO BID NO BID
10 Coats Globe - No Walkie Talkle pocket.... 199.00 $1990.00
3 | Coats Short - Black Nomax...........c.uu.n $272.00 $816.00
4 | Coats Globe ASEra TaN..s.eeceseccerernnns NO BID NO BID
8 Pairs heavy duty ALB Red suspenders...... NO BID NO BID
. it Pairs reflective heavy duty suspenders... NO BID NO BID
13 | Pairs Ranger Driver Boots #5128.......... $60.60 $787.80
36 Fire Dex flash hoods NomaX.....cu.ewonaenn $16.18 $582,48
23 | Bullard helmebs ... . ... i nennnennnns $88.00 $2024.00
76 | Pairs gloves heavy dUbyY. ... e eeeennnannan - $23.00 §1748,00
100*| Section of 5" hose w/storz coupling...... $620.00 $620.00
T B e svivel aip mio - 247 fomie, g4 00 | $448.00
D] Meenn TS S sonerene TR TN sasi00 ) 49,00
2 25" Gate & Hydrant valve screw type...... $196.00 $392.00
36 | Super Pass Alarm Model SP1......vuuncnnn- $104.00 $3744.00
3 | Akron Turbo Jet nozzle w/plstol grip..... §375,00 | $1125.00
Walk-away brackets for Scott Air Paks.... $32.00 ,$128'00
1 Telescopihg halogen floodlight complete.. $289'00 $289'00
b Salvage cover - .Red ______________________ $134.00 $536.00
56 | Bunker Gear BafS...eevsueesvencnancncaanns $29.40 $1646.40
PRICES INCLUDE FREIGHT
. ADD SALES TAX




BID NO. 93-16
{Use this number on
envelopes & all re-

Fire Depastment Equipment - Sarvices - Two Way Radios
P
FIREMART ]

TERRY DAVIS Division of WTD SERVICES

- Owner PO Box 145 lated corresponderce)
. Woodruft SC 29368-0145 .
(803) 476-2145 FAX: (803) 476-2145
1-800-874-6598 !
IING DEPARTMENT
'GTREET
29691
The : FIREMART B submits

herewith our Bid in response to bid request number shown above, and in

compliance with the description(s) and/or specification(s) attached hereto for
fire Tighting equipment for Rural Fire Department

UANTITY DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE -| TOTAL
8 | Paira Globe bunker pantS........ceevaeen. 160.00 $1280.00

-------

2 Paira Globe bib pants w/suspenders

4 | Pairs Globe bid pants w/suspenders Tan... .

10 | Coats Globe - No Walkie Talkie pocket.... | 212.00 $2120.00
3 | Coats Short - Black NomaX...ceeesaveceann
4 | Coats Globe AsStra Tan..v.veeceeersoreens “
8 | Pairs héavy duty ALB Red suspenders......
. y " Pair's reflective heavy duty suspenders...
| 13 | Pairs Ranger Driver Boots #5124..........
36 | Fire Dex flash hoods NOMAX...s..e.... -
.23 | Bullard helmets ... icvrrerrncvenecncons -
76 | Pairs gloves heavy duty; .......... crenuen

100"} Section of 5" hose w/storz coupling......

7 | 23" x2" Swivel zip nuts - 23" female,
21" male....... e

1 | Hydrant wrench set complete tripe holder

2 _2%" Gate & Hydrant valve screw type......
36 | Super Pass Alarm Model SP1

-----

Akron Turbo Jet nozzle w/pistol grip
Walk-away brackets for Scott Air Paks....
1 Telescoping halogen fléodlighb complete..
4 | Salvage cover —.Red.

56 | Bunker Gear Bag8.cesninee

. PRICES INCLUDE FREIGHT
ADD SALES TAX




BID SUPPLEMENTAL FORM
OCONEE COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT ¢

201 West Main Street

WALHALLA, SOUTH CAROLINA 29691

DATE _10/21/83 =~ ~ BID M. 3316

ITEM-BUNKER PANTS

JANESVILLE CUSTOM-DELUXE, 7.5 0Z NOMEX III, NEOPRENE BARRIER,
QUILTED LINER, SCOTCHLITE TRIM, 1 HIP POCKET, LEATHER KNEES,
WITH SUSPENDERS.



e it s At e e

,f
- : BID SUPPLEMENTAL FORM
. QCONEE COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTRENT 7

201 West Main Street

WALHALLA, SOUTH CAROLINA 29631

Y
*

DATE 10/21/93 " °  BID NO. 93216

ITEM-SUPER PASS 1
BID ARE MSA FIREFLIES WITHOUT BATTERIES INCLUDED

W it et e et -

R g b b



DATE _10/21/93

BID SUPPLEMENTAL FORM
OCONEE COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 7

201 West Main Street

WALHALLA, SOUTH CARCLINA 29691

BID NO. '93-16

ITEM-BUNKER COATS

JANESVILLE CUSTOM-DELUXE, 7.5 0Z NOMEX III, NEOPRENE BARRIER,

QUILTED LINER,

SCOTCHLITE TRIM, 2 FLAT POCKETS

B e T




BID SUPPLEMENTAL FORM
OCONEE COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 7

2Q1 West Main Street

WALHALLA, SOUTH CAROLINA 25691

DATE _10/21/93 BID NO. . 9316

ITEM - BULLARD FH2192 HELMETS

THIS MODEL HELMET DOES NOT MEET THE LATEST NFPA STANDARD
AND IS NO LONGER MANUFACTURED, BID IS THE PRESENT BULLARD
HELMET, MODEL PX.



. Bib np. 93-16
(Use this number on
ernvelopes & all re-
lated corresponderce)

BID FORM
QCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEFARTMENT

231 WEST MAIN STREET
WALHALLA, S.C. 29631

5 /’?f/t F re

The

5

herawith cur Bid iq-r'esponse to bid re

compliance with the description(s) and/or specification{s) attached hereto for
fire fighting equipment for Rural Fire Department

é;u?mﬁi &

est number shobn a

ve,

submits
and in

L2

UNIT PRICE

QUANTITY DESCRIPTION TOTAL
| 8 | Pairs Globe bunker pantS.........eecceeas ] #6-03 /1692
2 { Pairs Globe bi—b pants w/suspenders....... ,?96'” 5 a2
4 | Pairs Globe bid pants w/suspenders Tan... | 276 LY
10 | Coats Globe - No Walkie Talkie pocket.... | 25500 | &S5 %7
3 | Coats Short - Black NOMAX......ceeeneeen- 357166 /'051""?5
4 | Coats Globe ASEra TaN.......ieveeveveneenn 35‘}-6‘5 /24666
8 Pairs heavy duty ALB Red suspenders...... ? '77 7& /6
d 4 | Pairs reflective heavy duty suspenders... | K# %9 76 -0
13 | Pairs Ranger Driver Boots #5124........-. 05500?\‘}3“-\'&‘ wo _g\'
36 | Fire Dex flash hoods Nomax./SKOMARE | 74-79 307-6°
23 | Bullard helmets..CAirns. . 66aCR . .. 0% . 92 2528 /'éé
76 | Patrs gloves heavy cuy GCH-r0F...... | ez 073
1007| Section of 5" hose w/storz coupling...... 5.8 poJ+ 557'0‘3
S R e s | v ? | #7H #3
PR IR g e ke | souiw | S0V
2 | 2%" Gate & Hydrant valve screw Lype€...... 2;}.{.’?11" 4:{?4‘2’
36 | Super Pass Alarm Model SP1......... vemes G6. 47 34"‘1'?1
3 | Akron Turbo Jet nozzle w/pistol grip..... | 379- e 74 '70;36
Walk-away brackets for Scott Air Paks.... 2??‘3’ //9'«32-
1 | Telescoping halogen floodlight complete.. 23.25 Q36-A5
4y | Salvage cover - Reeaenenerannnns e Vad V44 _ 45-?-6%
56 | Bunker Gear Bags..E L..3363/K....... 33.49 |85 ¥
®

PR )




'SLAGLE’S

|_Fire Equipment & Supply Co., Inc. )

. -Main Office. SALES OFFICES -Branch Office-
U.8. Hwy. 58E, Box 15 1818 Old Dunbar Rd./P. Q. Box 2184
South Boston, VA 24592 Cayce (W. Columbia), SC 29174
Phone 804-575-7905 Fax 1-804-572-3373 Fhone 1-803-731-4555 Fax 1-803-739-2327

M =2 M O R A N D U M

November 3, 1993

TO: Oconee County Purchasing
ATTN: Mary Ann Dillard
FROM: Kathy Ard W"

SUBJECT: Equipment Bld #93-16

AREARIE LR R R MR AR R R R R AN AR AR LR AR AR AR I AR AR R R R AR AR R R e AN R R R h R &

Slagle Flre Egulpment willl honor the prices we have bld on
your Equipment Bld #93-16,

. We fEQIet that the bid was submlitted without a-signature, it
was an overslght on our part.

" If I may be of any further service, please feel free to call
on me at anytime.

THE FIRE TRUCK AND EQUIPMENT PEOPLE
NEW & PREOWNED FIRE APPARATUS

@



BID SUPPLEMENTAL FORM
OCONEE COUNTY

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
"201 West Main Street

WALHALLA, SOUTH CAROLINA 29691

paTg 10721793 -~ . © BID NO.

9316

ITEM - FIRE DEX FLASH HOODS

THE GLOVE CORPORATION FIRE HOOD STYLE 100
DOUBLE KNIT, SHORT |

ADD $2.00 PER HOOD FOR SHOULDER LENGTH HOOD



BID SUPPLEMENTAL FORM
OCONEE COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 7
(201 West Main Stréet

WALHALLA, SOUTH CAROLINA 29631

*

DATE 10/21/93 ~ BID NO. 93-16

ITEM-BUNKER COATS _
JANESVILLE CUSTOM-DELUXE 7,5 0Z NOMEX III, NEOPRENE BARRIER,
QUILTED LINER, SCOTCHLITE TRIM, 2FLAT POCKETS, W/LEATHER REINFORCED

ELBOWS, SHOULDERS, POCKETS & CUFFS

ITEM-BUNKER PANTS _
JANESVILLE CUSTOM-DELUXE AS ABOVE WITH 2 BELLOWS POCKETS, REINFORCED

CUFFS & KNEES WITH SUSPENDERS

TERRY's NOTE-MOST DEPTS BUY THE $199,00 COAT & THE $160,00 PANTS

e ey wwm uE - e am e PR W LY LA BN BEETR ETUT WM OMN O rmad Camee TS OF BT Y}




3

BI0 SUPPLEMENTAL FORM
OCONEE COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 7

_ _'_'Z__OLIVWest: Main Street

WALHALLA, SOUTH CAROLINA 29691

1

DATE 10/21/93. o “BID NO. "93-16

ITEM-TELESCOPING HALOQOGEN FLOODLIGHT
MODEL BID, EXTENDA-LITE MODEL E-500-PS-SM .



| \

BID SUPPLEMENTAL FORM
OCONEE COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 7

201 West Main Street

WALHALLA, SOUTH CARQLINA 29691

paTe _10/21/93 ~ © BIDNO. - 93-16

ITEM-GLOBE GX-7 COATS '
QUAKER SAFETY PRODUCTS QS5- 103 7.5 0Z NOMEX, NEOPRENE BARRIER,

QUILTED LINER, SCOTCHLITE TRIM

ITEM-GX-7 PANTS '
QUAKER SAFETY PRODUCTS QS-103, SAME CONSTRUCTION AS COAT W/LEATHER

& SUSPENDERS

KNEES.

L



BID SUPPLEMENTAL FORM
OCONEE COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTHENT e

EQ‘I West glij__zl_Stréet

WALHALLA, SOUTH CAROLINA 29691

DATE __10/21/93 = | 'BID NO. '93-16

b B et W L R R s e

ITEM-BUNKER GEAR BAGS
R&B Fabrications #200MC EXTRA LARGE GEAR BAG
SIZE, 13.5 X 16 X 24 INCHES 5200 CU INCHES




BID SUPPLEMENTAL FORM
OCONEE COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTRENT e

1201 West Main Street

WALHALLA, SOUTH CAROLINA 29691

DATE _10/21/93 | BID NO.  93-16

ITEM-SALVAGE COVER, RED
FOL-DA-TANK 12'X18*' 18 0Z. VINYL



BID Np. 93-16
{Use this number omn
envelopes & all re-
’ lated correspondernce)
BID FORM
OCONEE COUNTY PURCHRSING DEPARTHMENT
291 WEST MAIN STREET
WALHALLA, 5.C. 29691
The Harold's Sales & Service Co. submits
herewith cur Bid in response to bid request number shown above, ard in
compliance with the description(s) and/or specification(s) attached hereto for
fire righting equipment for Rural Fire Department '
DUANTITY DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE - TOTAL
8 | Pairs Globe bunker pants......... teeieenn 135.90 1087.20
2 Pairs Globe bib pants w/suspenders....... 195.90 391.80
4 | pairs Globe bid pants w/suspenders Tan... 189.90 759.60
10 | Coats Globe - No Walkie Talkie pocket.... 242.90 2429.00
3 { Coats Short - Black NomaX.......... e 252.80 758.40
4 | Coats Globe Astra Tale...eeceann.. ereane 228.00 912.00
8 | Pairs heavy duty ALB Red suspenders...... 9.00 72.00
‘ 4 | Pairs reflective heavy duty suspenders... 15.50 62.00
13 | Pairs Ranger Driver Boots #5124.?&L14QZ.. 58.80 764.40
36 | Fire Dex flash hoods Nomax..ELRE=DEX ... 13.80 496.80
23 | Bullard helmebs ..o veveeeneenneneneennnnns 90.80 2088.40
76 Pairs gloves heavy duty.EIEETQEX.Qka.... 18.20 1383.20
100%{ Section of 5" hose w/storz coupling...... 620.00 620.00
7 | 23" x21" Swivel zip nuts - 21" female, 63.00 441,00
21" male..... Meeetcarvamnaanaan eeneseas
1 | Hydrant wrench set complete tripe holder 58.00 58.00
BEb.eeeerecntntancernanrrnarnacenannnna
2 21" Gate & Hydrant valve screw type...... 212.00 424.00
36 | Super Pass Alarm Model Sp1.....BALS .|, 108.00 3888.00
Akron Turbo Jet nozzle w/pistol grip..... 349.00 1047.00
Walk-away brackets for Scott Air Paks.... 47.70 190.80
1 Telescoplng halogen floodlight complete.. 290.00 290.00
4 Salvage cover — Red......... eriessacsaes 118.00 472.00
56 Bunker Gear BagsS....-.. et enaretenrranan 25.20 1411.20
TOTAL 20,046.80*
NOTE: AN ADDITIONAL DISCOUNT OF TWO (27%)
PERCENT MAY BE TAKEN IF ALL ITEMS ARE
ORDERED. _
*PRICES DO ROT INCLUDE §.C. SALES TAX




OCONEE COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID FOR: Carpet for LEC DATE: November 12, 1993
BID NO: 93-18 LOCATION: _ Walballa, SC - TIME: 2:00 p.m.
. BIDDERS Rollins Tilé & Land Construction
Carpet Co., Inc. Aesthetics

Whitten Carpet

Basze Bid - Carpet

installed 7,855.20 8,550.50 9,569.70
Cove Base 850.82 2,954.10 1,913.80 1,
o
RACES and two ‘ i
Dispactch rooms 349 .14 218,13 3487 .62
Cove Base hy -78 T7 .MD included (?) )
Grand Total 9,099.94 11,800.13 11,831.12
Proof of liability
ins. & workmen's yes yes yes

COMD

»

ATTENDING OPENING:

Marianne Dillard,. Ann Albertson - Purchas

ot

.
Tt

4

1ng; Lee Davis - Motor Pool



Bid shall include delivery to location stated on Bid Notice.

CiShow any exception, deviation, extra computation, or information on Bid

BID NO. 93-18

(Use this number on envelopes
and all related correspondences)

BID FORM |
OCONEE COUNTY .
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

201 WEST MAIN STREET
WALHALLA, SOUTH CAROLINA 29691

. ) .
The  Bollins e ‘:Qﬁuj@a;r

submits herewith ocur bid in respone to bid request number shown above, and in

compliance with the description(s) and/or specification(s) listed below for

1

.carpeting the .L.aw Enforcement Center

Base Bid - Q'O"“Plj' W Zla . $ ’)35.{0 30

Love Deae: 4" Vingl Cove Daae £ 8¢0.83 -
Dencludas Prapallahom + Setse Jon

Proof of general liability insurance and workmen's compenstion attached l/'

e o bo 1

Supplemental Form attached hersto.

Delivery Date: Aoprox. “ w@d_LS

BIDDING ORGANTIZATION: %OI\;:'\S Tlﬂ é‘ Ccd‘c:ej'

ADDRESS: P, 0. Box 21%

CITY, STATE, ZIP CODE: Nocms  SC  BUEDY

SIGNATURE OF BIDDERS REPRESENTATIVE: Q,,.W ipﬁf 1,,',“:,
TITLE: v

DATE: LWL-10-G2
TELEPHONE: (,29-21teY




£ BIp Hm, FA-1E
[ffep thisz numbe: omoanvalopes
m#"HJ and all pelztsd corraspondences)

BID TOEM .

SCONEE COUNTT
FURCHASTNG DEFARTMENT
201 WEST MAIN STREET
WALHALLA  SOUTH CAROLINA 23631

The gf)m&mmm{g@ )

submits herswith our bid Io respone to bid request ALmBEE shawn Ehove,

=nd 1T

ﬂﬁmpii&nfg WELR LhE dsagrintlnnﬁslzﬂﬂdfﬂﬂ seecilivationis; [lgbed below o

carpeting the Law Enforcknent Centar

¥ Bage Fid ) ] % g ﬁﬁg‘* T,
T 030 g g L. Labeo oy, gao+ 5°
tat, Egssp-Ie_

(Eﬂw.ﬂmu J?'L 'Luwg-b
5.6, Sades Ty ? L TR L
Joat Ba ded “;

Eroof of genstal Liabllity insurancs and workmen's cnmg}eneti:n atlaghed %g._l

?;. .;?15 sha%_ dnclode dﬂl ?EPH Eolaeatdon gizbes oo Bid Motdles.
i E“’h R
R 1 o aﬂyxexceptian ﬂE?iatian extre sompukaticn, o {nformation: oo Bid

Snpplamental Forsc attached nerzbo.

Delivepy Date: il -{.E:u. . A

BIDDING ORGANTZA _I_I
R .@Eﬂﬂmﬂws o s

Mm& S E.;r;?.:p 28
-'-‘-}3 " {*ﬂumirn*
- 543
g .85% A T
P I..:::.l_:_--... 1 &3 _.. ':??.2 _ ﬂﬂ,:?{;&,




BT SUPPLEMENTAL FORM.

DQCOKEE COUNTY
FURCHASINE DEPARTMENT

.2".‘!1 West “’.aTr‘l “‘-‘.rwﬂt.

AR L

WALHALLA, SOUTH CAROLINA 29651

'“ = paTE M l'l- jA- 493 BID M. 93-18
flcﬂqﬁﬁgwmﬁum_,l
%1 szﬁg"ftsﬂ_giug.gf $alo0

Bop ol den _laB5

[

Jetol B48 35

i N @
[ LQLEDE;E#" .
; , g 5 : i - :-.\I.-Ui}f'ﬂ—: "'.l;n'iu—i‘;'gi:’ ﬂ ;:.l | rE .|_— :

HﬂLE‘”'—dk S vk Aot # &




81D No. 93-18

(Use this number on envelopes
and all related correspondences)

BID FORM ‘l'

OCONEE COUNTY
PURCHASTNG DEPARTMENT
201 WEST MATN STRERT
WALHALLA K SOUTH CAROLYINA 29691

The

- submits herewith our bid in respone to bid request number shown above, and in

compliance with the description(s} and/or specification(s) listed below for

'carpétingrthe‘Law Enforcement Center

, _ - - .ffc’

Base Bid o | . s /{, Ly 2
A [+ecrafe [ALS on

Proof of general liability insurance and workmen's compenstion attached ?Q&S

hall include delivery to location stated on Bid Notice.

Show any exceptlon deviation, extra computation, or information on Bid

Supplemental Form attached hereto.

Pelivery Date:

BIDDING ORGANIZATION: thT(ZA! CAL‘JQ'J_( Z", "ﬁ &f
ADDRESS: P. O. BQXM_AM ér &&y 38

CITY, STATE, ZIP CODE:

rad 2969 L
SIGNATURE OF BIDDERS REPRESENTATIVE: k)
TITLE:

e _ Sl /]G3
TELEPHONE : & 3 E- E(é %




BID NO. 93-1%
{(Use this number on envelopes
and all related correspondences)

DID FORM

. ' ' OCONEE COUNTY

PURCIIASING DEPARTMENT
201 WEST MAIN STREET
WALUALLA, SOUTII CAROLINA 29691

The

submits herewith our bid in response to bid requést number shown above, and in compliance

wilh the description{s) and/or specificatlon(s) attached for sale and removal of

surplus used recapable tires

__DESCRLPTION
Tire Size Unit Tire Size Unit
P22570HR15. .. ... /2L - 1000R15 .. .uuuannns /- 0o
B-1U.5. il p SV P20575R . v nu... .. 0.50
(IR p: 3D 21565R15 e e e ennns b.30
. 31-10.50R15. ... 053 75022000 e eeennen. 0.23%
| 245-T5R16.. ... Y 950-16.5 100 nrenn . o 32
22575R16. ... ... 1p.5D 750161 ueennnnn /- 30
1000-20 . . . . .... J0-0) | BTSRI6.5.......... b.x0
1100R22.5....... 2500 T50m1T e s eeevaann & 2§
TIR2H .5 .. 23570 P1BSTSRIN .0 .eennns 0. 33
P17580R13....... 0.5 20570HR15..... eeee| D43
B78~13usuesrnens 030 1100R224 0 0ennsnsns 4,00
P22560VR15...... .30 385-65R22.5. ... - ]0.09
P23585R16.......| A 00 900.20, 1usnennenss /0.00
L21585R16....... ¢ XD 1100R20 . s evevnnns. 20. 00
P23570HR15. ... .. /00 P16580R134.0.... ..| & %o
P19575R14. ... ... + §0
., 10~50R15........| /-00
' 1000R20. . ....... 287 00

Bid shall include delivery to locatlon stated on Bid Notice. Show any exception,

deviation, extra computation, or information on Bid Supplemental Form attached hereto.

el tvary Toba



Specifications for Sale and Removal of Surplus Used Recapable Tires

Oconee County wishes to enter into a contract for the sale and removal of
surplus used recapable tires at the Oconee County Motor Pool. Contract peried
would be one year, with the option to renew for one additional year, upon
mutual agreement of both parties. Contractor shall come to the Motor Pool at
least once a month for removal of tires, with Motor Pool being notified the
day before. It is necessary to list price for each size tire, being that they
will vary from month to month. The following size of tires listed below would
be the approximate number of tires each month.

15 P22570HR15 2 P22560VR15 1 950-16.5

1 8-14.5 2 P23585R16 4 750-16

10 700-15 2 L21585R16 2 875R16.5

1 31-10-.50R15 2 P23570HR15 1 750-17

2 245-T5R16 - 2 P19575R14 1 P18575R14

2 22575R16 1 10-50R15 2 20570HR1S

5 1000-20 4 1000R20 2 1100R22

5 1100R22.5 1 1000R15 1 385-65R22.5

5 11R24.5 4 P2057S5R14 2 900.20
. 4 P17580R13 2 21565R15 6 1100R20

1 B78-13 1 750-20 2 P16380R13

Vendors check to be issued to Oconee County within three days of pickup.




