10.

11.

12.

OCONEE COUNTY COUNCIL MEETING

TUESDAY, February 04, 19%7
7:00 PM
Call to Order
Invocation
Approval of Minutes
Consideration of the Following ATAX Grants:
(a) Blue Ridge Arts Council in the Amount of $2,970

(b) Greater Seneca Chamber of Commerce in the
Amount of $4,700

{c) $300 for Postage & Office Supplies for the ATAX
Commission - Ms. Geri McSwain, Chairperson,
ATAX Commission

Consideration of Request for $3,000 to Assist with
the Arts in Education Program with the Oconee
County School System - Mr. Steven Brewer, Arts &
Historical Commission

Consideration of Bids for Radio Equipment for the
Sheriff's Office - Sheriff James Singleton & Ms.
Marianne Dillard, Purchasing Agent

Consideration of Bids for Rubber Tire Backhoe for
Road Department - Mr. Hoyt Orr, Road Supervisor &
Ms. Marianne Dillard, Purchasing Agent

First Reading of Ordinance 97-1, 11996-97
Supplemental Appropriations Ordinance" in title
only

Consideration of Selection of Engineering Firm for
Nason Co. - Mr. Robert Winchester, Sewer Commission
Superintendent & Ms. Marianne Dillard, Purchasing
Agent

0l1d Business

New Business

Adjourn



AGENTDA
February 4, 1997 - 7:00 pm
Page 2

There will be a Roads & Transportation Committee Meeting
Tuesday, February 04, 1997 at 4:30 pm in Council Chanbers,
208 Booker Drive, Walhalla, S8SC for the purpose of
continuing the discussion regarding the current road
ocrdinances, changes that might be made to these ordinances
and other business as necessary.

Prior to the regular Council Meeting at 7:00 pm there
will be an open meeting February 04, 1997 at 6:30 pm in
Council Chambers, 208 Booker Drive, Walhalla, SC for the
public to express their concerns to Council. Anyone
wishing to speak will need to sign in.



MEMBERS, OCONEE COUNTY COUNCIL i
Ms. M. Fran Burrell, District I
Mr. Harry R. Hamilton, District III
Mr. Charles R. "Chuck" Timms, District V g
MINUTES, OCONEE COUNTY COUNCIL MEETING ﬁ

The regular meeting of the Oconee County
Council was held Tuesday, February 4, 1997 at 7:00 pm in i
Council Chambers with all Council Members and the County f
Attorney present. o

Members of the press notified (by mail): b
Journal/Tribune, Keowee Courier, Westminster News, Anderson :
Independent, Greenville News, WGOG Radio, WBFM Radio, WCCP
Radio, WYFF TV, & SC Black Media Group.

- Anderson Independent, Terry Cregar Greenville News & Ashton

i
I
Members of the press present: Allison Glass %
. l
Hester - Keowee Courier. i

The meeting was called to order by Superv1soﬁi
- Chairman Orr who welcomed the guests and media. |

The invocation was given by Mrs. Hughes. 5

Ms. Burrell made a motion, seconded by Mr. i
Timms approved 5 - 0 that the minutes of the January 21, 1997 £
meeting be adopted as printed. i
Upon request of Ms. Geri McSwain, Chair- %

approved 5 - 0 that the attached ATAX Grant in the amount of
$2,970 and the attached ATAX Grant in the amount of %4,700 to
the Greater Seneca Chamber of Commerce s well as $300 for 7
postage and office supplies for the ATAX Commission be approved.;!

. ; I
person, Mr. Hamilton made a motion, seconded by Ms. Burrell, i

Item number 5 "Consideration of Request for |
$3,000 to Assist with the Arts in Education Program with the £
Oconee County School System" was withdrawn from the agenda. “

Upon recommendation of Sheriff Singleton & i
Ms. Marianne Dillard, Purchasing Agent, Mr. Thomas made a motlon”|
seconded by Mr. Hamilton, approved 5 =~ 0 that the bid for radio
maintenance for the Sheriff's bDepartment be awarded to Morris .
Communications, Inc. who was low bid at $10,976.80. (See i
attached bid sheet)

Upon recommendation of Mr. Hoyt Orr, Road
Supervisor & Ms. Marianne Dillard, Purchasing Agent, Mr. Timms |,
made a motion, seconded by Mrs. Hughes, approved 5 - 0 that the 5
bid for the rubber tired backhoe be awarded to Oconee Implement,j
Co., Inc. who was low bid at $45,799. (See attached bid sheet} |

Mr. J. Harold Thomas, Dls&rlct 11
Mrs. Ann H. Hughes, Dlstrlct v

Press

call to
Order

Invocation

Minutes

ATAX
Grants

Arts &
Historical

Sheriff
Radio
Maint-
enance

Road
{Backhoe)



Minutes, Oconee County Council Meeting
February 4, 1997 - 7:00 pm
Page 2

Mrs. Burrell made a motion, seconded by Mr.
Hamilton, approved 5 - 0 that Ordinance 97-1, "1996-97 SUPPLE-
MENTAL ORDINANCE" be adopted on first reading in title only.

Upon recommendation of Mr. Robert Winchester,
Sewer Commission Superintendent, and Ms. Marianne Dillard,
Purchasing Agent, Mr. Thomas made a motion, seconded by Mrs.
Hughes, approved 5 - 0 that the bid process be waived and the
engineering for the Nason Sewer Line be completed by Goldie &
Associates at a cost of $6,100 as per Section B. Formal Bid i
Process, Subsection 4. When in the Purchasing Agent's judgement,
and with concurrence of County Council, it is to the advantage :
of the County's interest to do so. ' !

Mrs. Hughes, Chairperson, Purchasing, i
Contracting, Real Estate, Building & Grounds Committee, informed
Council it was the recommendation of the committee that due to
possible legal problems the county not give a local vendor
preference and that the county proceed with a Request for
Information for a computer consultant to study the present
computer systems in the county and give the county an estimate i
for a system that would give the county departments the ability |
to "e" mail each other as well as access the Division of General |
Services. This recommendation was adopted 4 - 1 (Mr. Hamilton
voting against). §

Mr. Thomas, Chalrperson, Roads & Transportatﬂi

ion Committee, informed Council the committee had had their secoﬂﬂ

meeting, it was the goal of the committee to pave roadways to get
citizens out of the mud and to develop a plan that give people “
who buy lots in subdivisions assurance that the developer would |
pave the roadways to county specifications and not leave them ;
with the idea the roadway would be accepted by the county, when !
in fact they would not be county roadways. One of the ways this |
could be accomplished would be for the developer to put up a bondf
when the plat and covenants and restrictions are recorded at the N
courthouse. 1

Upon Mr. Timms inquiry, Mr. Orr assigned to |

the Personnel & Intergovernmental Committee the possibility of i
the county receiving proceeds from the video poker machines in |
the county. !
i

H

The Personnel & Intergovernmental Committee
scheduled a meeting Tuesday, February 11, 1997 at 6:00 pm in :
Council Chambers for the purpose of continuing the discussion |
. regarding persons who request to be notified of all Council ¥

'Meetings, to be placed on the agenda whether they choose to i
speak or not as well as proceeds from the poker machines.

Ord. 97-1

Nason
Sewer

Purchase
Recommend
=ation

Roads

Personnel
& Inter-

governmen
-tal




Minutes, Oconee County Council

February 4,

Page 3

1997 - 7:00 pm

Mr. Cain, County Attorney, informed Council

he would research an ATAX Committee member who has not been
attending the meetings can be removed as a member.

Mr. Hamilton made a motion,

Hughes, approved 5 - 0 that Mr. Ed Mize's resignation from the
Parks, Recreation & Tourism Commission be accepted and he be
sent a letter of appreciation.

Mr. Orr appointed Mr. Timms represent Oconee :|

County on the Heritage Corridor Board.

Mr. Thomas made a motion, seccnded by Mrs.

Hughes, approved 5 - 0 that Mr. H. Michael Willimon's
resignation from the Aeronautics Commission be accepted and
he be sent a letter of appreciation.

Mr. Orr informed Council of the death of

former Governor Carrol Campbell's father.

Mr. Thomas made a motion, seconded by Mr.

Timms, approved 5 - 0 that Council go into executive session
for a legal briefing.

County Attorney,

When open session resumed, Mr. Cain,
informed Council that he hoped to have a memo

before the next Council Meeting regarding the application of the
anti-nudity ordinance adopted by Oconee County as the State
Supreme Court had struck down Greenville County's anti-nudity

ordinance.

Adjourn: 9:15 pm

Submitted By:

Ot © Soree
Opal 0. Green
Council Clerk

Reviewed By:

Harrison E. Orr
Supervisor-Chairman
Oconee County Council

seconded by Mrs.3;

ATAX
Committee

PRT

Heritage
Corridor

Aeronautic

Death

Executive
Session

Open
Session

Adjourn




1-23-1997 2:43rM

K]

- A, ATAX funds rec

FROM TOWN OF SALEM 8649447795

QCIONEE COUNTY ATAX APPLICATION FQIIM

. FUNDS REQUE

B. ltemized budgel
C. Other funding?

Malching grants:

BpLiae RiLGe ArrS
Counc vi
STED

uested § 2970.00

for ATAX funds requested (allach on separate sheet)

- - Source;

Funds furnished by your organization:

Other funding sourpes and amourits:

Approximately $925

-0 -

Il NARRATIVE P!’{OJECT DESCRIPTION

A. Descriplion of Hrojecl

process of

Overview of the history of the milling

cotton Iiber into fabriec with svecial emphasis

on the ea

1y Uconee County mills and life at the mills

and in th

> mill towns.

B. Who will beneli

students

from projecl? _All citizens in Qgg,mgg: L‘"gu-gtz,

from publie and private schools and colleges,

businessels

and tourists.

ii. APF'ROX]MATﬁ

. DATES OF PROJECT | -

Beginning ApI

il 24, 1997 " Ending__ May 20, 1997

P.5



1-23-1997 Z:43PM

v

IV. APPLICANT
Governmen En{:‘
Non-profit Orgar
Eleermnosynary (

" V. DEMOGRAP|
How will the pro

dissemin:

rganiation under IRS Code: IRS #
Dale of Delarnjination Leller

FROM TOWN OF sal EM 8649447755

CATEGORY

ly: Cily County District
ization: [ncorporation date_ Mergh 31, 1970

IC DATA

ect influence tourism in Oconee County?___ Widely

ted nublicity about this unique historical exhibit

will attr

a¢t tourists to the area, expecially those who

are intef

ested in the history of the ares and historical sites.

| have read lfie

puidelines for the Oconee Counfy Accommeodalions Tax

Commitlee and o hereby agree (0 comply with all rufes and requirementts. |

undersiand fail

e {o comply may resull in a loss of funding for the projeci(s).

. Signature, 04' ced an L Zaé::-ﬁ;h:;m - Dale 4420_497

Tile! Y.,

S IO A s

Date %/;c;}w

‘Co-Signalure /}’u’("»/ b M‘/fi pA |

vi
Tilie 1} y g c-(ér

ig'\;’:ﬁ. s

FOR OFFICE USE ONLY:

Received by

Dale

Dale presented

Vole;
Recommendalid

at meeling
-or ‘
ns/Allerations:;

Agains!

Relurned {o or
Resubmilted to
- Corrections/del
Vole:

blions made:
For

nizalion (dale)
TAX

Agadinst

Comiments

" Date presented

Bid amouml

to County Council
Arnount approved

Presenter
Rejecled

(Revised 1/97)



A-23-1897 2:44PM FROM TOWN OF SALEM 8649447795

MILLS OF OCONEKE COUNTY
EXHIBIT
April 24 - May 20, 1997

BULGET
Exhibit Materials $ 1120.00
* puplicity 1350.00
* Rekeption/Guest Speakers 500.00
Total $ 2970.00

iy

* Zep attachments for details




A=23-1897 2:44PM

"South Ua
Hegionsa

"Mills of
SC Wele
Arts Co
attende

Invitatio
Printed

Postage
Invitat

Flyers an

FROM TOWN OF SALEM 8649447795

PUBLICITY

rolina Arts" - 1/2 page advertisement
). publication for SC, NC and Georgie

Jconee County" - brochure (2000 copies)
bme Centers, Chamhers of Commerce, SC
mnission members, BHAC mewbers, gallery
ps, ete.

33

iuvitations, envelones

ions, broclhures, posters, etc.

]l Posters

180.00

150,00

570.00
200.00

230.00
$ 1350.00



1-23-1997 2:44PM FROM TOWN OF SALEM 8649447795

RuCiuPTION AND GULST SPREAKBHS

Guest Speakers

Fritz |liamer, Chief Curetor of Cultural History,
Seuth [Carelina State Museum; Donna Roper, Assistant
Lirectior, Pendleton District Commission; Professor
B. M. jLander, Jr., retired, Clemson University

to ledture and conduct an open forum about mid-way
through the exhibit period.

Recention
There |[will be n private showing and reception for
honordd supporters and endorsers (approximately 100}
beford the exhibit ovens to the general public.




“Ocunec County Acco

J-23-1897 2:44PM

BLUE RIDGIE AR

INCOMUE

Graunls

SCAC General Suport
SCAC AL Grant
Schuul District AGL M
OCAILIC ALLl Matchir
Other AL Maiching 1
OCAIIC Salary Matcl
Dreylus Foundation

Membership
Donations
Educalion

Gallery

Fund Raisers
liziesest
Mourtgage licuiie
Qiber

TOTAL INCOME
LEXPENSE

Salaries

Denelils

Travel

Otlier, Lxeculive Dired

Facility Lxpense
Capital Improveme
Lquipient
Utilities
Maintenance

Gallery

fiducation -

AL Program
Classes

. Scholarships
Other

Publicity

Membership

Cominunity Outreach

Conumeicutiong

Fund Raising

Adminisiration
Postage
Telephone
lnsurance
Supplics
Memberships
Other .

TOTAL EXPENSLS

FROM TOWN OF SALEM 8649447795
ACTUAL & PROJECTED BUDGIETS

—

y COUNCH.

alching Fuuds
r Funds
unds

. Tax

ot

(s

1994-1995  1Y95-19%¢6

$2,383.00

$3,000.00
$2,000.00
$3,915.00
$4,710.00
$3,456.00
$2,945.00
34,985.00
$1,500.00
%535.00
$2,850.00
$2.000.00
$34,279.00

55,125.00
S387.00
$120.00

3v,681.00

$102.00
32,838.00
$1,368.00
37,1065.00

$2,385.00
$2,000.00
375.00

232
350.00
3684.00
3380.00

$422.00
$930.00
$1,213.00
$1,007.00
$115.00
245
$36,844.00

§4,275.00
$5,280.00
$6,000.00
$3,000.00
$1,560.00
$4,300.00
$5,000.00
$3,000.00
$5,000.00
F1,000.00
$3,000.00
$3,500.00
$14,000.00
$500.00
$2,796.00

- $2.00000
564,21 1.00

$13,000.00
$931.45
$150.00
$150.00

§5,125.00
$2,275.00
$2,800.00
$1,500.00
$4,800.00

$15,840.00
$3.000.00
$2,500.00
$150.00
$1,000.00
500
$100.00
$1,050.00
34,375.00

$500.00
$1,200.00
$1,306.00
$1,000.00
$170.00
208
$G4,190.45

1996-1997

$10,000.00

$5,500.00

$6,440.00
$3,000.00
31,560.00
$4,300.00
$5,000.00

$6.000.00
$1,500.00
$3,000.00
$3,750.00
$16,000.00
$800.00
$2.500.00
52,000,010
$71,350.00

$19,000.00
$1,361.35
$250.00
$250.00

$3,000.00

$500.09
$3,000.00
$1,500.00
$5,500.00

$16,500.00

$3,000.00

$4,500.00
$20Q.00
$1,000.00
500
$150.00
$1,200.00
$4,500.00

$500.00
$1,200.00
$1,400.00
$1,200.00
$225.00
1000
%71,436.35

e
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A=23-1997 2:45PM FROM TOWN OF SALEM 8848447795 P.11

. The Blue Ridge Arts Council
Out-of-State Gallery Visitoss
Jumwy 935 through May '96

Joan Butery, Kalpmazoo, MI

Ginny and Everclt Hanks, Brunswick, Maine
L. Cappiello, Calflfornia

Barbara Backer, Hanover, Mass.

V. James Santanigllo, [wde Islanl
Rolland Butler, gephyrhills, FL
Robert A. Cox, Toledo, O

‘Tom Healy, Saragota, FL

Mr. & Mrs. Frank Vass, Toledo, Ol
Bill & Helen Jackson, Scbastion, L
Virginia Polak, Gape Cod, Mass.

TilTany Bialos, Bradenton, FL
Sally & Dick Baker, Winter Parlk, FL

Rebeeea Sims, New York, NY
Doris Kaight, M|cingan
Eliot Marshall, LaPorte, PA
© Cardlyn Bigelow, LaPorle, PA
. Katliy Spong, St} Augusune, I'L
Mary Goeluke, Brooklicld, CT
‘Tracie Wood, Pliiladelphia, PA
Teresa Ward, Cliarleston, SC
Sally St. Claire, farasota, FL
D. W. Gulbeit, Hendersonvilie, NC
Eric Stein, Chur¢hvilie, NY
Georgia Holland| Colorade Springs, CO
Chasles Taddino] Pittsburgh, PA
Bob & Pam Ferguize, Augusta, GA
Virginia L Polak] New Orleans, LA
Alan Clements, Atlanta, GA
Belty & Bill Stich, Milwaukee, W
Ethel M. Kin, Mjchigan
Jo Haunon, Austin, T'X
Lourene Stapletoy, Grand Praiiic, X
_ Mary Lou Hawkfus, Scven Lakes, NC
Mirian Legghard, Prosperily, SC
Aurchia Horemas, Castonvile, MD
Joha & Amne [liacs, Athens, PA
Mural Rhiodenbgugh, Oregan, 1L
Ruth & Johu Roberts, Lynalield, MA
. : Louis Ruinrodt, Arlingion, VA
: Judy Seyton, Chaulotle, NC

e




J=23-1997 2.45PM FROM TOWN OF SALEM 8649447795

Jorge & Surah Beck, Marion, WY
Kathy Crain, Ycljville, AR

Clare Whitchousg, Adara, PA

Carol Scling, Doflestown, PA

Carol & Jell Tonps, N. Baitimore, MD
Marian & Kent 1airlane, North Port, FL
Bruce & Esther Prokkes, Clienmios, Mi
Ruth Elisworth, Silver Spring, MD

Pamela E Mortod, Lathrop Village, Mi
Gerlind & Emst Kraus, Dussclidorf, Germany
Mike Dalbert, Sacramento, CA

Maitha Bently, Plymouth, M1

Patricia Patrick, Cincinoati, Ol

Jackic & Tom Redding, Collingwood, Canada
Rachel Krashe, Hainicy, OR

Ann Culbertson, (CA

Rebecea Jones, Jacksonvile, IFL

Naucy Goodwin, Canadargua, NY

L. Christian, Elijira, NY

Ivan & Marianndg Richard, ML Awy, NC
Margarel Iinley,iLawrenceville, GA

Doris Kniglyt, St} Heiglts, Ml

Pat Mclwlane, (reen Bay, Wi

Patricia Rosman, M1

Jean Greenlioe, Ifurl [uron, Ml

Lstelle Gese, NY]
Mr & Mrs. Borden, Pocasset, MA

Lucie Vau Muellpr, The Netherlands

Sally St. Claur, Sarasota, L

Earl & Laurie Iigsser, Nashville, TN

Nancy & Randy Kenyon, Peterborough, NIi
Paul & Llicn Dolir, Royal Qak, Ml

Shirley Lipsey,
Barbara Evans,

Dcbbic Liiicoln,
Sallie Cleinet, Ruanoke, VA
Isabel Davis, Blug 11! Falls, MA
Jack & Pat Postld, Petroskey, M1
Peg Jeukins, Darign, CT

i

LI

.12
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Lucy Eler, 1

J-23-1997 2:46PM

Patl & Scott

Jo & Bob Bag
Jeaneile Adce
Lillian & Llza
Nathan & Co
IKen HHurst, Jo
Pamela Meuls
Cristenna Ml
Earime Philie
N. Davis, Mu
Ruth Poole, €
Doris Knight
Gail & Bill
Phil & Alice
Rachel Price,
Keith ‘Furticr

Dr. & Mus. }
Monoy & Ha
Mr. & Mis. C
Ruth Nixdori
Maynard She
Marge Daggq

FROM TOWN OF SALEM 8649447795

loore, uatington, WV

ct, Valley Forge. PA

ek, Toledo, O1l

Covert, Michigan City, IN
nelia Poselleton, Los Gatus, CA
rscy City, NJ

b, Lathrup Village, Ml

r, Mobile, AL

18, Mubile, AL

bife, AL

jrove Cily, PA

Sterding Hipts,, MI

bster, Rochister, NY

layer, West Bond, W1

Sussex, N}

Sussex, NJ

aleigh, NC

ebak, Decator, GA

vy Postle, Columbus, O
unuingha, Menden, CT
Mooteville, NC

psburg, GA '

1, New London, Wi

Judy Lec Walker, Piseatway, NJ

Catherine & 4
Deborah Biy:
Mr Laneman,
Steve Frenkel
Betty & Wari
Steplicn Nick
Joan Liesi, W]

In addition tu

Mic Code, Springfield, OLL
n, Johnson City, TN
Catonsville, M1}

L Roswell, GA

el Wiese, Lewiston, NY
es, llelton, NY '
hyzala, MN

the foregoing list, people visited the Gallery from all across Soutl: Carolina,

.13



January 13, 1997

ATAX Committee
Oconee County

Dear Committee Members:

Attached is a grant application for funding assistance to allow the Greater Seneca
Chamber of Commerce to sponsor the Jerry Rhyne Fishing Tournament this March. This
event has been held previously on Lake Keowee and has a very successful track record.
However, in the past this event has been sponsored by a small business person in the area
and the demands of this event have become too great for him to continue in a sponsoring
capacity. In turn, this individual approached the chamber in an effort to ensure this
worthwhile event continues.

After careful evaluation by the chamber board, it was determined that this event does
indeed promote the area and brings in quite a bit of business for local hotels, restaurants,
sporting goods and numerous other local businesses. On behalf of the Greater Seneca
Chamber of Commerce Board of Directors and its membership, I want to thank you for
your time and serious consideration of this grant request.

Sincerely,

Tim Pettit, President
Greater Seneca Chamber of Commerce

THE GREATER SENECA CHAMBER OF COMMERCE

P.O. Box 855, Seneca, South Carolina 29679, Phone 803/882-2097



Oconee County ATAX AppliICation

condact: S. J. Reidhead

8720 West Oak Hwy
Seneca, SC 29678
803-972-2146

DATE OF APPLICATION: _1-13-%7

NAME OF APPLICANT ORGANIZATION: Greater Seneca Chamber of Commerce

MAILING ADDRESS:P.0. Box 855, Seneca, SC 29679

CONTACT PERSON:Tim Pettit TITLE: President

OFFICE PHONE:882-2097 FAX: R82-2097 AFTER HOURS PHONE:864-269-7006
PROJECT NAME (7f applicable)_Jerry Rhyne Fishing Tournament On Lake Keowee

DATE EVENT WILL START:.3/21/97 END:_3/23/97 *Most Participants will arrive prior to 3/:
If there is no firm start/start date, please incfude the time frame of the project.)
APPLICANT CATEGORY: CITY:_ -~ GOVERNMENT ENTITY:_ COUNTY. _

NON-PROFIT ORGANIZATION: _X___ INCORPORATION DATE:_

IN ORDER TO FACILITATE THE APPROVAL OF THE GRANT, THE
FOLLOWING MATFRIAL IS REQUESTED: W&M

if this material is not included with the application.
A: ITEMIZED PROJECT BUDGET: Include the cost of the entlre pruject. ATAX

applications are dependent on county purchasing requirements for bids. You may
‘contact the county purchasing department for an explanation of policy. Most

. projects require 3 written bids. Please include copies of these bids with your
application or the application may be returned as incomplete.

B: APPROPRIATE DEMOGRAPHIC DATA: This data shouid reflect the impact of

visitors who are classifled as tourists. (4 tourist is anyone who travels at least
50 miles from their home or requires over-night accommodations.) Guest lists,
mailing lists, demographic studies are acceptable records.

C: ATTENDANCE FIGURES: Show percentage of local, out of state, and overnight
guest who will attend the event, or who have attended previous events. Priority

will be given if the project attracts.overnight guests.

D: MATERIALS FROM PREVIOUS FUNCTIONS; Balance sheets, flyers, promotional

materials, newspaper articles or any other pertinent materials pertaining to this
request,

E: CURRENT FINANCIAL HISTORY of your organization is mandatory. if your

organization is non-profit, the annual reports and audits provided to the IRS
would be appreciated.

ATAX FUNDS REQUESTED:$4,700

ITEMIZED BUDGET FOR ATAX FUNDS REQUESTED: (attach on separate sheet)
HOW FUNDS WILL BE USED: ATAX Funds Will Be Used For Tournament Fee, Postage,
And Materials For Temporary Stage.

FUNDS: MATCHING GRANTS: SOURCE:

FUNDS WHICH WILL BE FURNISHED BY YOUR GROUP:_All Other Costs Not Donated/In-Kind
. OTHER FUNDING SOURCES: Sale Nf Ads Far Pramational Brochure To Mail To Particinants

DESCRIPTION OF PROJECT: Put on the 1997 ,_‘[egrgeg Rhyne glshmg Tournament_on Lake Keowee,
This southeastern bass circtiit attracted 500 participants for last year's event.




1997 Jerry Rhyne Fishing Tournament Proposed Budget

ITE

Tournament Fee

(payable to Jerry Rhyne’s
Bass Circuit)

Seven Complimentary Rooms
For Circuit Staff & Judges
(rooms are for two nights each
with two rooms for 3 nights)

Stage For Tournament Weigh-In

Pontoon Boat For Check-In
Staff Of Eight To Assist With
‘Weigh-In Each Day

Indoor Facility For Initial

Registration

Information Packets For
Tournament Participants

Postage For Mailing Packets

TOTAL

$800 (based on $50/night standard fee)

$200 (trailer + materials for
backdrop/stairs)

$240 (based on 6 hours at $40/hour)

Will Use Volunteer Labor (approx.
in-kind value of $160 based on min.
wage for 32 hours)

$50% 1 O°
$650
$500 (First Class Rate For 4 Ounces)

$6,440



DEMOGRAPHIC/ATTENDANCE INFORMATION

This event has been held previously and has attracted 500 participants each time. These
participants come from as far away as Massachusetts and Florida (please see attached list
furnished by Jerry Rhyne - the actual addresses are considered confidential so he only
supplied us with the state that the participants are from). In addition to the actual
participants, numerous individuals who follow professional fishing also attend the weigh-
in of the tournament each day (these individuals come from the local area and do not
require hotel accommodations). You’ll also find attached a letter from the Days Inn of
Seneca who informed us that all motels in the area are fuil with participants the week of
the tournament. They have also included the states where their guests are from during
the tournament week. Fishermen are allowed to practice fish the lake a few days ahead
of the tournament so most are in the area for the better part of the week.



Jerry Rhyne
The Fishermans Bass Circuit

PO.Box 1111
Denver, N.C. 28037
Telephone: (704) 483-9335

September 3, 1996

Dear Tournament Host:

Enclosed is the contract for the 1997 season for THE FISHERMAN'S BASS CIRCUIT
TOURNAMENT to be held on your lake, One of the changes in the contract, you will
notice, is the cost has been increased to $4,000. We regret we must pass along this
increase but our cost of operation continues to rise and this slight increase will help to
offset our expenses.

Assuming these dates and the contract are satisfactory with you, please sign and return
one copy as soon as possible.

Thank you for your past participation and we look forward to bringing our circuit to your
community again.

incerely Yours,

Jerry Rhyne
President



TOURNAMENT CONTRACT AGREEMENT

Dear Tournament Host:

We wish to take this opportunity to thank you for consenting to be the tournament host for The
Fisherman's Bass Circuit tournament on Keowee Lake. The tournament dates are March 22 & 23,
1997 with the three preceding days as practice days.

The following are the tournament host responsibilities:

1. $4,000. cash {to be paid in full on March 23, 1997).

2. Seven complimentary Motel Rooms for two nights each. (March 21 & 22). One room will be
designated for a late check-out on Sunday. Two only comphmentary rooms will be furnished on
Thursday March 20, 1997.

3 . A stage at the tournament weigh-in site. This may be a flatbed trailer with two sets of steps.

4. Electrical power at the weigh-in site.

5. A minimurn of six volunteers to help at the weigh-in. They must be available from 2:30 p.m. on
Saturday until 5:30 p.m. and on Sunday 1:30 p.m. until 4:30 p.m. These folks wil! help with various
jobs including putting live fish back into the lake. Qur live fish release rate is better than 90%.

6. An indoor facility capable of seating 350 people for the Friday evening registration and meeting.
Must be available from 3:00 p.m. until 9:00 p. m.

7. A backdrop for the stage consisting of 4 2x4's 12 feet long and 2 shests of 4x8x1/2 plywood.

8. A pontoon boat to be used as a check-in boat. This boat should be available from 2:30 p.m. to
4:30 p.m. on Saturday and 1:30 p.m. to 3:30 p.m. on Sunday.

We very much appreciate the support you are extending to The Fisherman’s Bass Circuit and its’
fishermen.

NOTE: SUBJECT TO ADDITION AGREEMENT ATTACHED

AGREED BY:
THE?ingMANS BASS CIRCUIT SENECA CHAMBER OF COMMERCE
/uuﬁ% lup BY: gr—ml} /gmﬁ?«f—ﬂ

TITLE: _M@f TITLE: g///ZZM'fZ/W/Q

.DATE: é‘f 6, 9% oate, fletie— 2, /996

VALID ONLY IF ADDENDUM

IS EXECUTED.
(Page 1 of 2)
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IN ADDITION TO ITS NORMAL RESPONSIBILITIES OF ORGANIZING AND
OPERATING THIS TOURNAMENT, THE FISHERMAN'S BASS CIRCUIT AGREES
TO THE FOLLOWING CONDITIONS.

1. Immediately furnish the Seneca Chamber of Commerce a
breakdown of last year's participants by city and state
(Names and street addresses are not required.)

Note: You had originally agreed to do this in a recent
telephone conversationm.

2. The Seneca Chamber of Commerce will prepare a printed
program and furnish the Fisherman's Bass Circuit enhough
copies for all participants. These copies will be in
mailing condition with postage attached., The Fisgherman's
Bass Circuit agrees to affix mailing labels and send then
to all participants at no additional cost to the Seneca
Chamber of Commerce. It is the Chamber's intent to send
these copiegs to you in late February by United Parcel Service.

AGREED BY:
THE HERMAN ' SBASS CIRCUIT SENECA CHAMBER OF COMMERCE
/ ’ .
\ S - 4
BY: Xﬂ' /%ﬁ‘ BY: MW*“}
7 i ,,v@ 3
TITLE: ﬂW TITLE: @w%

DATE: _ﬁo/’;ﬁ%) ‘?j/?%’ DATE: MZZ/‘?,/?%

We gill funod #/ by Jilifn 7, 1196

{(Fage 2 of 2)
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DAYS TNN OF SENECA
119135 RADID STATION ROAD
SENECA, ©C 29678
(864) 883-0710

Janpuary 18, 1997

TC: TamM PETTIY
SUBJECT: BRASS FISHINDG TOURNAMCNT
M. DPpttit:

We have been the host motel to the bass fishiny tournasent for the past
seven (7)) years.,

We are full tor the whole week as are other motels im $he surrounding
area. It brings additional revenue to us, other mntels and varlious
bugsinesses in the area.

He appreciate their business and enjoy seeinp the familiar faces that
come back to us fach year.

We start taking reservations for this tournament as early as six (&)
months prior to the week they come in,

Many of the states from which the fishermen come are listed belowt

South Maralina
North Carolina
Geowrgia
Tennessee
Kentucky

DOhia

Indiana
Maryland
Virginia
Rlabama
RArkancae

If 1 can be of further asscictance, please call nme.

Sinecerely,

ey # Groren

MRRY BRACE
GENERAL MNNAGER



LAKE KEOWEE 1996

2sﬂcARLTON T-WELLS, J AL

129

CASH, M - HARRISON, R S0

30

CHAMBERS, R - THOMAS, G A/

132

31

CHANDLER, M - KIMBRELL, C s(-

CHAPPLE, P-JACOBS, J AL

33

CHEROS, G - COOPER G scC

34

CHUMLEY, T-FOSTER,S 44

35

CLARK, T -WILBANKS, M__ ¢4

36

CLAYTON, C-CLAYTON,J A/C

37

CoBB,K-COBB, L gC

38

COLLINS, K - SATTERFIELD, M£,

39

COLLINS, S-HANLEY,P &4

40

COMPTON, G-DUPREE, B wNC-

41

CONKLIN, D-GRIFFITH.E sC 1

42

NAME BOAT]:
MARCH 28, 1996
1 |ADAMS, J-WHEELER M ___ &4| X
2 JAILOR, B - MAULDIN, M TA | X
3 |ALLARD, L-KANE, 4 5] X
4 ALLEN, P-BUCHANAN.E 47| X
5 |ALVERSON, G - BRADY, B X
& |ARMSTRONG, S - HOSMAN, D <c.JFX
7IAXSOM J-JOY. D gLl X
8 |AYERS,S-UPE.F . AZl X
9 [BAILEY,A-YOTHER. R 7#| X
10_BAILEY.R - DEAKINS,M_____A/C1 X
11 BARTON, J-MADISON, J __4/.] X
12 |BEATTIE, A JR. - BEATTIE, ASR. | X
13 BERGER, G - SLATTON. B 74| X
114 |BLACK W-SWINDLE, J _A/T X
115 BOLAND, T- ABERNATHY, D 641 X
18 |BOLES,C-ODELLLH____ J# | X
47 BOOTH J-BOOTH,D 77/ | X
18 [BOYD, R~ LEDFORD. H__ AL X
19 [BRANNON, B-LEE, J.C. €A | X
20 [BREWER M -WHITMIRE, J_ ¢ | X .
[21 BROCK, R - BARTLEY, S 4| X
22 'BROOKS, B-HEARD. T~ &p | X
23 'BROOKS, B-JAMES. 8§ Sc_ | X
24 BROWN, N-FLANDERS, J &4 | X
25 BROWN, T-BROCK.L __%c_1 X
[26 [BURGESS, R-SNYDER W_ AL X_|
27 1BUSH, G -MCGUIRE, € $C. ] X
x .
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X

CORDELL, J- JENNINGS, F_& 4

KEQWEE 1996



COUNTS, J - BLACKSTON, C 4

43 X
44 [COWART, L-PONDER, R | X
45 |COX K-CHAMBERS, J 5G| X
46 |CRAIG, J-MELLONS. M 74/| X

@ <7 [CRIDER J-MCINTOSH. I 4~ X
48 [CROMER. R - CANTRELL, 444 X
49 [CRONIC, T-HOBBY, D Z4 | X

{50 [CRUELL, 5 - JOHNSON, J 5] X
51 [CURRY, C-TALFORD, R~ A€ X
152 [DANIEL, C-FLACK J AL X
53 DAVIS, C-DAVIS,M 4.1 X
54 [DEARTH, K- PADGETT. K CA1 X
{55 [DOBSON, A - BERTRAM, J _ G 4| X
56 [DODGENS, W -ROACH.E _5¢C. | X
57 |DOVER, R-DUNCAN, T ___&5(. | X
58 [DREW, 4-YOUNG.D NG| X
50 [DREW. M-COZART.R ___NC | X
|60 |DRUMMOND, T - DRUMMOND, D X
61 [DUCKETT, B - DUCKETT.E AL | X
|62 IDUNCAN, B JR - DUNCAN, B SR&_X
|63 JDUNN, R- HOLCOMBE, D __§C | X
|64 IDURBIN, L- MURRAY, J _ <¢, | X
JE5 [EAKER A-GRAHAM,D __ WC. | X
'66 [FAULKNER, B - RODGERS. C SC| X
167 [FORRESTER. G - WOODALL, 8 L4 X
166 [FOSTER, G-EVATL,P__ &( | X

@ 52 -0x% J DICKERSON. P s | X
{70 FREE, F-JARRARD.T _ £.4 1 X
71 |GARNDER, C - EDWARDS_ R £ X
72 IGIBSON, M-PERRY, A 50 | X
73 [GUBERT, G-HILL,d 5G| X
74 [GLENN, W - ROCHESTER, L 40 X
{75 |GOOCH, J-GOOCH.M___ 4 | X
76 |GRAHAM, R - MCCORMICK_ M AL X
77 [GRANGER, W-WYATT,. R _ <[, | X
178 |GREENE, H- PRICE.R ALz7x | X
79 /GUICE, D - BAYNARD. M NC | X
80 [HALBERT,D - HENDRIX. P 4C | X
81 |HAMBY, C-MOORE, T <¢. | X
82 HARDIN. M-MARKS. P Z.4 | X
83 [HARMON, T-GOBLE,J A/ | X
84 |HARPER. - OSHIELDS, P AZ] X
85 JHARRISON, C - MCINTOSH.K /| X
86 HARVEY K-BAKER.F___ SC.| X
87 [HAVENS, R - FESPERMAN, L 57| X
88 [HEISLER,. R-COOK,.H ___ SC.| X
89 X

HESTER, C-DILL, D hid

KEOWEE 1986




BOTHICKS. §-GILEEY € AC

o

g1 [HINTON, D-LAFAVE,§ &4

92 HIPPS, R-WATKINS, T 4

93 HOLBROOKS, D - CAMPBELL, K 4|

\F

84 [HOOPER, K-HUBBARD, J /4

95 [HORTON, D-HORTON, C 74/ |

{96 [HOWELL, R -BINGHAM, H " A{/

97 HUFF, W-HILL, L

{99 HURLEY, G~ CALBAUGH, J 7/
H100HUTTO, K- HUTTO, P _GA |

X
66 [HUNTER, § -MARCH, A ___ N

101IDDINS, K - SILVERA, R 7

1102INGLE, V - BUMGARDNER, D 77

103JAMES, K-WELBORN, R - &,

- |108JONES, R-ELDER, J AC

" [{10KENNEDY, M- SIMS, C Ty
[{11KIMBRELL, E - KIMBRELL, S _4C.
[{12KIRTLEY, B-LEWIS,. B &4
{13KNIGHT, J-KNIGHT, L GA-
" M14KNOX, J - KNOX, R 5C
-[115LAIRSON, M- LAIRSON, M__SC_

104JENT, H - JENT, D 4/

105JOHNSON, J - JOHNSON, C ¢

107|JORDAN, B - JORDAN.M 4/

108KELLEY, T - DURHAM, L sC

[MO9KENNEDY, D-BEANE,D - A/C 1

116LAMOUNTAIN, R - RUDISILL, L AVZ

- {1117LANCASTER, M - LANCASTER,

[118LAND,M-HICKS,B G4
- [119LATIMER, J -LADSON, J_____ 4/
- [120LAWSON, D - KIRK, D &4

" H21(EE B - SEAWRIGHT,.M A |

- {122LEIGEBER, R-HYDER, B___#4¢
- [123LEONARD, J - BROOKSHIRE, G
- {124LESESNE, J - GASAWAY, R &/
={128LESHOCK, J - BAUMGARDNER, C
"> H28UINK, R - FREEMAN, D ey
. [127LOCKWOOD, B - COLLINS, R ¢ %
i {128LOVELACE, G - BULLMAN, D AC
- [129LOWE, M - ELKINS, G VC,
. 130LYNN, § -LYNN, D 4L
5 [131MARCENGILL, L - JONES, K &(]
. [{32MARTIN, RALPH- ¥

. [135MCCALL G-BENTLEY R~ 4(.

DI R DK 3D 2K DR DK 2K D[] 2D 91 2| 2 DL | 2L D[ e 2] D K] ¢ ¢y X

133MATHERLY, J - QUALLS, L. 74/

- [134MATHEWS, R - SWAYNGIM, T V(|

DI X KX X

 |138MCCOLLUM, J- TINDLE, R__"4( |

KEOWEE 1996




137]MCJUNKIN, M - BROOKS, C  5C

138MCLAIN, J-LADD, J AL+ 72/

39MEALOR, C-BISHOP, T ¢4

140MEDLOCK, R - HUNTLEY, T 5C

. 141MELTON,.D-DAVIS D 54

{142MILLER, T-HARVILLE K~ 74/
143MINK, R - LEE, § -

144MOODY, L - CAMPBELL, B G A

145MOORE, D- FRAISER, D s(C .

146MORGAN, A -KEITH, K 7, N[ A

147MURPHY, J- MASSEY, R A

14GNEAL, D-NEALJ (4

149NICHOLSON, G - KEYLON, K ¢

150NICHOL, D-BOWMAN, R &4

151|NOLAN, J - NOLAN, M

152NOWELL, T - GAINES, L §C.

1530DELL, C-ODELL R . 7A/

1840LIVER, M- ARLEDGE, D §C

1550SHIELDS, K- MULL.A__ A7,

156PACK, T-STOVER, B 4¢

157PADGETT, J - VAUGHAN. T ¢ A

158PARKER, D - JACKSON, M 5¢,

1159PARKINS, J-HILL A SC

J160PATTERSON, G-GWINN, R s

161 PEARSON, E - PEARSON, D A/C

[162PEARSON, L - PEARSON, H <
@ is:rciERS J-WITHROW.E 7

1164PICKENS, E - WALKER, T 74/

ME6SPORTER, D -TENCH, D -~ 4(

1166PORTER, J -~ JEFFRIES, B £ 44A7

167PORTER, J - WELLS, R NC

168PRESNELL, R - BIGMEAT, R A/ .|

169PRICE, H - SMITH, J &L
170RAMEY, N-BRIDGES,J  <C
171RAPER, J-HICKS,D = &a

172REEVES, E - REEVES, M ¢s(

173REEVES, M- WOODY, C 4.4

174RICKER, K-BURGESS, G 4(-

(178RIDENQUR, K - NUCKOLS, J 74/

176ROACH, G-BRYANT,J ~ ¢

M77TROACH, R - GRAHAM L 5

178ROBBINS, M- CAMPBELL, § §C

17 ROBERSONLD KEMMONS B ot

HBOROBINSON, € - PARKER, _G AC

181ROBINSON, D-SMITH M SC-

iy

{82ROBINSON, E - MANGRUM, J 72/

XKXXXXXXXXXX><><><><><><><><><‘><><><><><><XXXXXXXXXXXX-XXXXXNXX

184ROBINSON, R-KING, L~ A

'KEOWEE 1996




 [184ROBISON, J - MACE, R

_ X 3¢,
{185ROGERS, D -WHITFIELD, C X [
186ROPER, C-KING,.E X [ S
187RULE, K- COULTER, K X | TW
@ [155RUNMLER, M - STEPHENS, A X | SC.
1189SABREE, P - GAMBREE, B X | =
190 SATTERFIELD, M- MADDOX_ 8 X || GR
191/SAXON, D -DUNCAN, K X [ <
{192SCALISH, F -ARMSTRONG, T | X || &Yr /NC_.
{193SCHRADER C-PINKSTON,E | X |'my\ 7
[194S8CROGGS, T-NEALD =~ | X [[ &R
195SHERIFF, K - LANGLEY, R X [ &A-
196SHOUP, R-LEONARD, R | X [ &P
197)SIMS, R-HUGHES,D =~ | X %, -
1198SITTON, B-FISHER. J -~ | X [ AJT
1199SIZEMORE, C-SHELTON, J | X | AJIC.
200SMITH, K-SMITH. P~ I X || Kir
2011SMITH, M- JETER, S -~ X I sC
202SMITH, M-RHYNE, T. =~ ' X Sc
203SMITH, M - SMITH, V X 1 3¢
204SMITH, R - GREGORY, C I X S
[205SOSEBEE, K - SOSEBEE, M_ [ X[ =
|206STACY, H-LEER =~ T X | &G&
207/STAMPS, J - S!NGLETON,E X I Sc.
O8STANSELLM-DUKE P~ | X | SS¢. &1
ﬁogsmmme R-LEWIS, D X I 1+A)”
210STOGNER, A-HOLCOMBE, R | X || S¢_
|211STRADER, W-STRADER, B | X TN
212STREETER, F - WILLIAMS, B X L
13STRICKLAND, B - STRICKLAND, R X || SC.
1214STRODEL, R -STEVENS, T X T MA
215STROUP, € -STROUP, G X | AfC
216SUTTON, R-REVIS,R X Al
217SWANGIM, R - MEDFORD, J X A/
2185WINDLE, G - MCCOMBS, J X AL
219TAPP, R - HUNNICUTT, J X I BC
220TERRY, M - OLIVER, L X | s,
224 THIGPEN, D - THIGPEN, J X B
222 THOMAS, B - SMITH, E X [ o9
223THOMPSON, M - EXLINS, D X | AL
224THRIFT, M - WILBANKS, D X | <.
225TILLEY, M- CANNON, A X AL
296 TILSON, S-HENDERSON.T 1 X | AL
R27TRAYNUM, F-MARTIND | X [ 3SC
228 TUCKER, C - TAYLOR, J X 1 NC
229 TULAUSKAS, V-HAMBY, R X C
230TURNER, T-BOST,. T X s5C

KEOWEE 1996




?53"1“2311Tmsfv """" ¢ TN
EEWMD.L UNDERWOOD, K

IZWALKER, W - TEAGUE, R

;o I

- 23EWALLAGE, R - WOWARD, T

ST K-STEVENS. D

Z:E ILEA.HHE 3 -CANN, B
- ZITWILCOX, J - HORGE, . -I-

F o= et ot e L

:

B e

\I"ﬁ MON, G - WILLIMON, B

. [ZA0WILSON, A-DOYS A

*" EHHHELEGH B-WILEON M

- [PAZMILEON, G - SATTERFIELD. 8

SR

b;'!{:ib_-ﬁ

mehﬁxnnnuﬂﬁmhxx

]

: RAIWILSON, W - HALLET D -y
ﬂmnﬂnmn G-LEE & . .
245WO0DY, 8. MALDNEY B ,3{;1 g& T
WOOD, G - ATKINS B A
ZATWYATT, R - ‘n»:srei-f.:_:,}_fgL H e e e

(A

3=

4, __ J! ?'. s ‘;.!-.l, 'E,J-\_n'\- et g
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January 23, 1997

*%% FAX MEMO ¥

To: Opal Green
Oconee County Council Office

From: Steven Brewer . .
Oconee County Arts & Hisgtorical Commigsion

Re: Funding requests

Dear Ms. Green,

I am faxing you a c¢opy of the Oconec County Arts & Historical Commission's
minutes for October 15, 1856. At this meeting the commission recommended
that three projects receive funding from the Performance Funde in the
Arts & Historical Commission budget.

. Once this type of action wae taken by the Commission, Mr. Hestarbery
would talk care of the filing process and insure that the grant monies
were issued. Unfortunately since Mr. Hesaterberg's death the Commisgeion
iz a little in the dark as to what has been completed and what the
proper proceedures are for requesting these funds. I appreciata your
assistance in assuring that action is taken on thece requests.

Please give me a call at 882-2080 if you have any quastions on these
minytes or if I can be of any assitance.

S8ifcerely vours,

LT L ——

_"Steven Brewer, Secretary
Oconee County Arts & Histerical Commission

page #1 of 2 pages
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@ O CONEE < OUNTY
POST OFFICE BOX 217

WALHALLA, SOUTH CAROLINA 2969
@RTS & ﬂ'ISTORICAL
< OMMISSION

In attendanca: Steven Brewer, Stan Cappiello, Shirley Carter,
Ernst Hesterberg, Gay McCord and Mary Simpson.

October 15, 1996

The meeting was called to order at 5:04pm by Chairperson Hesterbery.

Minutes of the last meeting were distributed, motion by cCappiello to
accept as written, seconded by Simpson, motion carried.

Hesterberg reported that the budget that was submitted to County Council
was approved. The only change in the 1996-%7 budget, as compared t¢ the
1995-96 budget, was an increase for the Cconee Community Theatre's building
fund from $2,000 to $5,000.

. Hesterberg presented the following three requests for funding:
(1} The Oconee Community Theatre requested assistance with their Youth
Theatre Program. Theatre classes for Oconee County Students in grades
4-8 are now being held on Tuesdays for beginners and Thursdays for
advanced students. The Theatre currently has 10 students that heed
financial assistance to attend these classes. Also, due to a decrease
in funding from the SC Arts Commission, help is needed with the
gperating expenses. A letter wags received from Sybil Miller, the youth
Theatre coordinator, regquesting a $1,000 grant from the OCA&HC.

(2) Chris McPhail with the Greater Seneca Chamber of Commerce reguested
help for Oconee Country Christmas on Saturday November 8, 1996. They
have two bands performing at the festival, 4-0f-A-Kind and the

Bad Creek Band. Ms. McPhail was requesting $500.00 to cover the cost
of the Bad Creek Band.

{3} Blue Ridge Art Council reguested $3,000 to assist with the Arts in
Education (AIE) program that they administer in conjuntion with the
Oconee County School System. This program funds arts workshops for
all county schools.

Cappielln moved that all threc of these regquests be approved and funded
out of the Performance Funds, McCord seconded, motion carried.

The meeting was adjourned at S:24pm.

.2e ectfully,

Ctrmln Learme
Steven Brewer, Secrestary




Uecones County Arts & HMistorical Commission
Fiscal 199&4— 1997 Budget Explanations

Accounts Explanation

00120 & QL3O
These arg salary % fringg benetlt accounts tar
staff at the Lunney Muaseum. We have not indicatsad
a salary increase since we understand that she
will be included in any general cost of living
increases awarded to county emplovees.

DOLSO—-00018
This account covers travel aut of county for
commission members. Such travel is desirable or
Mecessary to attend varicus conferences or to visit
the South Caroclina Arts Commission in Columbia.

DOLISO-000E2
Covers opsrational costs such as supplies and
printing costs associated with publicizing
parformances etc.

..'50150“000313

Thig item covers postage costs to mail meeting
minutes and neotices and to mail publicity releases
to various organizations.

QO 1S50=--000G41
This item covers telephone costs for members to
carry on the operations of the Comnmission.
Inciudes cost of contact with SBouth Caralina Arts
Commission and with various #Artists to book
performances.

GOLEG-QO850
Covers cost of Capital improvements to the Lunney
Mussum, a county owned building. A separate list
in priority order will be supplied to the
Comptrollier by the Lunney Museum

OD150-42501 _
Thaese funds are used to hire performing artists.
aé‘ ;ﬂ ¢¢r!4 T These pertarmances can he given in the schools, in
! ;%%public places at no cost, or in public fund raising
At rors pralicde events to benefit the various Art organirations in
- Z ; [ %% the County, Since we have not applisd to the state
ﬁfk"4 4%;4‘ for grant funds you may wish te change this

account & to L2500,
OOLEC-&R510 _ O O 0 0 n 6
These funds are used to cover specific proliect
costs which bhenetit various Art organizations in
tha County. Fast projects have included twition
costs for candidates to the Governor™s School +or
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K January 22, 1987 Bid Tabulation - Radic Equipment for Sheriff's Dept. Bid No!@g
Walhalla, SC 20691
Mortis | Communication 1
|BIDDER Communications,Inc Svc Cenler, Inc. Motorola, Inc.
QrY DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE  |[TOTALPRICE [UNIT PRICE [TOTALPRICE [UNITPRICE {TOTALPRICE
12!Motorola HT-1000 radios 690.00( $ 8,280.00 73588 % 8,830.586 793.001 ¢ 951600
12Motorola H437 chargers 50.00 600.00 48.00 576.00 51.00 612.00
12|H314 leather cases 38.00 456.00 32.00 384.00 34,00 408.00
12|NMNB193 remote microphones 75.00 900.00 67.00 804,00 70.00 840.00
12|NTN belt clips , 10.00 120.001 -  11.00 132.00 0.00
Sales Tax 517.80 536,33 568.80
Shipping 103.00
Total $ 10,976.80 $ 11,262.89 $ 11,944.80
Delivery Date 3 weeks 3 weeks 1-2 weeks
UHF UHF UHF
—
Attended Opening: Marianne Dillard, Ann Albertson - Oconee County, Jim Cobb - Communication Sve Center




BID NO. 26-39

{Use this number on eavelopes and
all related correspondence.) .

BID FORM
OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
201 W. MAIN STREET, WALHALLA, SC 29691

The

submxts heremxh our Bid in response to bid request number shown above, and in complmnce with the

. ' Description
12. | Motorola HT-1000, HOISDC9AA3-N portable, 16 channel, VEF (4 HF

radios to inchude whip antenna, high capacity NTN-7144 battery 78 W
93, a0 IRAJABC

12 Motorola H437 compact rapid chargers
Fd

| 12 H314 Swivel leather cases with belt loop

i2 NMNG6193 Remote speaker microphones

12 NTN Belt clips

S. C. Sales Tax (5%) .
5’&“‘ Dt estr
TOTAL ¢

Above shall include programming. Frequencies to be provided later.
Number of radios may vary depending on availability of funds.

Bid shall m¢hide delivery to location stated on Bid Notice.

Show any exception, deviatior;, extra computation, or information on Bid Supplemental Form attached
hereto.
Delivery Date: 3 M?geé-{ 'l(:?QM w.

Bidding Organization: W(a 2RI 5 omiion oo S any
Address: TES /1)ﬁﬁo£)eg Lp /@.—J ke cnner e =<
Signature of Bidders Representative; %4& o{. /é, ee® S

Tt £, /. ,}4 o Date; 11507

Telephone: / PO ~PLY L SZT

RADIOBD - 2
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BID NO. 96-39

(Use this number on envelopes and
all related correspondence.) .

BID FORM
OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
201 W, MAIN STREET, WALHALLA, SC 29691

The Lnsuan o rceAton Serpice Lentor T
submits herewith our Bid in response to bid request number shown above, and in comphance with the
description(s) and/or specification(s) listed below for rad
Dgg&en;

Qty. Description
12 Motorola HT-1000, HOISDC9AA3-N portable, 16 channel, VHF
radios to include whip antenna, high capacity NTN-7144 battery

738,84 8¢ 25.¢ ]

12 Motorola H437 compact rapid chargers
k8. 04 | S7b.02

3d.00 | I8 g

12 H314 Swivel leather cases with belt loop

12 NMN6193 Remote speaker microphones
£7.00 804.00

12 NTN Belt clips

Nps |12
| 8..C. Sales Tax (5%)
§36.23
TOTAL
126,49

Above shall include programming. Frequencies to be provided later.
Number of radios may vary depending on availability of funds.

Bid shall include delivery to location stated on Bid Notice.

Show any exception, deviation, extra computation, or information on Bid Supplemental Form attached
hereto.

Delivery Date:_J lew K¢ AFTER LPRPEXR

Bidding Organization: cate: !

Address: .0 : A 2/

Signature of Bidders Representative: |
Title: o, +roaile. Teo Date: | Tasx 97

Teiephone:_ 6 ¢4~ §75- 22 5

RADIO.BID 2




BID SUPPLEMENTAL FORM
OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
201 WEST MAIN STREET
WALHALLA, SOUTH CAROLINA 29691

DATE: __lu T as 27 BIDNO 96-39
The ! J ‘ce € takes the following exceptions:
(Bidder)
E fepment L)

RADIO.BID 3




BID NO. 96-39

(Use this number on envelopes and
all related correspondence.)

BID FORM

OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

201 W. MAIN STREET, WALHALLA, SC 29691

The NOTOROLA  Lwe.

submits herewith our Bid in response 1o bid request number shown above, and in compliance with the

description(s) and/or specification(s) listed below for radi heriff’s
Dgg%g;
Qty. Description o Unit Price | Total
12 | Motorola HT-1000, HOISDC9AA3-N portable, 16 channef, VHF
radios to include antenna, high capacity NTN-7144 battery
e 793=| 9516
12 | Motorola H437 compact rapid chargers /h '
U ke S= Gr2
12 | H314 Swivel leather cases with belt loop \puotes./
347 Hog
12 NMN6193 Remote speaker microphones o
70| gHo
12 NTN Belt clips
I neduded Nle | wle
8. C. Sales Tax (3%) '
S 68 20
TOTAL )
(nclobing fos [{,944.8p

Above shall include programming. Frequencies to be provided later. «~ a.cnow fe d se.d

Number of radios may vary depending on availability of funds.

Bid shall include delivery to location stated on Bid Notice.

Show any exception, deviation, extra computation, or information on Bid Supplemental Form attached

hereto.

Delivery Date: | 2 peelks  ARO

Bidding Organization:____MlotheoLs | Tne

Address: S (Cresk U Lew .

Signature of Bidders Representative:

Title:_ S . Brect. m\g ¢, Date: ?[ 14]o 9
Loy~ 244~ 0085

Telephone:

This adle will ar.cef?‘" U rF

Sher it Frequenties.

RADIO.BID

ofrect model ‘1’5; for

e
%N‘wg; Lendio .




January 28, 1997

Bid Tabulation - Rubber Tire Backhoe for Road Dept

Bid No.e6-38

Walhalla, SC 29691

Powell Bros. Oakway
Oconee Tractor & Greenville South Carolina Tractor & Pioneer Hughes
Implement Equipment Tractor Co., (Tractor & implement Machinery, Equipment &
BIDDER Co., Inc. Co., Inc, Inc. Equipment Co.|Van Lott, Inc. =Blanchar.fl Co., Inc. Inc. Tractor
Base Bid 45,499.00 47,863.00 49,975.00 50,894.00 53,280.87 62,491.00 no bid no bid no bid
Sales Tax 300.00 300.00 *300.00 300.00 300.00 300.00
TOTAL $ 4579900 |$ 4816300 |3 5027500 |3 51,19400| % 53,560.87 | $ 62,791.00
Delivery 30 - 45 days |90 - 120 days |60 - 120 days | 60 - 90 days 45 - 90 days
Case 580 NewHolland| New Holland John Deere
Model # Super L 655E 655E JCB 215 3108E Cat 428C
engine not
18'3"| turbocharged, -.5ame as
Spec Varnances dipperstick| no tilt steering] Powell Bros.
* bid 5% sales
tax

Attended Bid Opening: Marianne Dillard, Jenny Peay, Hoyt Orr - Oconee County, Richard Kelly, Jim Cook - SC Tractor & Equip.,

Pat Duke - Oconee Implement, Barry Sullivan - Blanchard Machinery

|

l

BIDTABS.XLS




Transmission -

Axle -

Backhoe-

Loader -

Tires-

Additional Equip -

IFICATIONS - RUBBER TIRE BA OE .

Four cylinder turbocharged diesel - mmimum 85 net horsepower -
2 Wheel Drive

Four speed forward and reverse, torque converter - powershift
Front and rear - extra heavy duty - power steering

Heavy duty backhoe - hydraulically operated - joystick type backhoe controls,
- extended boom and dipper stick, digging depth of 15° 57
heavy duty 24” trenching bucket

Multi-purpose (or 4 in 1) loader bucket capacity heaped 1.25 cubic yards with,
bolt on cutting edge

Front - 11.00x 16 12 PR
Rear - 19.5L x 24 10PR - both front and rear tubeless

Enclosed cab with heater and air conditioner

Tilt steering wheel

Back-up alarm

Standard work lights

Suspension seat with 8 adjustments

Street stabilizer pads hydraulically controlled from cab

Yellow lens strobe lights mounted on left rear fender (to be seen by on
coming traffic front and rear)

All required OSHA equipment

15,000 Ibs.

One full year on parts and labor
Warranty work, if any to be performed at Oconee County Motor Pool, or
successful vendor to supply transportation to and from vendor’s shop

Successful vendor shall supply two sets of service and parts manuals at time of backhoe delivery.

Oconee County reserves the right to award this bid to the lowest, most responsive, responsible bidder
overall. Bidders shall include at time of bid opening complete descriptive brochures on equipment being
bid at time of bid opening.

BACKHOE.BID




BID NO. 96-38
{Use thiz number on envelopes and
all related correspondence.)

BID FORM
OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
201 W, MAIN STREET, WALHALLA, SC 29691

The __fpansld o e,

submits herewith our Bid in response té bid reduest number shown above, and in compliance with the

description(s) and/or specification(s) attached hereto for a_rubber tire backhoe for Oconee County
Road Department

BASE BID $ 6/5,#—/%00
S. C. Sales Tax V%) W %7»7/ 300D
TOTAL Bid Price s Y 5 17702

Epsl 5§50 Sepeh Per W&”C,

Bid shall include delivery to location stated on Bid Notice.
Show any exception, deviation, extra computation, or information on Bid Supplemental Form attached

hereto.

Delivery Date: 3’0 vd pﬂ%
Bidding Organization: WW eﬂ

Mailing Address: ﬂ&é’& 9' A - 5/1'7@ gy

Signature of Bidders Representative: I ol f /
Title: [ ’70 Date: M 25 (7 ?/Q
" Telephone: Py - RS & v

Fan 019 €220

RACKHOE.BID 2




BID SUPPLEMENTAL FORM
OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

201 WEST MAIN STREET
WALHALLA, SOUTH CAROLINA 29691

DATE: V%&A\Roﬁ, (997 BIDNO 9638

The _WW . &“ takes the following exceptions:

" (Bidder)

BACKHOE.BID 4




BID NO. 96-38
(Use this number on envelopes and
all related correspondence.)

BID FORM :
OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
201 W. MAIN STREET, WALHALLA, SC 29691

'I‘h - d ———
e = )
submits here% our Bid in response to bid request number shown above, and in compliance with the

description(s) and/or specification(s) attached hereto for a_rubber tire backhoe for Oconee County
Road Department

BASE BID s4) 8,3. 22

S. C. Sales Tax (3%~ Joo, &

TOTAL Bid Price $¢2!L;3. o

Bid shall include delivery to location stated on Bid Notice.
Show any exception, deviation, extra computation, or information on Bid Supplemental Form attached

hereto.

Dehvery Date: 90 [ Z % f‘[A—\l <

Telephone:

Fax: * Bgv;—- %;\g“l

BACKHOE.BID ' 2




BID SUPPLEMENTAL FORM
OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

201 WEST MAIN STREET
WALHALLA, SOUTH CAROLINA 29691

paTE: [/ ~22-9 ] BIDNO 9638

The gﬂ-’b’\’\ % S, ’_‘;1-‘ & Gb . Oy takes the following exceptions:

(Bidder) *

We Arva. b:&&u\ Mo L\ (LS55 & Aw/&swim
ik sheari ng Waeh - Apd-aadnble

SIGNATURE: -

BACKHOE.BID 4




BID NO. 96-38
(Use this number on envelopes and

all related correspondence. )
BID FORM
OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
201 W. MAIN STREET, WALHALILA, SC 29691 ]
J
The

submits herewith our Bid in response to bid request number shown above, and in compliance with the
description(s) and/or specification(s) attached hereto for a_rubber tire backhoe for Oconee County
Road Department
BASE BID s 49925 .9°
S. C. Sales Tax (5%) RY¥9Y, 75
TOTAL Bid Price s S2 ¥73. 28

Bid shall include delivery to location stated on Bid Notice.
Show any exception, deviation, extra computation, or information on Bid Supplemental Form attached

hereto.

Delivery Date: {0 Yo /20 Lbiagpd
Bidding Organization: GREENVILLE EORD TRACTOR INC.

Mailing Address: 2._0. BOX 2086
Signature of Bidders Representative: ﬁ @q«e—-——
Title: _,—% Date:_/ ""42/’ / g2

Telephone: 500 - & 33-0939
Fax: é/é?'- 232 —39143

BACKHCE. BID




BID NO. 96-38
(Use this numnber on envslopes and
all related correspondence.)

BID FORM
OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
201 W, MAIN STREET, WALHALLA, SC 29691

The South Carolina Tractor & Equipment Company

submits herewith our Bid in response to bid request number shown above, and in conpliance with the

description(s) and/or specification(s) attached hereto for a Mm&mmm
Road Department

BASE BID $50,894.00
S. C. Sales Tax (5%) 300.00
TOTAL i3id Price $51,194.00

Bid shall include delivery to location stated on Bid Notice.
Show any exception, deviation, extra computation, or information on Bid Supplemental Form attached

hereto.

Delivery Date: Sixty to Ninety Pays A.‘P.O.
Bidding Organization: South Carolina Tractor & Equipment Company

Mailing \ddress: P.0. Box 5815 ‘Greénvi'He,South Carplina 29606

Signature of Bidders Representaﬁvc:#%
Title: V / W{/MS Date: /l"/Zf_ 77

Telephon::; (864) 288-6990.
Fax: (864) 288-6994

BACKHOR .0 2




01,2787 12:48 T8038837408 VAN LOTT INC. @oo3soos

BID NO, 96-38
@

{Usa this sumbar oo savelopas and
all r¢lsted correspondencs.)

| BID FORM
OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
201 W. MAIN STREET, WALHALLA, SC 29691

The V*L_éjﬁ‘ e

submits herewith our Bid in response to bid request number shown above, and in oompliance with the

description(s) and/or specification(s) attached hereto for arubbe ---‘ bag
Road Department |
| - ( ThuDeere. 3046 )
BASE BID A s 53 ééo. g>
S. C. Sales Tax {5%) | | - 300.00 L,B fb?':’/ “‘/55
TOTAL Bid Price $ -5' 3 J 0 8)

Bid shall mclude delivery to location stated on Bid Notice.
Show any exception, deviation, extra computanon, ot information on n Bid Supplemental Form attached
hereto.

,mm.zﬂ@& 30,/905-. . -

BACKHOB.BID | | 7



BID NO. 96-38
(Use this oumber on envelopes and
ali related correspondence.)

BID FORM
OCONEE COUNTY PURCBASING DEPARTMENT
201 W. MAIN STREET, WALHALLA, SC 29691

The Bl :;nrhﬁ_rd Mp chinary anrﬁnxr
submits herewith our Bid in response to bid request number shown above, and in compliance with the
description(s) and/or specification(s) attached hereto for a rubber tire backhoe for Oconee County
Road Department
BASE BID : CAT 426C $___62,591.00
S. C. Sales Tax (5%) 300.00
TOTAL Bid Price $ 62,791.00

Bid shall include delivery to location stated on Bid Notice.

Show any exception, deviation, extra computation, or information on Bid Supplemental Form attached
hereto.

Belivery Date: 45 - 90 days

Bidding Organization:
Mailing Address: P. 0. Box 517 , Simpsonville, S. C. 29681
Signature of Bidders Representative: __m )

Title: Sales Representative Date: ~ January 28, 1997
Telephone: (864) 963-3845
Fax: (864) 963-2063

BACKHOE.BID




BID NO. 96-38

(Use this number on envelopes and
all related correspondence.)

| BID FORM
OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
201 W. MAIN STREET, WALHALLA, SC 29691

The
submits herewith our Bid in response to bid request number shown above and in compliance with the

description(s) and/or specification(s) attached hereto for a_qubber tire backhoe for Oconee County
Road Department

BASE BID . I% $

8. C. Sales Tax (5%)

TOTAL Bid Price b

L\)E’, dO not baJQ AL Moglf\.ye__—f‘o -Fj"f_
’/}7 e>5€ 5;9?--65 o Jhandcs 'FD(' _ m WT:/!.S wuJ 75-) ‘

Bid shall include delivery to location stated on Bid Notice. 9 W

Show any exception, deviation, extra computation, or mformation on Bid Supplemental Form attached

hereto.

Delivery Date:
Bidding Organization:
Mailing Address:
Signature of Bidders Representative:
Title: Date:

Telephone:

Fax:

BACKHOE.BID . 2
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January 75, 1297

Oconee County Purchaging Depastment
207 West Maln Street ¥
Walhalla, sSC 29697 '

BID MO.  96-38 : R -
Eubber Tire Backhos ' A

Piocneer Machinery Inc. subtiits no bid.

Rae

ctfully,

Bob Owens _
FTerritory Manager

Iba ' ' l?%.'




OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
201 WEST MAIN STREET
WALHALLA, SC 29691
(864) 638-4141

DATE: January 9, 1997

BID NOTICE

Seaied bids for furnishing a rubbe tme
subject to the conditions and prowsmns set forth in the attached bid packaga w:]l be received at this office

until _Tuesday, January, 28, 1997 gt 2:00 p.m.
and then publicly opened. The commodities and/or services nmst be furnished as described and specified in

this package.

Bid price shall include delivery to Walhalla, S.C.

Bids must be received either via mail or hand delivered in a sealed envelope. Faxed bids cannot be
accepted. .
Please address mailed bids to: " Please address Fed-Ex, UPS or hand delivered
bids to: A ‘
OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
208 BOOKER DRIVE 201 W. MAIN STREET
WALHALLA, SC 29691 WALHALLA, SC 29691

Also, please show the following bid/quote number on the lower left coer of the envelope.

BID NO. 96-38

SIGNATURE

Marianne Dillard
. Purchasing Agent:: -

BACKHOE.BID 1




02,0497 16:25 FAX 864 972 3900 OCONEE CTY SEWER doo2

623 Return Church Road ® Seocca. South Caroling 20678
803-972-3900

Oconee County Sewer Commission

February 4, 1997

Mr. Harrison E. Omr
Oconee County Supervisor
208 Booker Drive

Walhalla, S.C. 29691

Re: Engineering Szarvices
Nason Sewer [Project

Dear Mr. Orr:
The Sewer Commission voted last evening to recommend to the County Counclil that
Goldie & Associates be selected to provide engineering services on the above

referenced project. This recommendation is based upon the following information:

(] 1) This firm provided the Preliminary Engineering Report for the project which
‘ was submitted to the State in order to obtain the grant funds.

2) The fee structure is within the guidelines for this type of professional services
and total 10.6% of the total estimated costs for the project.

3) Goldie is located in Oconee County, and the project requires daily inspections
by the engineering representative.

4) Itis in the County’s best interest to do so.
This item is on the agenda for tonight's meeting. Thanks for your consideration.

Sincerely,

R AU 5o S5

Rebert C. Winchester
General Superintend ant

. RCW/kh

cc: Commissioners




