
ITB 16-12 Heavy Equipment Rental for OITP December 21, 2016

at 2:00pm 

Attended Bid Opening:

Approx 
Quantity

# of 
Months Description

1 Month 
Price

4 Month 
Price

Extended 
Price

1 Month 
Price

4 Month 
Price

Extended 
Price

1 Month 
Price

4 Month 
Price

Extended 
Price

1 Month 
Price 4 Month Price

Extended 
Price

1 Month 
Price

4 Month 
Price

Extended 
Price 1 Month Price 4 Month Price Extended Price

1 Month 
Price

4 Month 
Price

Extended 
Price

4 4 40 Ton Articulated Truck $13,880.86  $ 55,523.44  $   222,093.76 No Bid  $                -    $ 14,780.00  $ 59,120.00  $ 236,480.00  $ 12,720.00  $   50,880.00  $  203,520.00  $ 10,987.00  $ 43,948.00  $ 175,792.00  $    13,305.00  $       53,220.00  $    212,880.00  No Bid 

1 4 Crawler Dozer #1 $17,340.82  $ 69,363.28  $     69,363.28 No Bid  $ 22,610.00  $ 90,440.00  $   90,440.00    19,424.50  $   77,698.00  $    77,698.00    14,927.50  $ 59,710.00  $   59,710.00  No Bid  No Bid 

1 4 Crawler Dozer #2 $5,456.67  $ 21,826.68  $     21,826.68 $4,691.78  $ 18,767.12  $    18,767.12  $  6,157.40  $ 24,629.60  $   24,629.60      5,016.98  $   20,067.92  $    20,067.92      4,074.25  $ 16,297.02  $   16,297.02          5,401.00  $       21,604.00  $     21,604.00  No Bid 

2 4 Hydraulic Excavator $10,703.18  $ 42,812.72  $     85,625.44 No Bid  $ 20,703.00  $ 82,812.00  $ 165,624.00    12,751.80  $   51,007.20  $  102,014.40    10,880.50  $ 43,522.00  $   87,044.00        18,305.00  $       73,220.00  $    146,440.00  No Bid 

2 4 Padfoot Soil Compactor $15,257.70  $ 61,030.80  $   122,061.60 No Bid  No Bid       4,611.00  $   18,444.00  $    36,888.00    12,797.50  $ 51,190.00  $ 102,380.00          4,652.00  $       18,608.00  $     37,216.00  No Bid 

1 4 Water Truck $10,970.10  $ 43,880.40  $     43,880.40 $4,941.75  $ 19,767.00  $    19,767.00  No Bid   No Bid      3,808.00  $ 15,232.00  $   15,232.00          4,973.00  $       19,892.00  $     19,892.00      4,506.21  $ 18,024.84  $ 18,024.84 

 $             -    $                 -    $             -    $                -    $             -    $               -    $                -    $                -    $             -    $               -    $                   -    $                  -    $             -    $             -   
 $             -    $                 -    $             -    $                -    $             -    $               -    $                -    $                -    $             -    $               -    $                   -    $                  -    $             -    $             -   

      564,851.16        38,534.12     517,173.60      440,188.32     456,455.02       438,032.00    18,024.84 

Does not meet specs.

Piedmont, SC

Richardson Service 1991
Conway, SC

United Rentals
Anderson, SCAddress Bonita Springs, FL

Blanchard Bidders May Heavy Equipment

Grand Total

Flint Equipment
Simpsonville, SC

Linder Machinery
Greer, SC

Math Error

Simpsonville, SC

Herc Rentals


