10.

11.

12.

13.

OCONEE COUNTY COUNCIL MEETING
TUESDAY, SEPTEMBER 3, 1996
7:00 PM
Call to Order
Invocation
Approval of Minutes
Discussion & Possible Second Reading of Ordinance
96-8, "AN ORDINANCE OF OCONEE COUNTY, SOUTH

CAROLINA PROHIBITING PUBLIC NUDITY; DEFINING TERMS,
ESTABLISHING EXEMPTIONS TO THE PROHIBITION AGAINST

PUBLIC NUDITY; PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE DATE; AND

OTHER MATTERS RELATING THERETO"

Recommendation Regarding Millage for 1996-97 Fiscal
Year - Mr. Kenneth F. Williams, Auditor

Consideration of Request for Funds to Purchase 911
Materials for Classrooms - Mr. Bob Little

Consideration of Request to Purchase Cellular Phone
to be used by FAA During Clemson Games - Mr. Marion
Lyles, Airport Manager

Discussion & Consideration of Request Regarding
ATAX Grant to Lunney Museum Dated November, 1993 -
Mr. Ernst Hesterberg, ATAX Vice Chairman & Ms.
Nancy Clayton

(A) Consideration of ATAX Grant in the Amount of
$9,012 to Greater Walhalla Chamber of Commerce

(B) Consideration of ATAX Grant in the Amount of
$852 to SC Heritage Corridor Project - Mr. Ernst
Hesterberg

Consideration of Bids to Rebuild Transmission &
Torque Converter in 1976 Cline BackDump - Mr. Lee
Davis, Motor Pool Foreman & Ms. Marianne Dillard,
Purchasing Agent

0l1ld Business

New Business

Adjourn
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There will be a public hearing Tuesday, September 3, 1996
at 6:30 pm to receive written and/or comments regarding
the disposition of two (2) buildings at the airport.

There will be a public hearing Thursday, September 5, 1996
at 7:00 pm in the courtroom, 211 West Main St., Walhalla,
SC for the purpose of receiving written and/or oral
comments regarding the Oconee County, South Carolina 1996
Land Use Plan.




MEMBERS, OCONEE COUNTY COUNCIL

Ms. M. Fran Burrell, District I Mr. Harrison E. Orr, Disf
Mr. Harry R. Hamilton, District III Mr. Roy B. Strickland, [
Mr. Alton K. Williams, District v

MINUTES, OCONEE COUNTY COUNCIL MEETING

The regular meeting of the Oconee County
Council was held Tuesday, September 03, 1996 at 7:00 pm in
Council Chambers with all Council Members and the County
Attorney present.

Members of the press notified (by mail):
Journal/Tribune, Keowee Courier, Westminster News, Anderson
Independent, Greenville News, WGOG Radio, WBFM Radio, WCCP
Radio, WYFF TV, & SC Black Media Group.

Members of the press present: Dick Mangrum -
WGOG Radio, Ashton Hester - Keowee Courier & Allison Glass =
Anderson Independent.

The meeting was called to order by Supervison
- Chairman Crain who welcomed the guests and media.

The invocation was given by Ms. Burrell.

Ms. Burrell made a motion, seconded by Mr.
Willijams, approved 5 - 0 that the minutes of the August 20,
1996 meeting be adopted as printed.

Mr. Cain, County Attorney, presented the
attached draft Ordinance 96-8, "AN ORDINANCE OF OCONEE COUNTY,
SOUTH CAROLINA, PROHIBITING PUBLIC NUDITY; DEFINING TERMS;
ESTABLISHING EXEMPTIONS TO THE PROHIBITION AGAINST PUBLIC NUDITY;
PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE DATE AND OTHER MATTERS RELATING THERETO".

Mr. Cain urged Council to delay second
reading of the Ordinance until they had time to review the draft
Ordinance as well as the other pertinent materials he had
provided them.

After discussion, Mr. Williams made a motion,
seconded by Mr. Strickland, approved 5-0 that Ordinance 96-8 be
adopted on second reading.

After further discussion, Mr. Strickland made
a motion, seconded by Mr. Hamilton, approved 5 - 0 that a public
hearing regarding Ordinance 96-8 be scheduled Thursday, September
26, 1996 at 7:00 P.M. in the courtroom.

rict II
istrict IV

Press

Ccall to
Order

Invocation

Minutes

ord. 96-8
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Mr. Hamilton made a motion, seconded by Mr.
Strickland, approved 5 - 0 that Council go on record urging the
Legislative Delegation to introduce legislation as quickly as
possible that will more clearly delineate the counties ability to
enact such legislation.

Mr. Nat Cloer addressed Council urging them
to go forward with the adoption of the anti nudity ordinance.

Upon recommendation of Mr. Kenneth F.
Williams, Mr. Strickland made a motion, seconded by Ms. Burrell,
approved 5 - 0 that the operating millage for fiscal year 1996-97
as follows be adopted:

County Operations 63.6 mills

School Operations 101.1 mills
Tri County Operations 1.5 mills
Total Operations Mills: 166.2 mills

Mr. Williams set bond millage as follows:

1977 Hospital .3 mills
1991 County Bond .7 mills
1993 County Bond .7 mills
1993 Solid Waste 4.0 mills
1991 School Bond 7.4 mills
1994 School Bond 7.1 mills
1995 School Bond 5.5 mills
1996 Tri County Tec Bond 1.1 mills
Total Bond Mills: 26.8 mills

The total of operations and bond mills is
193 mills for fiscal year 1996-97.

(See attached)

Upon request of Mr. Ron Miller, Airport
Maintenance Technician, Mr. Hamilton made a motion, seconded by
Mr. Strickland, approved 5 - 0 that a cellular phone be purchased
from Crenshaw Electronics at a cost of $69 plus $23 per month and
use to be used by the Federal Aviation Administration during

Clemson games.

Ord. 96-8
(Con't)

Millage

Airport
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Upon request of Mr. Ernst Hesterberg, Vice
Chairman, ATAX Commission, & Ms. Nancy Clayton, Mr. Strickland
made a motion, seconded by Mr. Hamilton, approved 5 - 0 that
an ATAX Grant in the amount of $5,300 approved November 2, 1993
for work on the carriage house be transferred to chimney repair,
the bid process be waived and rebuilding of the chimney be
performed by Meadors Construction as per Section B: Formal Bid
Process, Subsection 2: When it is to the advantage of Oconee
County to acquire goods and/or services on the basis of
previously awarded bids or contracts. The work on the carriage
house has not been done at this time and it is not anticipated
that it will be done in the near future. (See attached)

Upon request of Mr. Hesterberg & Ms. Vickie
Satterfield, Mr. Hamilton made a motion, seconded by Mr.
Strickland, approved 5 - 0 that an ATAX Grant in the amount of
$9,012 be adopted. (See attached)

Upon request of Mr. Hesterberg & Mr. Don
Moss, Mr. Strickland made a motion, seconded by Ms. Burrell,
approved 5 - 0 that an ATAX Grant in the amount of $852 be
adopted. (See attached)

Upon recommendation of Mr. Lee Davis, Motor
Pool Foreman & Ms. Marianne Dillard, Purchasing Agent, Mr.
Orr made a motion, seconded by Mr. Strickland, approved 5 - 0
that the bid to rebuild the transmission and torque converter in
the 1979 Cline backdump be awarded to Williams Detroit Diesel
Allison who was low bid at $8,990. (See attached bid sheet)

Mr. Strickland made a motion, seconded by
Mr. Hamilton, approved 5 - 0 that $15,000 be expended for
insurance for fire and emergency preparedness volunteers.

Upon request of Mr. John Palmer, Mr. Orr
made a motion, seconded by Mr. Strickland, approved 5 - 0 that
Council support a $250,000 no match Literacy Program Grant.

Ms. Connie Major addressed Council request-
ing permission to fence off the roadway.

Mr. Crain referred this matter to the Roads
& Transportation Committee who scheduled a meeting Monday,
September 9, 1996 at 9:00 am to review the roadway.

Ms. Burrell, Chairperson, Purchasing,
Contracting, Real Estate, Building & Grounds Committee, informed
Council it was the recommendation of the committee that the
county seek proposals to remove or demolish the brick house at
the airport and the proposals contain liability insurance and
workers compensation.

ATAX Grant
(Lunney
Museunm)

(Walhalla
Chamber)

(Heritage
Corridor)

Motor
Pool

Volunteer
Insurance

Literacy
Program

Connie
Circle

Airport

[ |



Minutes, Oconee County Council
September 3, 1996
Page 4

Mr. Williams made a motion, seconded by Mr. Sewer Appt.
Orr, approved 5 - 0 that Mr. Tommy Crumpton be appointed to
represent the City of Walhalla with his term commencing
immediately.

Ms. Burrell made a motion, seconded by Mr. Cover Dirt
Strickland, approved 5 - 0 that Mr. Hawk be permitted to offer
$1.30 per square yard for cover dirt for the landfill.

Mr. Hawk informed Council there was a meet- Tower
ing Thursday at 6:00 pm for the City of Walhalla to consider a
variance to allow the communications tower to be constructed at
the Law Enforcement Center.

Adjourn: 9:15 pm Adjourn

Submitted By:

W@. /g/&au_/

Opdl O. Green
Council Clerk

Reviewed By:

Norman D. Crain
Supervisor-Chairman
Oconee County Council




1 WEST UNION HARDWOOD, INC.

Post Office Box 438 + 102 S.W. Jefferson Road *¢ West Union, South Carolina 29696 + (803) 638-9515 * Facsimile (803) 638-2611

August 28, 1996

Mr. Norman D. Crain
Oconee County Supervisor
208 Booker Dr.

Walhalla, S.C. 29691

Dear Mr. Crain:

It has comme to my attention that the Oconee County Council may be waftling on their stand
against nude bars in our county. It has been rumored that the counctl wishes to turn the entire
issue over to the state law makers instead of proceeding with County Ordinance 96-8. In licu of
this travesty, I respectfully request permission t: address the council at their meeting on
September 3 at 7:00 p.m.

Rt’\;‘t’,Ltﬁl“\

Nat W. Cloer

HARDWOOD® Over Four Generations of Hardwood Experience



@conee ounty Auditor

KENNETH F. WILLIAMS
208 Booker Drive
County Court House
Walhalla, South Carolina 29691
Telephone (803) 638-4158

September 3, 1996

To: The Hononable Supervison, Chariman and County Council
From: Kenneth F. WifLiams, Auditorn of Oconee JngaA{

Subject:  1996-1997 Tax Levy
Attached you will find a schedule of the Proposed Tax Levy for 1996-1997.
In compliance with Oconee County Ondinance 96-6 Sections 3 and 14, T am

rnecommending that the foLLowing tax nate be approved by Council for the
Fiscal Yean 1996-1997.

County Openations 63.6 MLLs
School Operations 107.1 Miels
Tri County Tec Operations 1.5 MR
Total Operating MiLLs 166.2 M{ELs

In accordance with Section 4-15-150 and 59-71-150 of the Code 0§ Laws of
South Carolina 1976, 1 have set the Tax Levy for the various Bonds as foLlLows:

1977 Hospital. .3 Miegs
1991 County Bond .7 Miees
1993 County Bond .7 Mikes
1993 Solid Waste 4.0 Mcees
1991 Schoof Bond 7.4 Miees
1994 Schoot Bond 7.1 Miees
1995 Schoot Bond 5.5 Miels
1996 Tri County Tec Bond 101 Meees
Total Bonds 76.8 MEs

1§ 50 approved this will establish a total Levy for the cwuient year at 193 MiLls.



1996-97 PROPOSED T.

EST. VEHICLE ASSESSMENT - COUNTY & SCHOOL (1st 6 Month 13,250,000
EST. COUNTY ASSESSMENT - ALL OTHER PROPERTY
EST. SCHOOL ASSESSMENT - ALL OTHER PROPERTY

ACCOUNTS VEHICLE VEHICLE VEHICLE REGULAR
MILLAGE MILLAGE TAX MILLAGE
JULY-DEC JAN-JUNE

COUNTY PURPOSES

COUNTY OPERATIONS 63.4 63.6 1,682,750.00 63.6 11,

BONDS:

77 HOSPITAL ADD. 1.0 .3 17,225.00 .3

1991 BOND .9 .7 21,200.00 .7

1993 BOND .7 .7 18,550.00 .7

SOLID WASTE 4.1 4.0 107,325.00 4.0 L
TOTAL BONDS 6.7 5.7 164, 300.00 5.7 1,
TOTAL COUNTY 70.1 69.3 1,847,050.00 69.3 12

SCHOOL PURPOSES

SCHOOL OPERATING 93.5 101.1 2,578,450.00 101.1 25

BONDS:

1991 SCHOOL 7.4 7.4 196,100.00 7.4 1

1994 SCHOOL 7.9 7.1 198,750.00 7.1 1

1995 SCHOOL 5.6 5.5 147,075.00 5.5 1
TOTAL BONDS 20.9 20.0 541,925.00 20.0 5
TOTAL SCHOOL 114.4 121.1 3,120,375.00 121.1 30
TRI COUNTY TEC OPER. 1.4 1.5 38,425.00 1.5

BONDS:

TRI COUNTY TEC 1.1 1.1 29,150.00 1.1 .
TOTAL SCHOOL PURPOSES 116.9 123.7 3,187,950.00 123.7 31
1996 TAX LEVY 187.0 193.0 5,035,000.00 193.0 43




Accomodations Tax Commission

S.J. Reidhead

c/o Ernst Hesterberg

P.O.Box 855

Seneca, S.C. 29678 11 June,1996

Dear Ms. Reidhead and Mr. Hesterberg,

I write with a special request concerning the the grant awarded
to the Lunney Museum in November 1993 for the stabilization of the
carriage house roof. Due to extenuating circumstances, we have been
unable to complete the project for which this grant was intended.
Requests for quotes were sent out to several qualified vendors by the
Oconee County Purchasing Department on two occasions, and failed to
secure a contractor interested in undertaking the work. Unfortunately,
our progress in resolving this matter was brought to a halt with the
resignation last spring of Betty Plisco, our director, and the project
manager for the grant. We were behind schedule at that time, and though
other contractors have been consulted since, it does not appear likely
that we will be able to undertake this restoration as envisioned in the
original application.

We did not anticipate these problems, and would like to ask that
you consider the unusual factors contributing to the delay. We have
another restoration project in progress for which we are currently
seeking funds, and we would like you to consider applying our present
grant to that project. Last spring we repaired the roof of the Lunney
house, and installed crickets at the chimneys. This spring, thanks to
extra money received from the Oconee County Council, we have been able
to repoint the masonry of three of the chimneys, leaving one large
chimney in need of repair. We would like to request that the funds set
aside for the carriage house grant be applied instead to the current
project, allowing us to complete the chimney work that is urgently
needed.

We have been fortunate to have been able to use the services of
the Meadors Construction Corporation of Charleston, South Carolina to
repoint the chimneys. We were able to seek the services of this firm
because they are currently working on a project in Greenville. As
required by the county, we sought proposals from several qualified
vendors, and the Meadors company was the only firm to return a quote.
They are restoration specialists. Their master mason is a man in his
seventies with more than fifty years of experience. He specializes in
historic preservation.

1



This request represents an urgent need. We have been informed by
the masons and by the consulting architect that the mortar of the
remaining chimney is in bad condition. Because of the restoration
project in progress in Greenville, this experienced crew is available to
undertake our job during a limited period of time. Also, the scaffolding
materials are in place at the site, and it is a relatively simple matter
to transfer the materials to the last chimney at this time.

The Oconee County Council has made additional funds available for
the work that we have just undertaken. They waived the procurement
requirements to allow us to include additional chimney work that
exceeded our original budget. With these ATAX funds, we would need to
request special permission from them to continue and complete this
special work with this contractor, as they did on the previous occasion.
Without assistance, we do not have sufficient funds to undertake this
remaining work.

As you are aware, our facility is a major tourist site in our
county. Qur historic facility requires special maintenance and upkeep.
We have a special opportunity to complete an important project that
cannot be done by local contractors. We appreciate your consideration of
this important matter.

Sincerely,
%a/,w n & /paf/”k/

Nancy M Clayton



LUNNEY MUSEUM CHIMNEY REPAIRS
July 1996

Carriage House Grant amount = $5300.00
(requested for roll over to chimmey project)
Funds from OCMA = $ 618.00

(Cconee County Museum Association)

Total Porject Cost . $5918.00



MEADORS’ CONSTRUCTION CORPORATION

P.O.BOX 21758
CHARLESTON, SOUTH CAROLINA 29413-1758

TELEPHONE (803) 723-8585
FAX (803) 852-7892
June 20, 1996

Mrs. Nancy Clayton

300 W. South First Street

Seneca, SC 29678

RE: Lunney Museum

Dear Mrs. Clayton:

Per your telephone call today, below is our estimate for the rebuilding of the second chimney at

the Lunney Museum in Seneca, South Carolina.

LUNNEY MUSEUM

. Rebuild #2 Chimney $ 5,918.00
‘ Labor, Lodging, and Scaffolding
Install 6" diameter metal galvanized flue
Note: This pricing is available only for thirty days from the date of this letter.
If you require further information, please do not hesitate to contact me at your convenience.
Sincerely,
MEADORS’ CONSTRUCTION CORPORATION

James C. Meadors
President

JCM/smr
Attachment

cc: Mr. Gary Zingler

FAWPS1\PROPOSAL\LUNNYMUS
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‘l%&ﬁri}y,cac:o NEE COUNTY ATAX APPLICATION

Deadlines: October 1 March 1

“ﬁl fm Contact: For‘Information and Applications

N, S. J. Reidhead, Chairman Oconee CountyJATAX Committee
N 8720 West Oak Highway .
, Seneca, SC- 29678 .
N\ 803 - 972 - 9044

Ernst Hesterberg, Vice Chairman
.. ;15 Foremast. Circle, .
‘. "salem,.SC’ 29676

00 803-944-1554 ffj;“fﬁ R
"'“DEADLINE° October 1_yy March*l____ . ..o wies
1. Name of applicant organization: -
_QCONEE coUNmi MUSEUM ASSOCTATION {(OCMA -
2. Mailing address:___ 211 West South First Straet
3. City:_Seneca . 4. Zipcode: 29678
. 5. Contact person: Betty L, Plisco “
8. Fax: f i 9. Project name.v(if applicable) n[a
10. Event starting date:ASAP 11. chpletidn date:_1994 LT
B - : %
12. Application category: a. government entity:
b. city: c. county: d. district:

e. non profit organization:_ XX f. incorporation

L A

date: 2'22'87 g. eleemosynary organization under IRS
code:_501(e)(3h. date of determination letter:_1988
i. IRS number#: 57-085-4004 - T :

»

13. Total itemized project budget: should include the cost -
of the entire project and may be included on a separate
sheet. L S

‘ 14, ATAX funds' requesta&: $5300

15, Itemized budget for ATAX funds
requested: Stabilization of carriage housme

General roof revair - $£Qoo




16. How will these funds be used?_To stabilize the two-story
carriage houaws (also a National Register property) adjacent
to_the main building at the Lunney Museum

17. 1s this a matching grant?_No 18. Source:

19. Funds furnished by your group: -

20. Description of project:Work will 1?clgdes Pumigations gsealing ..

) - roof leaks; replacing decaying soffits, facia and awtmxies as
~+  needed; repairing and reglazing windovs; re-shaking extened a'ﬁ
: " porch roofs , :

(You mag-.provide additional material, etc. on a e
separate sheet if necessary.) B

21. Provide appropriate demographio'date:lsee attachment

(Please provide estimates or actual attendance figures "ﬁzf:QJQ
showing § of local,” out of state, and over night guests SR
will be attending the event.) T

;22.4;jnx;4uLLl_hnnaii:_iu:un_thin;prgjggxzﬁ Ses attachment . i

23. How will this project influencs tourism 1n Oconee
County? See attechment

BN , ~ ~ ;

- 24, If possible, please provide material from a previous
function. Balance sheets, flyers, promotional
material would be appreciated. . ,

I have read the attached guidelines for the Oconee County - -
Accommodations Tax Fund, and do hereby agree to. comply with -
all rules and regulations. I understand failure to comply
may result in loss of funds for the project(s)

Signature. 4 g _ ) Date::fkiZLﬁEi . .
- - (Projegft Director) = ' -7 " L : I T

Signature: : : ' ____Date:
L : (Administrative Official) :

e - - Y S D P WP D Y WD D D WP U T G G D D WD P D - TR VD T M M D D P WS e W
rooe e . .

(FOR OFFICE USE ONLY)

application received by: datae:

review by ATAXIA €ommittee: date: ot approved for

submission to County Council:- - date! ' ‘approved by

County Council: . date:___ -~ funds forwarded°~' ) , —




Oconee County ATAX Application

contact: S. J. Reidhead Ernst Hesterberg
P.O.Box 4 c/o Seneca Chamber of Commerce
Townville, SC 29689 P. O. Box 855
803-972-2146 Seneca, SC 29678
803-944-1554

DATE OF APPLICATION: _June 1996 .

NAME OF APPLICANT ORGANIZATION:__Qconee County Museum Association
MAILING ADDRESS:__ 211 W_ South lst St, Seneca, S, C, 29678
CONTACT PERSON: Judy Havice TITLE:_ Museum Assistant
OFFICE PHONE:_gg2_4811 FAX: AFTER HOURS PHONE:__882-2098
PROJECT NAME (/f applicable)_1.unney Museum Chimmey Reconstruction
START DATE: END DATE:_1996 %*Project will probably take 2-3 wks.
If there /s no firm start/start date, please Include the time frame of the project.)
APPLICANT CATEGORY: CITY: GOVERNMENT ENTITY:___ COUNTY._X
NON-PROFIT ORGANIZATION:_Y __ INCORPORATION DATE:___

IN ORDER TO FACILITATE THE APPROVAL OF T.?-(f GRANT, THE

FOLLOWING MATERIAL IS REQUESTED: Your application may be rejected

if this materfal [s not included with the appllcation.
A: ITEMIZED PROIECT BUDGET: Include the cost of the entire project. ATAX
applicatioris are dependent on county purchasing requirements for bids. You may

contact the county purchasing department for an explanation of policy. Most
projects require 3 written bids. Pleasé Include copies of these bids with your
application or the application may be réturned as Incomplete.

B: APPROPRIATE DEMOGRAPHIC DATA: Thi¢ data should reflect the impact of
visitors who are classifled as tourists. (A tourist /s anyone who travels at least
50 nifles from their home or requires over-night accommodations.) Guest lists,
mailing lists, demographic studies are acceptable records.

C: ATTENDANCE FIGURES; Show percentageS of local, out of state, and overnight
guestS who Will attend the event, or who have attended previous events. Priority
will be given if the project attracts overnight guests.

D: MATERIALS FROM PREVIOUS FUNCTIONS: Balance sheets, flyers, promotional
materials, newspaper articles or any other pertinent materials pertaining to this
request,

E: CURRENT FINANCIAL HISTORY of your organization is mandatory. If your
organization Is non-profit, the annual reports and audits provided to the IRS
would be appreciated.

ATAX FUNDS REQUESTED:__$5300
ITEMIZED BUDGET FOR ATAX FUNDS REQUESTED: (attach on separate sheet)

HOW FUNDS WILL BE USED: Scaffold & rebuild Dinins Room Chimmey,
line with metal galvanized flu.,

FUNDS: MATCHING GRANTS: SOURCE:

FUNDS WHICH WILL BE FURNISHED BY YOUR GROUP $618.00
OTHER FUNDING SOURCES:
DESCRIPTION OF PROJECT:_Lynney Musenum Chimmey reconstruction

See ‘attached letter from Meadors Corp.
See attached Suppl. information.

See attached attendance tally

See attached OCMA Treasurers report

[ RNl g



WHO WILL BENEFIT FROM THIS PROJECT:__A11 Visitors to lLunnevy Museum

DESCRIBE HOW THIS PROJECT WILL INFLUENCE TOURISM IN OCONEE COUNTY:

Special maintenance that allows us to retain the Historic character
and appearance of our facility is essential to our mission to pre-

serve and document our county Historv and make it publicly available
GUIDELINES:

Be aware that tourists must come from at least 50 miles outside Oconee County.
Advertising done within a 100 mile radlus Is considered local and will not be
funded by ATAX money.

ATAX funds will not be used by local organizations as a substitute for
fundraising. If funds are available from other sources, and the applicant has not
explored these sources, the application will be considered unacceptable.

The funds granted by the ATAX committee must be specifically for the above
mentioned projects within the specified time. If funds are not used as proposed
or within 30 days of the close of the event, they must be returned to the ATAX
Committee. Fallure to meet these requirements will result in the denial of your
applications in the future.

An accurate estimation of tourism potential Is required. Please do not include
people who come from Anderson, Clemson, Greenville, Toccoa, etc. as examples of
tourism.

Please complete the attached follow-up report to the ATAX Committee within 60
days of completion of the project or event.

| have read the above guidelines for the Oconee County
Accommodations Tax Fund application and do hereby agree to
comply with all rules and requirements. | understand failure to
comply may result in a loss of funding for these project(s).

SIGNATURE: 7Muw-L i? C’/élz//WL/ DATE: /5 gnte 9o

I!R OJE CT DIRE CT OR

SIGNATURE: \/ L ,,’ Ly .“Q Uﬁff: /- DATE: /5‘(;"4« wi
[ A
ADMINIS TRATIVE OFFICIAL




Oconee County Museum Association e

211 W. South 1st. Street

eneca, SC 29678
803-882-4811

The Lunney Museum attracts more than two thousand visitors each

year, approximately 287 of whom are tourists. Lunney Museum bro-
chures are stocked at all SC Welcome Centers, the Museum is men-
tioned in the SC Tourism Guide and in brochures put out by the
Pendleton Historic District and by Discover UpCountry. It is also
listed in the SC Federation of Museum Guide and has been the subject
of numerous articles which reach a wide regional audience. A listing
in the Newsletter for Time-Share participants has brought Visitors
from all parts of the United States to the Museum. A very complimen-
tary article in an AAA Travel Guide with distribution throughout the
Midwest has also generated Visitors. In addition our own OCMA newa-
letter is sent quarterly to more than 600 people in twenty-five states
and two foreign countries. The Museum routinely hosts participants
in various Clemson University workshops ana wasthe site of the South
Carolina Federation of Museum's meetings in spring of 1994, which
brought Museum professionals and their families from both Carolinas
to the area for their annual meeting. Museum presentations for local
civic and service groups serve as a reminder for local residents to
bring out of town visitors to the Lunney.

q All of the Visitors enjoy the interpretation of the life and times ofa

small Southern town prior to World War I. The Lunney home and its
outbuildings are listed on the National Register of Historic buildings
and represent an outstanding example of the Arts and Crafts period of
architecture and decoration., This historic property is one a very few
in the Upstate with all of its structers intact and virtually un-
changed.




Oconee County Museumn Association e
211 W. South 1st. Street

eneca, SC 29678

803-882-4811

June 13, 1996

VISITORS TO MUSEUM 1995 - 1996

Local (S.C. Visitors) Qut of State

1040 46

This is the number of Visitors that have toured the Museum since
January 1995 (Museum closed from February to August 1995). Reopened
August 1lst. And also included are the numbers thru June 1996.

e




Oconee County Musewn Association =

211 ‘W. South 1st. Street
Seneca, SC 29678

803-882-4811

®

ANNUAL TREASURER'S REPORT

(1)

MAY 1, 1995 THROUGH APRIL 30, 1996
MONTH DEPOSITS WITHDRAWALS BALANCE
BEGINNING BALANCE $3419.08
MAY-1985
MEMBERSHIP $ 220.00
DONATIONS 0.00
GIFT SHOP 20.00
INTEREST 7.75
MISCELLANEOUS . 0.00 .
* KOPY SHOP (MEMBERSHIP LETTERS) $ 66.83
APRIL BARTHELMES (POSTAGE) 32.00
AT&T (LD-MIN) , 5.15
SOUTHERN BELL (PHONE) 48.90
CLAUDETTE PFEIFER (POSTAGE) 10.05
VINCE DUCKER (EDWARD'S TAPE) 120.75
CHELSEA HOUSE (GIFT SHOP) 28.77
$3354.38
JUNE-1995
MEMBERSHIP $ 90.00
DONATIONS 0.00
GIFT SHOP 0.00
INTEREST 7.18
MISCELLANEOQUS 0.00
AT&T (MIN-LD) $ 5.15
SOUTHERN BELL (PHONE) 48.00
ED WRIGHT (POSTAGE) 51.20
KOPY SHOP (COPIES LETTER) 12.60
HARLAND (CHECKS) 15.35
$3319.26
JULY-1995
MEMBERSHIP $ 335.00
DONATIONS 0.00
GIFT SHQP 0.00
INTEREST 7.72
MISCELLANEQUS 0.00
AT&T (LD-MIN) 5.15
SOUTHERN BELL (PHONE) 48.47 -
$3608.36
AUGUST-1995
MEMBERSHIP $ 180.00
DONATIONS 14.00
GIFT SHOP 32.95
INTEREST 8.02




MISCELLANEOQUS
POSTMASTER (POSTAGE)

0

OLD HOUSE JOURNAL (RENEWAL)
POSTMASTER (BULK MAIL FEE)

SOUTHERN BELL (PHONE)
AT&T (PHONE-LD MIN)

.00

32
27
85
48

5

RALPH'S STORE & TROPHY (MIR. PLAQUE) 7

OVIS (DIRECTORY)

SEPTEMBER-1995
MEMBERSHIP $
DONATIONS
GIFT SHOP
INTEREST
MISCELLANEOUS

65.
4,
26.
7
0

ADRIL BARTHELMES (POSTAGE)

HAZEL & ED WRIGHT (NANCY-GIFT)
SUE JONES (LACE & ANGELS-00CS94)
MARCIA HELLER (MISC. CRITTERS-00C94)49.
MARY LEE (EXTENSION CLUB-00C94)

AT&T (PHONE-LD MIN)
SOUTHERN BELL (PHONE)

OCTOBER-1995
MEMBERSHIP $
DONATIONS
GIFT SHOP
INTEREST
MISCELLANEQUS 5

40.
14.
8.
10.
025.

00
00
78

.79

00

00
00

35

15
Q0

7

$ 29.

25
25

23
5
55

OCONEE CO. (ARCHIVES/HISTORY GR;) 5000

PIATNIK (GS ORDER)
TIN BOX CO. (GS ORDER)

MARSHALL POTTERY (GS ORDER)

POSTMASTER (NEWSLETTER)
AT&T (PHONE-LD MIN)
BELLSOUTH (PHONE)

KOPY SHOP (NEWSLETTER)
ALEX. OCONEE OFF.SUPPLY

NOVEMBER-1995
MEMBERSHIP $
DONATIONS
GIFT SHOP
INTEREST
MISCELLANEOUS (TAPE)

PIATNIK OF AMERICA (GIFT SHOP)

KOPY SHOP (OOC FLYERS)

ADVANCED BUSINESS SYSTEMS (TONER)

(SUPPLIES)

185.
10.
281.
6.
19.

00
00
36
74
85

$

ALEX. OCONEE OFFICE SUPPLY (SUPP.)

AT&T (PHONE)

(2)

165
93

5
48

31

23
22

.00
.00
.00
.47
.15
.83
.00

36

.00
.00

00

.25
.15
.15

.00
ii1.

00

.00
.00
55.
.15
.47
96.
31.

82

47
88

.82
24.

15

.50
.24
.15

$3630.88

$3522.54

$3013.25



STEVENS LINEN (GIFT SHOP) 263
ACTION PRODUCTS (GIFT SHOP) 169
MS. JUDY HAVICE (GIFT SHOP) 19

DECEMBER-1995

MEMBERSHIP $ 135.00
DONATIONS 25.75
GIFT SHOP 829.59
INTEREST 8.21

MISCELLANEOUS (RAY MEM.)25.00

(ANGEL) 70.00
CLAUDETTE PFEIFER (POSTAGE) $ 35
MARCIA HELLEN (TEDDY BEARS) 102
HOLBROOKS SER. & REP. (SUMP PUMP) 80

JANUARY-1996

MEMBERSHIP $ 35.00
DONATIONS 55.00
GIFT SHOP 254.47
INTEREST 7.69
MISCELLANEOUS 0.60
AT&T (LD-SERVICE) 5.
BELLSOUTH (PHONE) 101
KOVELS (SUBSCRIPTION) : 27
S.C. DEP. REVENUE & TAX (1995 SALES)71
JOURNAL TRIBUNE (SUBSCRIPTION) 34
AT&T (LD-SERVICE) 5
BELLSOUTH (PHONE) 48
ALEX. OCONEE OFFICE SUPPLY (SUPP.) 37
PETE RUNGE (GIFT SHOP ITEMS) 96
HAZEL WRIGHT (OLD OCONEE CHRISTMAS) 18

ACTION PRODUCTS (GIFT SHOP) 52

FEBRUARY-1996

MARCH-1996

MEMBERSHIP $ 100.00
DONATIONS 6.00

GIFT SHOP 40.36

INTEREST 6.80
MISCELLANEOUS (TAPE) 0.00 :
TRI-STATE SUPPLY (PRES. PAPER) $ 153
BELLSOUTH (PHONE) 50.
AT&T (LD PHONE) 5.
MEMBERSHIP $ 450.00
DONATIONS 21.00

GIFT SHOP 10.50

INTEREST 7.10

MISCELLANEOQOUS 0.00
(3)

.50
.86
.90

.00
.90
.59

15

.29
.00
.15
.95
.15
.47
.47
.00
.99
.42

.58

13
15

$2956.18

$3831.28

$3685.40

$3629.70




SENECA CHAMBER OF COMMERCE (DUES) § 50
POSTMASTER (WL POSTAGE)
KOPY SHOP (WL PRINTING)

AT&T (LD PHONE)
BELLSOUTH (PHONE)

ALEXANDER'S OFFICE SUPPLY (SUPP.) 34.

KOPY SHOP (FLYERS)

APRIL-1996
MEMBERSHIP
DONATIONS
GIFT SHOP
INTEREST
MISCELLANEOQOUS

POSTMASTER (STAMPS)
* DON GEORGE (CUT GLASS)

BELLSOUTH (PHONE)
AT&T (LD-PHONE)
SCFM (MEMBERSHIP)

TOTAL 12 MONTHS

MEMBERSHIP
DONATIONS
GIFT SHOP

.00
43.32
76.04
5.15
50.05
97
12.60 _
$3886.17
$ 315.00
40.00
35.75
6.99
0.00
32.00
16.00
47.93
5.15
25.00
$4157.83
$ 9159.74 $ 8413.24
1994 1995 .1996
$ 1810.00 $ 2240.00 $ 2190.00
678.72 923.18 189.79
2875.22 3237.19 1540.11
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PoO. 601. /00?
Walhalla Sogﬁ‘]@lra%a 2538f

(803) 638-2727

S. J. Reidhead, Chairperson
Oconee County ATAX Committee
8720 West Oak Highway

Seneca, South Carolina 29678

Dear Miss Reidhead:

On behalf of the Greater Walhalla Chamber of Commerce and with the
cooperation ofmthe City of Walhalla, I would like to request $9, 012 00.

Walhalla, probably the best kept secret in Walhalla has struggled for
years trying to find our niche in order:to keep our downtown viable and in
turn promotlng the area.f“Through the.- 1nd1v1dual efforts of building owners,
merchants, civic clubs,:city commlttees, interested citizens-and the Chamber
of Commerce, the City has-made a. complete turn aroundf“' he past two years.
As you know, our annual Oktoberfest funds an offlcewandwpétﬁ"tlme director
for the Chamber of" Commerce"a_zsf of these funds comevfrom\membershlps, but
5% are taken from mon' “ade “at Oktoberfest. We,”as

zo' nteers, feel that
'“worthwhlle. Today

renewal of the downtown,
Center,

We respectful y'request that ATAX fund $9, 012 OO to llne our Main Street
for eight blocks:with Amerlcan/German Banners mixed with 20:.Discover Downtown
Banners. It’ hasmbeen proven- that banners attract v151torsmto our downtown
area and most-of ~all’ ‘make.- them want to . stop./ Creating a climate where
visitors what to- stop ‘is”what tourism is’ “all about. ~This program has been
very successful in Hendersonville, North¢Carollna and surroundlng areas.
These banners will hang year round, nho ust during the. Oktoberfest season,
creating a festlve environment whlle promoting our, Clty and County.

IfI canksupply any additional information, ple: e‘let me kncw. Chamber
members, merchants and citizens are excited about this program and feel we
are doing all we can to promote our area and now ask for your assistance.

Sincerely,
4

Vickie L. Satterfield
. President



OCONEE COUNTY ATAX APPLICATTIO N

Contact: For Information and Applications

10.

12.

13.

14.

15.

S. J. Reidhead, Chairman Oconee County ATAX Committee
8720 West Oak Highway

Seneca, SC 29678

803 - 972 - 9044

Ernest Hesterberg, Vice Chairman
15 Foremast Circle

Salem, SC 29676

803 -~ 944 - 1554

Name of applicant organization: @g
_ LtH e Aocperatic) Si e,
Cbmbggd__agmaﬁm##aé[ép/bf//ﬁ

Mailing address: D.0. 807 106Q

City: [y\alnalle  J.0. 4. Zipcode:_0,,6G|
Contact person: \\layie. &a;\\—ww—e»se.l/i
Title: Dnosident 7. Telephone: [p32-IUR

Fax: (32 - _4:K7 9. Project name: (if applicable)

Vad/?>
Event starting date : Q<o 11. Completion Date: Q~g/

Application category: a. government entity:

¥

b. city: c. county: d. district:

e. non profit organization: (el F. incorporation

date:j%ﬁgﬂ%g g. eleemo nary organization undery IRS
b 4D 457 §-) (ETT ?
code: h. date of determination letter:

i. IRS number#: E_@Q. T4 ET7-5708 93

Total itemized project budget: should include the cost of
the entire project and may be included on a separate sheet.

ATAX funds requested: #@‘{)/9’;.@

'a’\«m e Nt o D% o0 \D 2.0
*-UJU Chaocer H# 4o .cC

Ne Qkkxng§> \4;Q}%3h P U
Nardoscare Eswi+73n5a e Y0100 OM

DCWU\ e

Meckae L fecry




Oconee County ATAX Applivcation

contact: S. J. Reidhead Ernst Hesterberg
8720 West Oak Hwy 1S Formast Circle
Seneca, SC 29678 Salem, SC 29676
803-972-2146 802-844-1554

NAME OF APPLICANT ORGANIZATION: S.C. Heritage Corridor Project - Oconee County

MAILING ADDRESS: ]
CONTACT PERSON:Don Moss or Gary Barker TiTLE: Chair & Vice-Chair
OFFICE PHONE: 638-9322  fax: 638-5410 AFTER HOURS PHONE: 038-934<2

PROJECT NAME (if applicable)__N/A

DATE EVENT WILL START:_Sept. 27END:

If there is no firm start/start date, please incl/ude the time frame of the project.)
APPLICANT CATEGORY: CITY: GOVERNMENT ENTITY:____ COUNTY____
NON-PROFIT ORGANIZATION: XXX INCORPORATION DATE:___

IN ORDER TO FACILITATE THE APPROVAL OF THE GRANIT, THE

FOLLOWING MATERIAL IS REQUESTED: fcatio ay be rejec
if this material is not included with the application.
A: ITEMIZED PROJECT BUDGET: Include the cost of the entire project. ATAX

applications are dependent on county purchasing requirements for bids. You may
contact the county purchasing department for an explanation of policy. Most
projects require 3 written bids. Please include copies of these bids with your
application or the application may be returned as incomplete.

‘ B: APPROPRIATE DEMOGRAPHIC DATA: This data should reflect the impact of

visitors who are classified as tourists. (4 tourist is anyone who travels at least
50 miles from their home or requires over-night accommodations.) Guest lists,
mailing lists, demographic studies are acceptable records.

C: ATTENDANCE FIGURES: Show percentage of local, out of state, and overnight
guest who will attend the event, or who have attended previous events. Priority

will be given if the project attracts overnight guests.

D: MATERIALS FROM PREVIOUS FUNCTIONS: Balance sheets, flyers, promotional

materials, newspaper articles or any other pertinent materials pertaining to this
request.

E: CURRENT FINANCIAL HISTORY of your erganizaticn is miandatory. if your
organization is non-profit, the annual reports and audits provided to the IRS

would be appreciated.

ATAX FUNDS REQUESTED:_$851.78 |

ITEMIZED BUDGET FOR ATAX FUNDS REQUESTED: (attach on separate sheet)
HOW FUNDS WILL BE USED: ATAX funds will be used to promote and cater a luncheon

for special invited guests for the Oconee County roll-out meeting rfor the SC
Heritage Corridor project.
FUNDS: MATCHING GRANTS: SOURCE:

FUNDS WHICH WILL BE FURNISHED BY YOUR GROUP:_~0-
OTHER FUNDING SOURCES:

DESCRIPTION OF PROJECT:
° OJECT The SC Heritage Corridor Project will be introduced and

. discussed by the project coordinator at a catered luncheon to be held at the
Depot in Walhalla.




WHO WILL BENEFIT FROM THIS PROJECT:__County merchants and the county economy

as a whole will benefit from the increase in tonrism..
DESCRIBE HOW THIS PROJECT WILL INFLUENCE TOURISM IN OCONEE COUNTY:

Through the Heritage Corridor designation, Oconee County will be included-
in a statewide campaign to promote tourism.

GUIDELINES:

Be aware that tourists must come from at least 50 miles outside Oconee County.
Advertising done within a 100 mile radius is considered local and will not be
funded by ATAX money.

ATAX funds will not be used by local organizations as a substitute for
fundraising. If funds are available from other sources, and the applicant has not
explored these sources, the application will be considered unacceptable.

The funds granted by the ATAX committee must be specifically for the above
mentioned projects within the specified time. If funds are not used as proposed
or within 30 days of the close of the event, they must be returned to the ATAX
Committee. Failure to meet these requirements will resuit in the denial of your
applications in the future.

An accurate estimation of tourism potential is required. Please do not include
- people who come from Anderson, Clemson, Greenville, Toccoa, etc. as examples of
tourism.

Please complete the attached follow-up report to the ATAX Committee within 60
days of completion of the project or event.

! have read the above guidelines for the Oconee County
Accommodations Tax Fund application and do hereby agree to
comply with all rules and requirements. | understand failure to
comply may result in a loss of funding for these project(s).

SIGNATURE: DATE:
- .

PROJECT DIRE CTT OR

ADMINIS TRA TIVE OF

(/ (e S < C Nl
Aé\‘ C . L,\\‘\&y \,\\g_&\

SIGNATURE: ..




The South Carolina Heritage Corridor
‘ Region One

Whistle Stop Tour
with
Grace Young, SC Parks, Recreation & Tourism

Objectives
¢ Introduce heritage tourism concept and SC Heritage Corridor to as many Upstate residents as
possible;

¢ Generate enthusiasm and momentum for Heritage Corridor projects in Upstate

+ The public announcement of Region One's Discovery Site location will be made at this time.

Date: September 27, 1996
r hedul
¢ Oconee County 11:30am - 1:30pm (0 ”
* Pickens County 2:00pm - 4:00pm &}
‘ ¢ Anderson County 4:30pm- 6:30pm  Auderso~ Avks Cowet
Thi fi h nsi

. rving refreshments or a meal
‘ setting up educational displays/exhibits of special events, structures, localities, etc.

(Wendy will work with Rick Huffman to design a map of Region One Discovery Trail detailing
special points of interest in each County.)

¢ inviting public officials: municipal, county, and state

¢ sending invitations (Note: Wendy Marshall can provide you with list of folks who have been

involved in process from each county. Please provide Wendy with your complete mailing list
so that these people can be added to the Heritage Corridor newsletter list.)

e fund-raising to cover cost of event
hat will n rdin n ion vel;

+ logistics of getting invited dignitaries from one location to another - Wendy will work with
Tim Todd

. coordinating publicity for event with Tim Todd PRT (Lou Fontana) and news media
(Wendy Marshall will work with Tim Todd)

Note: Grace Young and her husband have been invited to attend the Clemson/Wake Forest
Game taking place on September 28th, so they will be spending the night in the Upstate. This
will give us some flexibility in the Whistle Stop Tour schedule.

' ..5'~S«v3 T on &1;)(" po A ‘jokw Ce}.;QN‘C,(\. - F’Q_r‘me"'-s HQ,”




Gourmet Catering inc.

921 Grove Road Greenville. S.C. 29605 (864)242-0404

Dan Moss Aug 13,1996
(864)638-9322
(864)638-5401
(864)638-5410 Fax#
Dear Mr. Moss,
Following is our revised Proposed menu for your Friday, September 27, 1996 SC PRT Event.
Sincerely,
Kay
o MENU
German Potato Salad
Red Cabbage
Smoked Bratwurst
Sour Kraut
Wisewurst OR Buckwurst
Assorted Rolls
Apple Streusel
Iced Tea
810.50 Per Person Plus .05% sales Tax and .1 7% Service

Meal : 50 @ $10.50........................ $525.00
Service: @.17% $ 89.25
Sub-Total $614.25
Tax $26.25
Total $639.50

China: 50 @ $2.87........cccoovvi. $141.50

Gtand Total .......... 3788.08

Invoice Due 5 days before Function™***
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~ - From @ ARAMARK CATERING PHONE No. : 864 656 7086 Aug. 22 1996 5:@4PM

® W ARAMARK

Fax DIsTRIBUTION LETTER

PreAsE DELIVER As Soow As PossipLe Clemson University

P.O. Drawer 429
Clemson, SC 296330429
FAX: 864-686-7006

Date: R/22/96

vo: | Gary Barker Duke Power 885-4605

From: Elaine Smith ARAMARK Phone #t GRAE_20F8
........... Mr. Barker. .. oo e
........... Enclosed.please. find the.German.menu that -yvou and-[......

discussed. | talked to our Chef about some of the {tecms

--------------------------------------------------------------

--------------------------------------------------------------

...........
..............................................................
---------------------------------------------------------------
-----------------------------------

-----------------------------------------

--------------------------------------------------------------
..............................................................
--------------------------------------------------------------
............................................................

--------------------------------------------------------------

Number of poges transmitted (Including this cover) 2




© From : ARAMARK CATERING PHONE No. : B64 656 7006 Aug.22 1996 5:84PM P@2

‘ AN SPECIAL EVENT

services
Name of c);ganization _Duke Power Day/Date Wed 9/25/96 Time 11:4% am
Purpoco of Tunclion | yneheor No of Guoate 50 Guaraniaad
Name of Re?resenlative Gary Ra rker ) . Title
Acloss | Prora 885-4600-_fax-885-4605
chatlon of Fv"rlam Walhalla Depot | Charge Approval I"! Yes_ 0O No
MENU German Meal

German Potato Salad
Swect & Sour Red Cabbage
Saurkraut
Grillcd Smoked Brautworst
, German dinner rolls(Rye) and butter stars
# Iccd Tea- Sweet and Unsweet
Coffee- Regular and Decaf
Apple or Pear Streudel
Price per person- $9.75 plus tax
China Service-Add $.50 plus tax per person
Delivery and mileage- $42.50

Service is Included for two hours, after two hours an
additional charge of $12.00 per attendant per hour will

be added.
Type of
Service PRICE PER PERSON
Social No NO. OF GUESTS
d Hour Tima. : Location: Guests: -
EXTRAS REMARKS 1AX

Billing: 50% down two weeks jroia o wy
prior to event,the remain-
der is due one week prior
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FROUM

(] jay’s printing co. o
p.o. box 1838
106%9a by pass 123

seneca, sc 29679

(803) 882-0360
QUOTATION QUOTED BY

TO BE QUOTE
CUSTOMER 2 DATE (a2,

PHONE #__ 385 -" 41,08

/00 < Ho- 4 5=
J00 _Blaak Gw-— £9%
=z 7a¢

QUOTATIONS ARE VALID FOR 30 DAYS. TYPESETTING ESTIMATES
ARE APPROXIMATE. ACTUAL CHARGES WILL BE BASED ON PRODUCTION
TIME. ANY CHANGES MADE BY THE CUSTOMER WILL BE CHARGED
TO THE CUSTOMER Chank You For Your Business.
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OCONEE COUNTY HERITAGE CORRIDOR

® COMMITTEE
ESTIMATED BUDGET FOR PROJECT ROLL-OUT
LUNCHEON
Printing costs for 100 invitations from Kopy Shop $31.70
Distribution postage $32.00

Catered luncheon from Gormet Catering

50 people @ $10.50 $525.00

Service @ 17% $89.25

| Sub. $614.25

o Tax $26.25
Total $639.50

China

50 people @ $2.87/each  $141.50

Tax $7.08
Total $148.50
Total cost $851.78



August 27, 1996

® .,

Bid Tabulation - Rebuild transmissionftc for 1978 Cline Backdump

T

Bicg.QG-()?

Walhalla, SC 29691

Williams Detroit |Pioneer Boggs Tractor Road Machinery
BIDDER Diesel Allison Machinery, Inc. L B Smith, Inc. Co., Inc. Services, Inc. Van Lott, Inc.
Base Bid (rebuild our transmission) | $ 8,990.00 1 $ 10,200.00 | $ 11,200.00 | $ 13,490.00 | no bid no bid
Optional Bid (rebuilt exchange unit) | no bid no bid $ 10,895.00 | no bid no bid no bid
Delivery 30 days 2 weeks 45 days

Attended Bid Opening: Marianne Dillard, Jenny Peay, Lee Davis - Oconee County, Mark Anderson - Pioneer Machinery

BIDTAB1.XLS



BID NO. 96- 07

(Use this number on envelopes and
all related correspondence.)

BID FORM
OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
201 W. MAIN STREET, WALHALLA, SC 29691

The v ""/ ¢ '
submits herewith our Bid in response to bid request number shown above, and in
compliance with the description(s) and/or specification(s) attached hereto rebuild

transmission and torque converter on 1976 Cline Backdump,

BASE BID (rebuild our Transmission) $ f 990 .00

OPTIONAL BID ( Rebuilt Exhange unit) $ R—

Bid shall include delivery to location stated on Bid Notice.
Show any exception, deviation; extra computation, or information on Bid Supplemental

Form attached hereto.

Delivery Datetwwwk/fl/

Bidding Organization:_/)/ 4/ psry Do . Wesel Mlicosl
Address: _4{3;5— 3. M /9l GBreey 3SC, 2 Gl
Signature of Bidders Representative:/ 7/

Title: . Daté_ F<24 -0

Telephone: &6 S FO7-0534™




BID NO. 96- 07

(Use this number on envelopes and
all related correspondence.)

BID FORM
OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
201 W, MAIN STREET, WALHALILA, SC 29691

The
submits herewith our Bid in response to bid request number shown above, and in
compliance with the description(s) and/or specification(s) attached hereto rebuild

transmigsion and torque converter on 1976 Cline Backdump.

BASE BID (rebuild our Transmission) $ 10,200.00
SEE ATTACHED STIPULATION
OPTIONAL BID ( Rebuilt Exhange unit) $

Bid shall include delivery to location stated on Bid Notice.
Show any exception, deviation, extra computation, or information on Bid Supplemental

Form attached hereto.

Delivery Date: Two (2) Weeks

Bidding Organization: __ Picneer Machinery Irc,

Address: PO Box 1098-405 Oak Road-Piedmont, SC 29673

Signature of Bidders Representative: 27/ WMMM—_
Title;_Parts Manager Date: _ 8/27/96

Telephone:; __ (864) 269-7995
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lndus"tr"ial Automaﬁc o

Transmission Service, Inc.

WARRANTY POLICY

Xndustriai " Automatic Transmission

Service, inc. warrants eac

remanufactured product or part to be £free f£rom defects in mate:xalWan

workmanship undexr normal use, application and service fox . a.
six (6) months from the date of puxchase or installatlon,. gggggggq@
- the product or part is instal}gd, maintained and operated: KA
all Allison recommendations. ' An external flltexr must Db
the 0il cCooler cleaned or replaced prior "to start up,

MT600 series transmissions when installed in school ‘Suses“ shall'vb

warranted for twelve (12) months from date of 1nstallatxon.

Any Industrial Automatic remanufactured p:oduct ox part w;¥b§%§g_'”
or replaced at lndustrial Automatic's option durxng the wa

E§@éod ©
\¥3

a1 TAutonatic

th&ve warranty consideration. If the txansmission is QAilsassemble

-'ﬁte being returned for ‘warrxanty consxde:atlon, the warranty is nuil
and void.

-

The origiwal warranty remains in effect on replaced products

any ‘other chaxges that mxght occux.

Warzranty on paxts only on transmissions going outside the United sta
“Parts must - be returned to Industz;al Automatxc tox 1nspection.

Thi
warranty does not cover shipping charges, removal and installation, 4

te¢

This waz:anty ‘is the only waxranty. applicable to Indust;ial Ap;gma&ﬁ
remanufactured products

assumes, nor authorizes anyone Lo assume £or

.0r parts and Industrial Automatic ne@%he

it any ob*ggatggg
- 1iability concerning. consequential damages resulting £ro,

warranty, collision, negligence, alteration, lagk of norma:“

1 palpten; Y-
service, accident or use fox which the product or part was not designe

or approved by Allison or Industrial Automatic.

This form must be completed and returned at the txme of installation ¢

the warranty is rendered null and void.

CUSTOMER NAME
DATE OF INSTALLATION,

EXTERNAL FILTER INSTALLED
VEHICLE NUMBER

VEHICLE MAKE_ : ; s
TRANSMISSION. S/N ' ‘

FLEX PLATE RUN OUT ‘

RETURN TO: P.O. BOX 170767

IRVING, TX 75017 07867

503"N. LOO? 12 ' . PO, BOY a0 0 —

AUTHORIZED STGNATURE .




12.

13,

14.

15.

“16.

170
18.
19.

Make sure nolqil leaks exiet and oil level is still OK

MODBL: __° SERIAL: ASSEMBLY:

Engine flywheel housing face to rear face of ipstalled flexplate
(AT S00RM: .1.600" to 1.740")

(MT 600RM: 2. 854" to 3.014")

Engine flywheel housing bore diameter’
(AT 500RM: 16.125" to 16.130")
(MT 600RM: 17.625" to 17.630™)

Engine flywheel housing bore ceccentricity
(A1l: .020" TIR)

Eunglone flywheel housing face squareness

-(A1l: .020" TIR)

Engine crankshaft end play (see engine manufacturer's specs.)

Output flange bolt or nut torque ’

(AT 500RM: 102-121 lb-ft)

(MT 643RM: 102-121 1b-ft)

(MT 653RM: 600-800 1b-ft) ‘

Make sure external transmission oll cooler system is £lushed
(under pressure)

Make gure approved oil filter with new element is installed
Make sure vehicle driveline is inspected or repaired
Make sure vebicle driveline joints are properly .phased

Make sure the selector lever nut on transmission was installed and
tightened to 15-20 1lb-ft.

Make sure the operator's range selector control and linkage are in
good condition

Make sure the selector linkage and transmission selector lever match
when each is put im the neutral position (before counecting)
When l

removing converter shippilug bracket check to be sure ,
converter is fully engaged

Modulatox comntrol: If using alr system check lines for leaks, or

1f using mechanical system check to see that cable is free and. not
in bind.

Make sure the dipstick "Hot Run" or "Hot Full" mark is correct
(AT SOORM: 1/2" below oil pan top)

(MT 600RM: with 4.3" pan is at oil pam top;
with 5.1" or 7" pan is 3/4" below oil pan top)

Make sure the hot oil level is correct
Road test resulta

Yes

Yes

Yes’

Yés

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Tes

No

No
NRo
No

No
No
No
No

o

No

S ()

Yes

. No.




BID NO. 96- 07
(Use this number on envelopes and
all related correspondence.)

BID FORM
OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
201 W. MAIN STREET, WALHALLA, SC 29691

The
submits herewith our Bid in response to bid request number shown above, and in
compliance with the description(s) and/or specification(s) attached hereto rebuild

transmission and torque converter on 1976 Cline Backdump.

V4
BASE BID (rebuild our Transmission) s_/ / A0Y

OPTIONAL BID ( Rebuilt Exhange unit) s /0.595 2=

Bid shall inchude delivery to location stated on Bid Notice.
Show any exception, deviation, extra computation, or information on Bid Supplemental

Form attached hereto.

-15-Qe— $-12°7b

Delivery Date: PWM §-16-9¢ -8 -3° ?C
Bidding Orgamzatmn '8 M

Address: a?g 03 @% q dA 52 7,9-04,
Signaturg of Bidders Representative: %f%’
TMEMW _Date:. @B "1;5 _qQ

Telephone: / 2 O3~ 7? / —0 7§/Q

fax /803 ~ 79/~ 0>/




BID NO. 96- 07

(Use this number on eavelopes and
all related correspondence.)

BID FORM
OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
201 W. MAIN STREET, WALHALLA, SC 29691

e D244y Trechr o Ine-

submits herewith our Bid in response to bid request number shown above, and in
compliance with the description(s) and/or specification(s) attached hereto rebuild
tr ission and torque conv 1976 Cline Back

BASE BID (rebuild our Transmission) s [ 34907

OPTIONAL BID ( Rebuilt Exhange unit) $

Bid shall include delivery to location stated on Bid Notice.
Show any exception, deviation, extra computation, or information on Bid Supplemental

Form attached hereto.

Delivery Date: % /fﬁb M Q

Bidding Organization: 300 4 % Trvelr Co Ine
Address: #r7 Mﬁjl/.;,[ e e/l k/

Signature of Bidders Representative: W )

Title: / GLe7 Date:_ & g/\ &-7 £
Telephone: ot 882 A202~




