
RFQ 16-107Q Loose Equipment for West Union Fire Department June 1, 2017 at 2:00pm

Attended Bid Opening:

 

Item 
#

Approx 
Qty Description

Requested 
Brand

Requested 
Model # Brand Model # Unit Price Extended 

Price Brand Model # Unit Price Extended 
Price Brand Model # Unit Price Extended 

Price Brand Model # Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Brand Model # Unit Price Extended 

Price Brand Model # Unit Price Extended 
Price Brand Model # Unit Price Extended 

Price

1 4 LED HAND BOX LIGHTS 
W/MOUNTS 12VDC

STREAMLIGH
T 44451 $145.00 $580.00 $141.00 $564.00 $154.00 $616.00 $145.00 $580.00 $143.58 $0.00 $140.00 $560.00 $147.27 $589.08

2 1  EU 2000 (JUST GEN. 
NO LIGHT ADDED) HONDA NO BID EU2000TIAI $1,090.00 $1,090.00 $1,133.00 $1,133.00  HONDA EU2000i $1,048.00 $1,048.00 EU2000T

1A1 $1,123.20 $1,123.20 EU2000 $1,075.00 $1,075.00 $1,152.00 $1,152.00

3 2 Zoll AED Pro w/pads NO BID  NO BID $1,495.00 $2,990.00  NO BID  NO BID $3,175.00 $6,350.00 $3,300.00 $6,600.00

4 4
RED LED RECHARGE 

TRAFFIC WANDS 
12VDC

ULTRA FIRE NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID BAYCO
HSP1632 $9.36 $37.44 $10.00 $40.00 NO BID

5 2
SET OF 6 LZ LIGHTS 
YELLOW HOUSING 

(RED & AMBER LEDS)

POWERFLA
RE PF-200 NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID NO BID

$305.00 $610.00 VIZCON
NOT 

EQUAL $174.00 $348.00

6 1 HOSE ROLLER 2” 
HITCH CASCADE HW-1 NO BID  CTS 

SUPPLY 
MC65 + 

TT2MB211 $298.00 $298.00  NO BID  NO BID GROVES TM-2 $442.26 $442.26 $1,185.00 $1,185.00 C & S
MC65 & 
THMB $399.00 $399.00

7 1 ONE MAN HOSE 
ROLLER FITS 5” HOSE NO BID  NO BID 

 
HARRINGT

ON 
HHR-1 $143.00 $143.00

 
HARRIN
GTON 

HHR-1 $166.50 $166.50 KOCHEK
KHR-1 $139.23 $139.23 $170.00 $170.00 $174.64 $174.64

8 1 PIKE POLE 6 FT NUPLA 36206 NO BID $53.00 $53.00  FLAME  
FIGHTER PP06 $49.00 $49.00  NO BID $41.91 $41.91 $42.00 $42.00

FLAME 
FIGHTER 36206 $41.81 $41.81

9 1  PIKE POLE 10 FT NUPLA 36210 NO BID $65.00 $65.00  FLAME  
FIGHTER PP10 $63.00 $63.00  NO BID $54.81 $54.81 $55.00 $55.00

FLAME 
FIGHTER 36210 $52.47 $52.47

10 6 FORESTRY RAKE 60” COUNCIL LW12-
60FSS NO BID $51.00 $306.00 $40.00 $240.00  NO BID $37.85 $227.10 $44.00 $264.00 $37.75 $226.50

11 6 FORESTRY COMBI 
TOOL COUNCIL CT42 FSS NO BID  NO BID $91.00 $546.00  NO BID $85.20 $511.20 $95.00 $570.00 $82.00 $492.00

12 2 HYDRANT WRENCH KOCHEK K07 $25.00 $50.00  SCOTTY 
FIRE 4579-YF $20.00 $40.00 $24.00 $48.00

 
REDHEA

D 
107 $41.25 $82.50

$21.90 $43.80 $23.00 $46.00 REDHEAD
K07

$43.26 $86.52
09KT25225M, 
K07, K01,
S54R545, 
K48-3, KS3

14 3
HYDRANT 

WRENCH/SPANNER 
BODY MOUNT

KOCHEK K45-3 $85.00 $255.00  NO BID $85.00 $255.00
 

REDHEA
D 

148-3 $123.00 $369.00
$78.14 $234.42 $78.00 $234.00 REDHEAD

K45-3
$112.92 $338.76

15 4 2.5” NH GATE VALVE KOCHEK/AK
RON/TFT $195.00 $780.00  C& S 

SUPPLY HGV25 $202.00 $808.00  KOCHEK 09KT25225
M $181.00 $724.00  C & S 

SUPPLY HGV25 $205.00 $820.00 AKRON 2285 $458.06 $1,832.24 KOCHEK 09KTT252 $165.00 $660.00 TFT $301.88 $1,207.52

16 1 CO2 EXTINGUISHER AMEREX  10 lb or 
equivalent $210.00 $210.00  NO BID  AMEREX AX330 $217.00 $217.00  NO BID KIDDE $162.63 $162.63 $155.00 $155.00 $236.99 $236.99

17 1 DRY CHEM EX AMEREX  10 lb or 
equivalent $110.00 $110.00  NO BID  AMREX AX456 $97.00 $97.00  NO BID KIDDE $51.66 $51.66 $55.00 $55.00 $122.46 $122.46

18 1 WATER CAN AMEREX  2 ½ lb $90.00 $90.00  NO BID  AMREX AX240 $118.00 $118.00  NO BID KIDDE $93.27 $93.27 $80.00 $80.00 $93.28 $93.28

19 2 STORZ SPANNER 
WRENCH SET KOCHEK KS34 $80.00 $160.00  NO BID $70.00 $140.00  DIXON SWB-S-4 $123.00 $246.00 $64.27 $128.54 $65.00 $130.00 TFT $86.25 $172.50

20 1  ELECTRIC PPV 
EVG230 NEO LEADER NO BID  TELELITE TLAVS-21B $2,400.00 $2,400.00  SUPER 

VAC 718EVS $2,266.00 $2,266.00
 

SUPERV
AC 

716-EVS $1,890.00 $1,890.00 NO BID
VARIABLE  $2,030.00 $2,030.00 RAMFAN $1,760.65 $1,760.65

21 1 4 GAS ANALYZER MSA ALTAIR 4X NO BID  MSA 10107602 $625.00 $625.00  NO BID  CO-EX-
02-H25 

TYCO-
GMI $660.00 $660.00 NO BID $785.00 $785.00 DRAGER 4542261 $779.61 $779.61

22 6 REFLECTIVE TRAFFIC 
CONES—30” MIN VIZCON 16036-H16-

10 $20.00 $120.00  NO BID  TRANSAFE 
36 $22.00 $132.00  NO BID CSP-03-

500-060 $25.00 $150.00 $22.00 $132.00
SAFETY 

FLAG $41.00 $246.00

23 4 ACCOUNTABILITY 
BOARD WITH TAGS

SALAMAND
ER IM FIRST NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID NO BID $110.00 $440.00 NO BID

24 1 RESCUE ROPE-STATIC 
KERNAMANTLE 200'+ NO BID  NO BID  RESCUE 

TECH 
5158200BL

S $199.00 $199.00

 
STERLIN

G HTP 
STATIC 
WHITE 

1/2" X 
200'  OR         

5/8" X 
200'

$171.00 $219.00 RESCUE 
TECH 5158200X

XX $196.56 $196.56
RESCUE 
TECH $185.00 $185.00 PMI

RR125R
W061E

$193.50 $193.50

25 5 DZUS KEY WITH “V” 
BLADE NO BID  NO BID  EMI 4006 $32.00 $160.00

 EMI -
QUICK-

CUT 
4006 $36.50 $182.50 NO BID GENESIS 

RESCUE $50.00 $250.00 TEAM
T899

$60.30 $301.50

26 3
MVA CRASH KIT 

(GLASS CUTTER, SIDE 
CUTTER, ETC)

NO BID  NO BID  MVA BA125 $795.00 $2,385.00  NO BID NO BID GENESIS 
RESCUE $610.00 $1,830.00

JUNKYARD 
DOG

JYD-CB
$717.00 $2,151.00

27 2 CHIMNEY SNUFFER KIT NO BID  NO BID  TFT A3830 $675.00 $1,350.00  NO BID NO BID TFT A3830 $560.00 $1,120.00 TFT A3820 $675.00 $1,350.00

28 3
1-1/2” PISTOL GRIP 

VARI NOZ. NH ADJUST 
GPM

AKRON 1763 $700.00 $2,100.00  ARMORED 
TEXTILE 

1218028-
60200 $525.00 $1,575.00 $695.00 $2,085.00  C & S 

VIPER 
SG3012-

M $452.00 $1,356.00 AKRON
$668.15 $2,004.45 $610.00 $1,830.00 TFT

ME1-
VPGI $503.13 $1,509.39

29 1 1” FORESTRY ALUM. 
BARREL NOZ. NPSH

FORESTRY 
SUPPLIERS PECO 85493 NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  C & S 

SUPPLY TT300 $220.00 $220.00 NO BID $215.00 $215.00 $229.00 $229.00

30 4 2 ½” DOUBLE FEMALE 
NH KOCHEK 35R2525 $29.00 $116.00  C & S 

SUPPLY 
AFFF25NH2

5NH $34.50 $138.00 $26.00 $104.00  ACTION $24.75 $99.00 $21.06 $84.24 $25.00 $100.00 REDHEAD $26.16 $104.64

31 4 2 ½” DOUBLE MALE NH KOCHEK 36R2525 $18.00 $72.00  C & S 
SUPPLY 

ADMM25NH
25NH $21.00 $84.00 $15.00 $60.00  ACTION $15.60 $62.40 $13.27 $53.08 $15.00 $60.00 REDHEAD $15.48 $61.92

32 4 2 ½” FEMALE TO 1 ½” 
MALE NH KOCHEK 37R2515 $21.00 $84.00  C & S 

SUPPLY 
AD25NH15

NH $21.00 $84.00 $17.00 $68.00  ACTION $14.20 $56.80 $15.15 $60.60 $16.00 $64.00 REDHEAD $17.28 $69.12

33 4 1 ½” DOUBLE FEMALE 
NH KOCHEK 37R1515 $18.00 $72.00  C & S 

SUPPLY 
ADFF15NH1

5NH $16.00 $64.00 $20.00 $80.00  ACTION $18.40 $73.60 $13.27 $53.08 $19.00 $76.00 REDHEAD $17.70 $70.80

34 4 1 ½” DOUBLE MALE NH KOCHEK 36R1515 $12.00 $48.00  C & S 
SUPPLY 

ADMM15NH
15NH $16.00 $64.00 $11.00 $44.00  ACTION $12.35 $49.40 $9.48 $37.92 $11.00 $44.00 REDHEAD $11.34 $45.36

NOT AWARDED

Kenco Fire Equipment
Springfield, MO

 NO BID 

Bidders
Address

FireLine, Inc.
Winder, GA

Anderson Fire & Safety
Anderson, SC

Dana Safety Supply
Columbia, SC

$472.00 $944.00HYDRANT TOOL BAG 2 R&B, 
KOCHEK $525.00 $1,050.00 $58.0013  MODEL 

440YL  R&B $29.00  R & B 
440YL 

INCLUDES 
ALL 

LISTED

Newton Fire & Safety Safe Industries Wally's Fire & Safety Equipment
Swepsonville, NC Easley, SC Mullins, SC

$186.96$331.39 $662.78 $495.00 $990.00 $93.48



RFQ 16-107Q Loose Equipment for West Union Fire Department June 1, 2017 at 2:00pm

Attended Bid Opening:

 Kenco Fire Equipment
Springfield, MO

Bidders
Address

FireLine, Inc.
Winder, GA

Anderson Fire & Safety
Anderson, SC

Dana Safety Supply
Columbia, SC

Newton Fire & Safety Safe Industries Wally's Fire & Safety Equipment
Swepsonville, NC Easley, SC Mullins, SC

35 4 1 ½” FEMALE NH TO 1” 
MALE NPSH KOCHEK 37R1NH1NP

SH $15.00 $60.00  C & S 
SUPPLY 

AD15NP1N
P $20.00 $80.00 $16.00 $64.00  ACTION $14.20 $56.80 $14.22 $56.88 $15.00 $60.00 REDHEAD $27.90 $111.60

36 4 1” MALE NH TO 1” 
MALE NPSH KOCHEK 36R1NH1NP

SH $15.00 $60.00  C& S 
SUPPLY AD1NH1NP $13.00 $52.00 $13.00 $52.00  ACTION $15.70 $62.80 $12.80 $51.20 $12.00 $48.00 REDHEAD $43.26 $173.04

37 4 1” MALE NH TO 
1”FEMALE NPSH KOCHEK 37R1NPSH1

NH $15.00 $60.00  C & S 
SUPPLY AD1NH1 $13.00 $52.00 $13.00 $52.00  ACTION $13.40 $53.60 $12.20 $48.80 $13.00 $52.00 REDHEAD $25.98 $103.92

38 4 1” MALE NPSH TO 1” 
FEMALE NH KOCHEK 37R1NH1NP

SH $15.00 $60.00  C & S 
SUPPLY AD1NH1 $13.00 $52.00 $13.00 $52.00  ACTION $13.75 $55.00 $12.80 $51.20 $13.00 $52.00 REDHEAD $25.98 $103.92

39 4 1” DOUBLE MALE NPSH KOCHEK 36R1NPSH1
NPSH $15.00 $60.00  C & S 

SUPPLY 
ADMM1NP1

NP $15.00 $60.00 $13.00 $52.00  ACTION $15.70 $62.80 $12.80 $51.20 $12.00 $48.00 REDHEAD $43.26 $173.04

40 4 1” DOUBLE FEMALE 
NPSH KOCHEK 37R1NPSH1

NPSH $15.00 $60.00  NO BID 35R1NPSH
1 NPSH $16.00 $64.00  ACTION $21.95 $87.80 $12.20 $48.80 $15.00 $60.00 REDHEAD $35.04 $140.16

41 1 2 ½” GATED WYE TO 1 
½” NH AKRON 2581 $315.00 $315.00  C & S 

SUPPLY WV2515 $211.00 $211.00  ELKHART B-100-A $247.00 $247.00  C & S 
SUPPLY WV2515 $211.00 $211.00 $306.54 $306.54 $290.00 $290.00 TFT AYNJ-NF $273.13 $273.13

42 1
CLAMPERED SIAMESE 

2 FEMALE 2.5” X 1 
MALE 2.5”

AKRON/KOC
HEK 1262 AKRON $800.00 $800.00  NO BID 

 
HARRINGT

ON 
H220-25-25 $218.00 $218.00

 
HARRIN
GTON 

H220-
25NHFS $227.00 $227.00 AKRON

1262 $775.71 $775.71 AKRON 1262 $695.00 $695.00
HARRINGTO

N
HN-220-
25NHM $227.00 $227.00

43 2
CLAMPERED SIAMESE 

2 FEMALE 2.5” X 1 
MALE STORZ 5”

ARRON/KOC
HEK

20K0525 
KOCHEK $245.00 $490.00  NO BID 

 
HARRINGT

ON 
H200-50-25 $454.00 $908.00

 
HARRIN
GTON 

H220-50-
25NH $319.00 $638.00 KOCHEK

20K0525 $217.18 $434.36 KOCHEK 20K0525 $265.00 $530.00 TFT
AS9NJ-

ST $339.25 $678.50

44 1 5” STORZ TO 2 ½” NH KOCHEK S36S525 $125.00 $125.00  NO BID $107.00 $107.00  ACTION AAS136 $115.00 $115.00 $97.03 $97.03
KOCHEC
K S36S525 $95.00 $95.00 TFT

AA2ST-
NJ $106.38 $106.38

45 1
5” STORZ PISTON 

INTAKE VLV WITH 6” 
PUMP PIPE

AKRON

REVOLUTIO
N (SWIVEL 

ELBOW) 
WITH 

CHAIN AND 
CAP

$1,495.00 $1,495.00  NO BID 
$55.00 
PLUS 

$1408.00
$1,463.00  NO BID AKRON

79812 $1,377.09 $1,377.09 $1,350.00 $1,350.00 TFT

AB1ST-
NX & 

A01ST

$1,288.00 $1,288.00

46 1 DECK GUN NO BID  NO BID 3423 $3,257.00 $3,257.00  NO BID AKRON 
OR TFT 3423 $3,184.74 $3,184.74 AKRON APOLLO $2,875.00 $2,875.00 TFT XFC-42 $2,527.13 $2,527.13

47 1 BURST HOSE JACKET BOSTON 
LEATHER $75.00 $75.00  NO BID  BL 9200-1 $61.00 $61.00

 BOSTON 
LEATHE

R 
9200 $69.00 $69.00 BOSTON

9200 $50.49 $50.49 AKRON 772 $590.00 $590.00
BOSTON 
LEATHER

9200
$53.34 $53.34

48 1 HOSE CLAMP 1.5”+ AKRON 588 $495.00 $495.00  NO BID $491.00 $491.00  NO BID 
$479.70 $479.70 $430.00 $430.00

HERBERT 
HOSE 

CLAMP
HC25

$249.00 $249.00

49 2 15'  3” SUPPLY HOSE
NORTH 

AMER. FIRE 
HOSE

PT3X15'_EN NO BID  ARMORED 
TEXTILE 

JAFLITEHD 
3 X 15 $113.00 $226.00 $112.00 $224.00

 
COUPLE
D 2 1/2" 

NST 

WHITE $93.00 $186.00 NO BID

$100.00 $200.00 FIREQUIP

DJ3OR-
15

$130.20 $260.40

50 1 25'  3” SUPPLY HOSE
NORTH 

AMER. FIRE 
HOSE

PT3X25_EN NO BID  ARMORED 
TEXTILE 

JAFLITEHD 
3 X 25 $143.00 $143.00 $145.00 $145.00

 
COUPLE
D 2 1/2" 

NST 

WHITE $151.00 $151.00 NO BID

$130.00 $130.00 FIREQUIP
DJ30YA

$158.70 $158.70

51 5
¾” NPSH REEL TEX 

FORESTRY HOSE-50' 
JOINT

REEL TEX NO BID  ARMORED 
TEXTILE 

ARMORED 
REEL 1" X 

50'
$199.00 $995.00  NO BID  NO BID NO BID

$225.00 $1,125.00 NO BID

52 4
¾” FIELD REPAIR KIT 

FOR REEL TEX MALE & 
FEMALE

REEL TEX NO BID  ARMORED 
TEXTILE 1" NPSH $89.00 $356.00  NO BID  NO BID NO BID

$55.00 $220.00 NO BID

53 8 1.75” X 50' NH ATTACK 
LINE (RED IN COLOR)

NORTH 
AMER. FIRE 

HOSE
NO BID  ARMORED 

TEXTILE 
JAFLITEHD 
1 3/4" X 50' $113.00 $904.00 $116.00 $928.00

 N. 
AMERIC
AN FIRE 
HOSE 

PT475X 
50REN $128.00 $1,024.00 FIREQUI

P
DJ800 $99.00 $792.00 $165.00 $1,320.00 FIREQUIP

DJ17RB

$105.80 $846.40

54 1

6” NST RED HEAD 140-
60001 BARREL TYPE 
STRAINER. A COMP 
BRACKET TO BE 
PROVIDED TO STORE 
STRAINER WHEN NOT 
IN USE

KOCHEK
BS60 W/ 

MOUNTING 
PLATE

$295.00 $295.00  NO BID 
$114.00 
PLUS  
$37.00

$151.00
 

REDHEA
D 140 

$208.00 $208.00 KOCHEK 

MM60 
MOUNT $92.89 $92.89 $165.00 $165.00

TFT A02HNX 
& RH M-60 $198.71 $198.71

55 1

HYDRANT 
ADAPTER—DOUBLE 
FEMALE 6” TO 4 ½” NST 
FOR HARD SUCTION 
HOSE TO DRY 
HYDRANT.

KOCHEK ADAPTOR 
WITH 
MOUNTING 
PLATE $245.00 $245.00  NO BID 

$168.00 
PLUS  
$37.00

$205.00  ACTION $211.00 $211.00 KOCHEK

MM601 
MOUNT $159.19 $159.19 $315.00 $315.00

RH 
3545NH60N
H & RH M-60 $262.20 $262.20

56 1 SP 555 SPREADER HURST NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID $5,984.55 $5,984.55 $6,890.00 $6,890.00 NO BID
57 1 S 700 CUTTER HSS HURST NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID $4,563.00 $4,563.00 $5,250.00 $5,250.00 NO BID
58 1 R 430 RAM HURST NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID $3,913.65 $3,913.65 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 NO BID

59 1 RAM ATTACHMENT 
SET HURST NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID $961.74 $961.74 $1,175.00 $1,175.00 NO BID

60 1 DRIVER SIDE AIRBAG 
SAFE HURST NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID $659.88 $659.88 $800.00 $800.00 NO BID

61 1 PASSENGER SIDE 
AIRBAG SAFE HURST NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID $624.78 $624.78 $765.00 $765.00 NO BID

62 1 QUICK KICK RAM 
SUPPORT NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID $505.44 $505.44 $620.00 $620.00 NO BID

63 1 QUICKSTRUT NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID $1,396.98 $1,396.98 $1,700.00 $1,700.00 NO BID

64 1 CHAIN SET FOR SP 555 
SPREADER HURST NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID $631.80 $631.80 $770.00 $770.00 NO BID

NOT AWARDED

NOT AWARDED

NOT AWARDED



RFQ 16-107Q Loose Equipment for West Union Fire Department June 1, 2017 at 2:00pm

Attended Bid Opening:

 Kenco Fire Equipment
Springfield, MO

Bidders
Address

FireLine, Inc.
Winder, GA

Anderson Fire & Safety
Anderson, SC

Dana Safety Supply
Columbia, SC

Newton Fire & Safety Safe Industries Wally's Fire & Safety Equipment
Swepsonville, NC Easley, SC Mullins, SC

65 1

MAXIFORCE G2 AIR 
LIFTING BAG KITS- 
Model 48 3 Lift Bag Set – 
Control kit would be a 
basic control kit 
(regulator) 22-890351G2-
150. Should also include 
an inline relief valve for 
every air bag – 22-
890490-150

PARATECH NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID NO BID

$4,425.00 $4,425.00 NO BID

66 1
 VEHICLE 
STABILIZATION KIT – 
Standard 22-796850

PARATECH NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID NO BID
$3,255.00 $3,255.00 NO BID

67 1
TWISTLOCK VEHICLE 
STABILIZER (TVS) – 22-
797000

PARATECH NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID NO BID
$3,125.00 $3,125.00 NO BID

68 1

AIR LIFTING BAG KIT To 
include the following:  145 
flat form bags:  
ART.HPF.18.7 (2ea); 
ART.HPF.29.7 (2 ea); 
ART.HPF35.7 (2 ea) 145 
High Pressure Control 
Kit:  ART5100R

NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID NO BID

$5,900.00 $5,900.00 NO BID

69 1
STAB-FAST STRUT 
SYSTEM-DELUXE KIT – 
ART.510.200.0

NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID NO BID
$3,800.00 $3,800.00 NO BID

TOTAL AMOUNT $0.00 $625.00 $928.00 $0.00 $19,693.71 $28,252.00 $718.50

Add 6% Sales Tax
$37.50 $55.68

$1,181.62 $1,695.12 $43.11
TOTAL AMOUNT 
AWARDED $662.50 $983.68 $20,875.23 $29,947.12 $761.61

TOTAL AWARD:  $53,230.24

NOT AWARDED

NOT AWARDED


